TY OF

TULSA

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department

TAC 1085C

175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor
Tulsa, OK 74103

High Visibility Shirts
Human Resources Department
Bid Opening Date: March 19, 2026

1. Delivery: If Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or to begin providing Services.

Project Buyer: Julie Miller

[amiller(

cityoftulsa.
Please contact if you have any questions.

y

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in Your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

Y-Pers, Inc. Hard Hat Safety and Glove, LLC Transco Supply Company Delta Contracting Group, Inc.
Estimate
ltem Descripti Annual Unit Cost Extended | Manufacturer | | Extended | Manufacturer | | Extended | Manufacturer | Extended | Manufacturer
ption e nit cos Cost &Parttt nit Cost Cost &Parttt nit Cost Cost &Parttt nit Cost Cost &Parttt
Quantity
1 High Visibility Shirts
PIP 313-
la. |Sizes Small -XL with pocket (short sleeve) 1476 $25.50 $37,638.00 PIP 104CT $23.05 $34,021.80 | HHS- 104CT $15.00 $22,140.00 CNTSELY $18.50 $27,306.00 | S1-5-XL SSWPK
. NOT ANSI
Sizes Small -XL without pocket (short sleeve) 1476 $26.00 $38,376.00 | PIP104CTNP N/A N/A N/A APPROVED $18.00 $26,568.00 | SI-SXLSS
PIP 313-1300-
Sizes Small -XL with pocket (long sleeve) 1476 $29.25 $43,173.00 PIP 204CT $26.65 $39,335.40 | HHS-204CT $19.80 $29,224.80 v $21.00 $30,996.00 [ S1-5-XL LSWPK
. NOT ANSI
Sizes Small -XL without pocket (long sleeve) 1476 $29.75 $43,911.00 | PIP104CTNP N/A N/A N/A APPROVED $21.50 $31,734.00 | SISXLLS
i PIP 313~ S1-2XL-6XL
1b.  |Sizes 2XL- 6XL with pocket (short sleeve) 1290 $25.50 $32,895.00 PIP 104CT $23.05 $29,734.50 | HHS-104CT $15.00 $19,350.00 CNTSELY $22.50 $29,025.00 SSWPK
. NOT ANSI
Sizes 2XL- 6XL without pocket (short sleeve) 1290 $26.00 $33,540.00 | PIP104CTNP N/A N/A N/A APPROVED $22.00 $28,380.00 | S1-2XL-6XLSS
Sizes 2XL- 6XL with pocket (long sleeve) 1290 $29.25 $37,732.50 PIP 204CT $26.65 $34,378.50 | HHS-204CT $19.80 2550200 |7 315;1300' $23.75 $30,631.05 Sléc\;ix"
- NOT ANSI
Sizes 2XL- 6XL without pocket (long sleeve) 1290 $29.75 $38,377.50 | PIP 204CTNP N/A N/A N/A APPROVED $23.00 $29,670.00 | SL-2XL-6XLLS
TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:(All costs must be included or your Bid will be $305,643.00 $137,470.20 $96,256.80 $234,310.05
disqualified)
Delivery 14 Days 28 AOR 21 Days 60
Annual Price N/A 5% 5% 5%
Notes: N/A Manufacturing & Part Number Reflect Apparel N/A N/A
Ferguson Enterprises LLC Signature Image Wear Inc. International Promotional Ideas Inc. Del Mar Safety Solutions
Estimate
- . Extended | Manufacturer . Extended | Manufacturer . Extended | Manufacturer . Extended | Manufacturer
Item Description Annual Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
" Cost &Parttt Cost &Parttt Cost &Parttt Cost &Parttt
Quantity
1 High Visibility Shirts
Radi LUX TSSP3B 3.8
la.  |Sizes Small -XL with pocket (short sleeve) 1476 $13.25 $19,557.00 adians $12.49 $18,435.24 | Portwest 5393 $21.00 $30,996.00 5202 $16.74 $24,708.24 >
RST113PG] oz Birdseye
. LUX TSSNP3B
Sizes Small -XL without pocket (short sleeve) 1476 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.25 $15,129.00 | Portwest 5478 $28.00 $41,328.00 9118 $16.74 $20708.20 | ot e
8 0z Birdsey
Radi LUX TLSP38 3.
Sizes Small -XL with pocket (long sleeve) 1476 $17.75 $26,199.00 adians $21.49 $31,719.24 | Portwest 5195 $24.00 $35,424.00 €5203 $18.03 2661208 | VX TISP3B38
RST213PGS} oz Birdseye
. LUX TLSNP3B
Sizes Small -XL without pocket (long sleeve) 1476 NO BID NOBID NOBID $13.96 $20,604.96 | Portwest S199 $28.00 $41,328.00 €S208 $18.03 $26,612.28 3.8 07 Birdseye
Radi LUX TSSP3B 3.
b, |Sizes 2XL- 6XL with pocket (short sleeve) 1290 $13.25 $17,092.50 adians $12.49 $16,112.10 | Portwest 5393 $25.00 $32,250.00 €5202 $18.75 $20,187.50 |TUXTSSP3B3E
RST113PSG] oz Birdseye
. LUX TSSNP3B
Sizes 2XL- 6XL without pocket (short sleeve) 1290 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.25 $13,222.50 | Portwest 5478 $28.00 $36,120.00 9118 $18.75 $20187.50 | 3o o dseye
.8 0z Birdsey
RADIAN LUX TLSP38 3.
Sizes 2XL- 6XL with pocket (long sleeve) 1290 $17.75 $22,897.50 s $21.49 $27,722.10 | Portwest 5195 $30.00 $38,700.00 €5203 $22.00 $28380.00 |'UXTISP3B38
RST213PGS] oz Birdseye
. LUX TLSNP3B
Sizes 2XL- 6XL without pocket (long sleeve) 1290 NO BID NOBID NOBID $13.96 $18,008.40 | Portwest S199 $35.00 $45,150.00 €S208 $22.00 $28,380.00 3.8 07 Birdseye
TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:(All costs must be included Bid will b
OTAL CO (All costs must be included or your Bid will be $85,746.00 $160,953.54 $301,296.00 $207,776.04
disqualified)
Delivery 7-10 DAYS ARO 10 Business Day From Artwork 20 Days 130 Days
Annual Price 8% N/A N/A N/A
Notes: NO Quote on 6XL not available N/A N/A N/A

THE CITY DOES NOT GUARANTEE ANY SPECIFIC QUANTITY OR NUMBER OF PURCHASES, IF ANY, THAT WILL BE MADE DURING THE AGREEMENT TERM.



mailto:jamiller@cityoftulsa.org

