[TULSA]

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 309H Buyer: Rachel Harders
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Secondary Source for Truck Bodies, Equipment & Accessories  rachelharders@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Citywide Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Opening Date: March 5,2026

1. Delivery:

If Your Bid is accepted, state the number of Days yYou need to deliver the Supplies and /or to begin providing Services:

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and /or Services as specified in Your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement, and pursuing
collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing
Industrial Truck Equipment, Inc. Grand Truck Equipment Co. LLC
ITEM DESCRIPTION Est. Annual QTY Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

1 Crane, Remote Controlled 2,000 Lb. 2 $12,095.00 $24,190.00 $12,506.00 $25,012.00
Item 1 Total Extended Cost $24,190.00 $25,012.00
C R te Controlled 2,000 Lb. (Pedestal

2 rane, remote Lontroted 2, (Pedesta 1 $12,188.00 $12,188.00 $5,872.00 $5,872.00
Mounted)
Option 1. Power Rotation and Manual Boom Elevation 1 Included $0.00 Not Available Not Available
Item 2 Total Extended Cost $12,188.00 $5,872.00

3 Crane, Remote Controlled 3,200 Lb. 3 $23,200.00 $69,600.00 $22,353.00 $67,059.00
Option 1. Power Out/In, Up/Down Outriggers 3 $2,350.00 $7,050.00 $2,424.00 $7,272.00
Option 2. Control System-Wireless 3 Included $0.00 $1,900.00 $5,700.00
Item 3 Total Extended Cost $76,650.00 $80,031.00

4 Crane, Remote Controlled 5,000 Lb. 2 $43,210.00 $86,420.00 $38,760.00 $77,520.00
Option 1. Power In/Out, Up/Down Outriggers 2 $7,055.00 $14,110.00 $2,424.00 $4,848.00
Item 4 Total Extended Cost $100,530.00 $82,368.00

5 LED Strobe Systems
1. Cars: Frontand Rear 2 $1,850.00 $3,700.00 $1,940.00 $3,880.00
2. Pickups 6,000 GVW to 8,500 GVW: Front and Rear 10 $1,850.00 $18,500.00 $1,380.00 $13,800.00
3. Van: Front and Rear 5 $1,850.00 $9,250.00 $1,380.00 $6,900.00
4. SUVs: Front and Rear 10 $1,850.00 $18,500.00 $1,940.00 $19,400.00
5. Trucks with Utility Service Bodies 8,500 GVW to
18,000 GVW: Front and Rear 10 $1,850.00 $18,500.00 $1,380.00 $13,800.00
6. Trucks with Utility Service Bodies 19,000 GVW to
33,000 GVW: Front and Rear 10 $1,850.00 $18,500.00 $1,380.00 $13,800.00
7. Trucks with Contractor’s Beds 10,000 GVW to
18,000 GVW: Front and Rear 10 $1,850.00 $18,500.00 $1,380.00 $13,800.00
8. Trucks with Contractor’s Beds 19,000 GVW to
33,000 GVW: Front and Rear 10 $1,850.00 $18,500.00 $1,380.00 $13,800.00
9. Trucks with Stake Body Flatbeds 10,000 GVW to
18,000 GVW: Front and Rear 10 $1,850.00 $18,500.00 $1,380.00 $13,800.00
10. Trucks with Stake Body Flatbeds 19,000 GVW to
33,000 GVW: Front and Rear 10 $1,850.00 $18,500.00 $1,380.00 $13,800.00
11. Heavy Cab and Chassis Trucks 33,000 GVW to
120,000 GVW: Front Only 10 $1,350.00 $13,500.00 $1,380.00 $13,800.00
12. Dump Bodies and Service Bodies: Rear Only
M 10 $725.00 $7,250.00 $805.00 $8,050.00

ount
13. Strobe System, Whelen Model VTX609C or 2 $925.00 $1,850.00 $929.00 $1,858.00
Acceptable Equivalent
14. Not Installed, Walk Out the Door Price for Whelen N 5 " >
Model VTX609C with Wiring $200.00 $400.00 $299.00 $598.00
15. Not Installed, Walk Out the Door Price for Whelen
) - 2 $250.00 $500.00 $369.00 $738.00

500 Series TIR6 Model 50C03ZCR with Wiring
Item 5 Total Extended Cost $184,450.00 $151,824.00

6 Toolboxes
1. Double Lid Cross Box, approximately 59-3/4-inches L x 69-1/2-
inches Overall L. x 16-1/2-inches D x 20-inches W for Full Size 5 NOBID NO BID $1,606.00 $8,030.00
Pickups, Fleetside Type, RKI Model ST63 or Acceptable Equivalent
2. Double Lid Wide Deep Cross Box, approximately 59-3/4-inches L

-1/2-inch L. x25-1/2-inches D -inches W For Full

x§9 / inc esngra x25 inches D x 30-inches W For Ful 5 NOBID NOBID $1,013.00 $9,565.00
Size Pickups, Fleetside Type, RKI Model ST63WD or Acceptable
Equivalent



mailto:rachelharders@cityoftulsa.org

3. Double Lid Cross Box, approximately 59-3/4-inches L x 69-1/2-
inches Overall L. x 16-1/2-inches D x 30-inches W For Full Size
Pickups, Fleetside Type, RKI Model STE3W or Acceptable

Eauivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$1,606.00

$8,030.00

4. Double Lid Cross Box. Approximately 37-1/2-inches L x 62-1/2-
inches Overall L x 17-inches D x 20-inches W For Mid-Size Trucks,
Fleetside Type, RKI Model ST56U or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$1,240.00

$6,200.00

5. Single Lid Box, approximately 69-7/8-inches L x 17-1/4 inches D x
20-inches W For Full Size Pickups, Fleetside Type, RKI Model C63 or
Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$1,337.00

$6,685.00

6. Single Lid Box, Low Profile, approximately 63- inches L x 13.5-
inches D x 19.25-inches W For Mid-Size Trucks, Fleetside Type,
UWS Model UWSTBS63ALPBLK or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$732.00

$3,660.00

7. Single Lid Box, approximately 62-1/2-inches L x 17-
1/4-inches D x 20-inches W For Mid-Size Pickups
Fleetside Type, RKI Model C56 or Acceptable
Equivalent.

NOBID

NO BID

$1,233.00

$6,165.00

8. Upper Side Box, approximately 78-inches L x
16-1/2-inches D x 12-1/2-inches W, Two Doors,
RKI'Model US78C or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$1,344.00

$6,720.00

9. Upper Side Box, approximately 90-inches L x
16-1/2-inches D x 12-1/2-inches W, Two doors,
RKI Model US90C or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$1,413.00

$7,065.00

10. Upper Side Box, approximately 96-inches L x
16-1/2-inches x 12-1/2-inches W, Two (2) doors,
RKI'Model US96C or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$1,442.00

$7,210.00

11. Underbody Box, approximately 24-inches L x
14-inches D x 16-inches W, One (1) Door, Frame
Mounted and Welded to Crossmembers,

RKI Model H241416 or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$553.00

$2,765.00

12. Underbody Box, approximately 24-inches L x
18-inches D x 18-inches W, One (1) Door, Frame
Mounted and Welded to Crossmembers,
RKIModel H241818 or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$553.00

$2,765.00

13. Underbody Box, approximately 36-inches L x
14-inches D x 16-inches W, One (1) door, Frame
Mounted and Welded To Crossmembers,

RKI Model H361416 or Acceptable Equivalent.

NOBID

NO BID

$673.00

$3,365.00

14. Underbody Box, approximately 36-inches L x
18-inches D x 18-inches W, One (1) Door, Frame
Mounted and Welded to Crossmembers,
RKIModel H361818 or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$721.00

$3,605.00

15. Underbody Box, approximately 48-inches L x
18-inches D x 18-inches W, One (1) Door, Frame
Mounted and Welded to Crossmembers,

RKI Model H481818 or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$764.00

$3,820.00

16. Underbody Box, approximately 60-inches L x
18-inches D x 18-inches W, One (1) Door, Frame
Mounted and Welded to Crossmembers,
RKIModel H601818 or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$937.00

$4,685.00

17. Toolbox, approximately 96-inches L x 18-inches D
x 18-inches W, Two (2) Doors, Mounted on Top of
Flatbed or Stacked, RKI Model H961818 or

Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$1,606.00

$8,030.00

18. Over Wheel Well Toolbox, approximately
51-inches L x 13-3/16-inches D x 8-inches -13-11/16-
inches W, RKI 508 or Acceptable Equivalent

NOBID

NO BID

$748.00

$3,740.00

19A. RKI Model WG-3 for mid-size pickups: Ranger,
Colorado, Tacoma

NOBID

NO BID

$805.00

$1,610.00

19B. RKI Model WG-10z for Full Size Wide Pickups:
F150, Silverado, 1500 Ram

NOBID

NO BID

$848.00

$1,696.00

19C. RKI Model WG-11 for Service Body Beds

NOBID

NO BID

$778.00

$1,556.00

19D. RKI Model RG-10 Bow Type Bracket for 1/2-
Ton Trucks

NOBID

NO BID

$574.00

$1,148.00

19E. RKI Model RG-11 Bow Type Bracket for Super
Duty Trucks

NOBID

NO BID

$574.00

$1,148.00

19F. RKI Model LR049US Bow Type Tubular Bracket for Service
Body Type Beds

NOBID

NO BID

$685.00

$1,370.00

Item 6 Total Extended Cost

NO BID

$110,633.00

Fire Extinguisher

$90.00

$900.00

$95.00

$950.00




Item 7 Total Extended Cost $900.00 $950.00
8 Safety Triangles 10 $45.00 | $450.00 $67.00 | $670.00
Item 8 Total Extended Cost $450.00 $670.00
9 Backup Alarm 10 $50.00 I $500.00 $94.00 | $940.00
Item 9 Total Extended Cost $500.00 $940.00
10 Electric Brake Controller 3 $450.00 I $1,350.00 $450.00 | $1,350.00
Item 10 Total Extended Cost $1,350.00 $1,350.00
11 Trailer Light Connector 6 or 7 Way
1. Cars 1 $150.00 $150.00 $173.00 $173.00
2. Pickups 1 $150.00 $150.00 $173.00 $173.00
3.Vans 1 $150.00 $150.00 $173.00 $173.00
4.SUVs 1 $150.00 $150.00 $173.00 $173.00
5. Utility Service Bodies 1 $150.00 $150.00 $173.00 $173.00
6. Contractor Bed 1 $150.00 $150.00 $173.00 $173.00
7. Flatbeds 1 $150.00 $150.00 $173.00 $173.00
8. Dump Bodies 1 $150.00 $150.00 $173.00 $173.00
9. 6-Way to 7-Way Adaptor 1 $80.00 $80.00 $107.00 $107.00
Item 11 Total Extended Cost $1,280.00 $1,491.00
12 Hitch, Receiver Type
1. Cars, Class |, 2,000 lb. 1 $650.00 $650.00 $793.00 $793.00
2.Vans, Class I, 3,500 lb. 2 $650.00 $1,300.00 $793.00 $1,586.00
3. SUVs, Small Pickups, Class I, 3,500 Lb. 1 $650.00 $650.00 $793.00 $793.00
4. Pickups 6,000 GVW, Class Ill, 8,000 lb. 5 $650.00 $3,250.00 $793.00 $3,965.00
5. Pickups 8,500 GVW, Class IV, 10,000 b. 5 $750.00 $3,750.00 $1,003.00 $5,015.00
6. Contractor Dump Beds, Class IV, 10,000 Lb. 4 $850.00 $3,400.00 $1,098.00 $4,392.00
7. Utility Service Bodies, Class IV, 10,000 lb. 10 $850.00 $8,500.00 $1,098.00 $10,980.00
8. Flatbeds, Class IV, 10,000 lb. 2 $850.00 $1,700.00 $1,098.00 $2,196.00
Item 12 Total Extended Cost $23,200.00 $29,720.00
13 Pintle Hitch Combination
1. Pintle Hitch and Tongue with 8,000 lb. Receiver
g ; 2 $1,140.00 $2,280.00 $1,153.00 $2,306.00
Installed on 6,000 GVW Pickups
2. Pintle Hitch and T ith 10,000 Lb. Recei
intle Hitch and Tongue with 10,000 b. Receiver 2 $1,140.00 $2,280.00 $1,153.00 $2,306.00
Installed on 8,500 GVW Pickups
3. mete Hchh and Tongue with 3,500 lb. Capacity 2 $1,140.00 $2.280.00 $1,153.00 $2.306.00
Receiver Hitch w/Tongue & Ball on SUVs
4. Pintle Hitch and Tongue with a 3,500 Lb. Receiver 2 $1,140.00 $2,280.00 $1,153.00 $2,306.00
|Installed on Vans
5. Pintle Hitch and Tongue with 10,000 Lb. Receiver
Installed on Flatbeds, Contractor Bodies, Utility 2 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,246.00 $2,492.00
Service Bodies
6..Pmtte Hitch with Mounted-On Tongue Only, No 2 $140.00 $280.00 $152.00 $304.00
Hitch
Item 13 Total Extended Cost $11,800.00 $12,020.00
14 Pintle Hitch Holland - Model PH210 Air Actuated 5 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,020.00 $10,100.00
Item 14 Total Extended Cost $10,000.00 $10,100.00
15 Liftgates
1. 1,000 b. for Mid-Size & Compact Pickups 3 N/A N/A $3,917.00 $11,751.00
2.1,000 lb. for 2 to %-Ton Pickups 3 $3,850.00 $11,550.00 $4,098.00 $12,294.00
3. 1,300 lb. Standard Type Liftgate for 1-Ton
Walkthrough Vans, Panel Vans, Delivery and Cube 3 $4,143.00 $12,429.00 $4,548.00 $13,644.00
Vans, Utility Service Bodies
4. 1,300 lb. Dump Thru Type Liftgate for 1-Ton
Walkthrough Vans, Panel Vans, Delivery and Cube 3 $4,819.00 $14,457.00 Not Available
Vans, Utility Service Bodies
5. 1,300 lb. Standard Type Liftgate for Stake Bodies 3 $4,608.00 $13,824.00 $4,548.00 $13,644.00
and Contractor Beds
.1 (b. Dt Thru Ty Liftgate for Stake Bodi
©- 1,300 1b. Dump Thru Type Liftgate for Stake Bodies 3 $5,320.00 $15,960.00 Not Available
and Contractor Beds
7.1,600 lb. Standard Type Liftgate for 1-Ton
Walkthrough Vans, Panel Vans, Delivery and Cube 3 $4,143.00 $12,429.00 $4,670.00 $14,010.00
Vans, Utility Service Bodies
8. 1,600 lb. Dump Thru Type Liftgate for 1-Ton
Walkthrough Vans, Panel Vans, Delivery and Cube 3 $5,320.00 $15,960.00 Not Available
Vans, Utility Service Bodies
L1 (b. St T Liftgate for Stake Bodi
©- 1,600 Ib. Standard Type Liftgate for Stake Bodies 3 $4,610.00 $13,830.00 $4,670.00 $14,010.00
and Contractor Dump Bed
10. 1,600 lb. Dt Thru Type Liftgate for Stak
; ump Thru Type Liftgate for Stake 3 $5,320.00 $15,960.00 $5,373.00 $16,119.00
Bodies and Contractor Dump Beds
Item 15 Total Extended Cost $126,399.00 $95,472.00




16 Light Bar Assembly, Non-Emergency, Low profile
1. Installed, Work Vehicle 10 $3,820.00 $38,200.00 $3,823.00 $38,230.00
2. Not Installed, Work Vehicles 1 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,716.00 $2,716.00
3. Installed Security Vehicles 1 $3,820.00 $3,820.00 $3,823.00 $3,823.00
4. Not Installed, Security Vehicles 1 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,716.00 $2,716.00
Item 16 Total Extended Cost $47,420.00 $47,485.00

17 Non-Emergency 8 Light Traffic Advisor 5 $1,600.00 $8,000.00 $1,950.00 $9,750.00
Item 17 Total Extended Cost $8,000.00 $9,750.00

18 Bed Liners
1. Drop-in Hard Plastic, Full Size 8-Foot Bed 1 NOBID NO BID $373.00 $373.00
2. Drop-in Hard Plastic, Full Size 6-Foot Bed 1 NOBID NO BID $373.00 $373.00
:elzrop-m Hard Plastic, Compact or Mid-Size Long 1 NOBID NOBID $373.00 $373.00
g.elzrop-m Hard Plastic, Compact or Mid-Size Short 1 NOBID NOBID $373.00 $373.00
5. Rubber Mat, Full Size 8-Foot Bed 1 NOBID NOBID $236.00 $236.00
6. Rubber Mat, Full Size 6-Foot Bed 1 NOBID NO BID $186.00 $186.00
7. Rubber Mat, Compact or Mid-Size Long Bed 1 NOBID NO BID $186.00 $186.00
8. Rubber Mat, Compact or Mid-Size Short Bed 1 NOBID NO BID $186.00 $186.00
3,5;)923;:; Bed Liner, Full Size 8-Foot Bed, Spray 10 NOBID NOBID $811.00 $8.110.00
lelg.dse;:::{tln Bed Liner, Full Size 6-Foot Bed, Spray 10 NO BID NOBID $748.00 $7,480.00
;dsgz‘;}:':]ﬁ?::‘::l{ Compactor Mid-Size Long 3 NOBID NOBID $748.00 $2,244.00
ai;::::{:n Bed Liner, Compact or Mid-Size Short Bed, Spray 3 NOBID NOBID $748.00 $2.244.00
:i:.Tz;;r:z;lgi::(::I‘;i;eljr;ii»ler:‘i: Utility Service Body Bed Floor, Bumper, 3 NOBID NOBID $1,393.00 $4,179.00
iig}iz;az;\;:eecél;igzr{;rllgse—rl'r:gh Utility Service Body Bed Floor, Bumper, 3 NOBID NOBID $1,731.00 $5,193.00
:i;):[izrsa;/f-Igi::gt;:izr:rize::h Utility Service Body Bed Floor, Bumper, 3 NOBID NOBID $2,081.00 $6,243.00
Item 18 Total Extended Cost NOBID $37,979.00

19 Winch, 8,000 Lb.
1. Pickups: 6,000 GVW to 9,500 lb. GVW 5 $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $3,233.00 $16,165.00
2. Heavy Duty Trucks: 9,600 GVW to 17,500 GVW 2 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $3,233.00 $6,466.00
3. Heavy Duty Trucks: 9,600 GYW 10 17,500 GVW. 1 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 $1,853.00 $1,853.00
Mounted in the Bed.
Item 19 Total Extended Cost $26,450.00 $24,484.00

20 Inverter
Option 1. Mounted in Service Bodies. 1 $2,250.00 $2,250.00 $3,490.00 $3,490.00
gs;'z; SZT::ZEZM in Gabs of Pickup Trucks and Cab 1 $2,350.00 $2,350.00 $3,490.00 $3,490.00
Item 20 Total Extended Cost $4,600.00 $6,980.00

21 Chains Trailer Safety
1.Class1, I, 1l 5 NOBID NO BID $488.00 $2,440.00
2. Class IV 5 NOBID NO BID $598.00 $2,990.00
3.ClassV 2 NOBID NO BID $875.00 $1,750.00
Sling Links
4.Class |, II, 1l 2 NOBID NO BID $228.00 $456.00
5.Class IV 2 NOBID NO BID $313.00 $626.00
6.ClassV 2 NOBID NOBID $500.00 $1,000.00
Item 21 Total Extended Cost NOBID $9,262.00

22 Conspicuity Tape 5 $50.00 $250.00 $96.00 $480.00
Item 22 Total Extended Cost $250.00 $480.00

23 Stake Bodies
23A. 8-Foot 6-Inches Body (56-Inches CA) 1 NOBID NO BID $8,850.00 $8,850.00
23B. 9-Foot 6-Inches Body (60-Inches CA) 1 NOBID NOBID $8,850.00 $8,850.00
23C. 10-Foot 6-Inches Body (84-Inches CA) 1 NOBID NO BID $9,095.00 $9,095.00
23D. 12-Foot 6-Inches Body (84-Inches CA) 1 NOBID NO BID $10,251.00 $10,251.00
23E. 14-Foot 6-Inches Body (108-Inches CA) 1 NOBID NOBID $11,123.00 $11,123.00
23F. 16-Foot 6-Inches Body (120-Inches CA) 1 NOBID NO BID $11,582.00 $11,582.00
23G. 18-Foot 6-Inches Body (120-Inches CA) 1 NOBID NOBID $13,867.00 $13,867.00




23H. 20-Foot 6-Inches Body (150-Inches CA) NOBID NO BID $16,365.00 $16,365.00
23I. 22-Foot 6-Inches Body (150-Inches CA) NOBID NO BID $17,551.00 $17,551.00
23). 24-Foot 6-Inches Body (165-Inches CA) NOBID NO BID $18,343.00 $18,343.00
Op.non 1. 14-|nch-H|gh‘SteelContractorSldes NOBID NOBID $140.00 $140.00
(Priced per Foot, One Side)
Option 2. 40-Inch-High Steel Stake Sid
ption 2. 49-Inch-High Steel Stake Sides NOBID NOBID $140.00 $140.00
(Priced per Foot, One Side)
Option 3. 2-Inch Pine Floor. NOBID NO BID $60.00 $60.00
Op.1|0n4.13/8—InchAp|tongFloor NO BID NOBID $120.00 $120.00
(Priced per Foot)
Option 5. 3/16-Inch Smooth Steel Floor NOBID NO BID $41.00 $41.00
Option 6. Bulkhead NOBID NO BID Included with body
Option 7. 4-Inch Tail Roller. NOBID NO BID $1,223.00 $1,223.00
Option 8. 4-Inch Solid Tail Pipe on Bed NOBID NO BID $567.00 $567.00
Option 9. 1,300 Lb. Liftgate NOBID NO BID $4,548.00 $4,548.00
Option 10. Ratchet Straps (Each) NOBID NO BID $140.00 $140.00
OptlolTll.FloorRelnforcementfor3,200 Lb. Crane NOBID NO BID $2,843.00 $2,843.00
Mounting
Oplloﬁ 12. Floor Reinforcement for 5,000 Lb. Crane NO BID NOBID $3,255.00 $3,255.00
Mounting
Item 23 Total Extended Cost NOBID $138,954.00
24 Contractor Body
24A. 8-Foot 6-Inch Body (56-Inch CA) NOBID NOBID $20,170.00 $20,170.00
24B. 9-Foot 6-Inch Body (60-Inch CA) NOBID NO BID $20,277.00 $20,277.00
24C. 10-Foot 6-Inch Body (84-Inch CA) NOBID NOBID $20,627.00 $20,627.00
24D. 12-Foot 6-Inch Body (84-Inch CA) NOBID NO BID $21,948.00 $21,948.00
24E. 14-Foot 6-Inch Body (108-Inch CA) NOBID NOBID $23,022.00 $23,022.00
24F. 16-Foot 6-Inch Body (120-Inch CA) NOBID NO BID $24,477.00 $24,477.00
Option 1. 3/16-Inch Steel Treadplate Floor. NOBID NOBID $35.00 $35.00
Option 2. 3/16-Inch Steel Smooth Floor. NOBID NO BID $33.00 $33.00
Opftmn 3. 14-Inch Steel Stake Sides w/ Tailgate NOBID NOBID $140.00 $140.00
(Priced per Foot)
Item 24 Total Extended Cost NOBID $130,729.00
25 Service Body, Utility Type
iz:; E’I?"”Ch Bed, "H"Mode (56-Inch CA) (Single $12,040.00 $24,080.00 $12,331.00 $24,662.00
el
2\,\,5: 9”6—Inch Bed, “V” Model (56-Inch CA) (Single $12,040.00 $24,080.00 $12,395.00 $24,790.00
cel
25C. 96-Inch Bed, Low Profile (56-Inch CA) (Single $12,040.00 $24,080.00 $12,145.00 $24,290.00
Wheel)
25D. 108-Inch Bed, (60-Inch CA) (Single Wheel) $13,457.00 $26,914.00 $13,787.00 $27,574.00
25E1.”108-|nch Bed, Low Profile (60-Inch CA) (Single $12,915.00 $25,830.00 $13,346.00 $26,692.00
25E2. 108-Inch Bed, Low Profile (60-Inch CA) (Dual $13,457.00 $26,914.00 $13,675.00 $27,350.00
Wheel)
25F. 132-Inch Bed, Model (84-Inch CA) (Dual Wheel) $16,300.00 $32,600.00 $16,573.00 $33,146.00
Option 1. Master Lock System $455.00 $910.00 $321.00 $642.00
Option 2. Bumper with Liftgate Cutouts $455.00 $910.00 $412.00 $824.00
Option 3. Top Pak Top Opening 4-Inches Deep $2,150.00 $4,300.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00
Compartment
Option 4. High Roof $0.00 $0.00
Option 4A. 108-Inch Bed Model, 54-Inch Roof $8,793.00 $8,793.00 $11,065.00 $11,065.00
Option 4B. 108-Inch Bed Model, 60-Inch Roof $8,793.00 $8,793.00 $11,272.00 $11,272.00
Option 4C. 108-Inch Bed Model, 72-Inch Roof $9,593.00 $9,593.00 $12,066.00 $12,066.00
Option 4D. 132-Inch Bed Model, 54-Inch Roof $10,850.00 $10,850.00 $12,436.00 $12,436.00
Option 4E. 132-Inch Bed Model, 60-Inch Roof $10,850.00 $10,850.00 $12,646.00 $12,646.00
Option 4F. 132-Inch Bed Model, 72-Inch Roof $11,850.00 $11,850.00 $13,812.00 $13,812.00
Option 4G. Roll-up Rear Door Included $0.00 $1,745.00 $1,745.00
tion 4H. P: f it D 3 Each Si ith
OF ion air of Conduit Doors, One Each Side wi $733.00 $733.00 $490.00 $490.00
Hish Raof
Option 41. Overhead Ladder Rack $885.00 $885.00 $986.00 $986.00
Option 4J. Side Mounted Ladder Rack $975.00 $975.00 $1,222.00 $1,222.00
ti . Right Rear B Reinft tforM t
Option 5. Right Rear Body Reinforcement for Moun $2,800.00 $5,600.00 $3,405.00 $6,810.00
3,200 Lb. Crane
Option 6. Additional Shelving for 108-Inch Body $1,960.00 $3,920.00 $2,390.00 $4,780.00
Option 7. Additional Shelving for 132-Inch Body $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $2,890.00 $5,780.00
t . Repl: hel ith Pull Out D
Option 8. Replace Shelving with Pull Out Drawers on $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $14,030.00 $28,060.00
108-Inch Body
t . Repl: hel ith Pull Out D
Option 9. Replace Shelving with Pull Out Drawers on $17,200.00 $34,400.00 $18,405.00 $36,810.00

132-Inch Body




Item 25 Total Extended Cost $326,260.00 $354,950.00

26 Crane Body 38,000 Ft/Lb. NOBID NO BID $63,443.00 $126,886.00
Option 1. Master Lock System NOBID NO BID 0,Included $0.00
Option 2. Additional Shelving Package for 38K Body NOBID NO BID $595.00 $1,190.00
Option 3. Tool Tray NOBID NO BID $1,021.00 $2,042.00
Option 4. Drop Well for Gas Bottles NOBID NO BID $475.00 $950.00
Option 5. Bottle Holders to Secure Gas Bottles NOBID NO BID $450.00 $900.00
Option 6. Compartment Lighting NOBID NO BID 0,Included $0.00
Option 7. Flood Lights NOBID NO BID 0,Included $0.00
Option 8. Crane Boom Support NOBID NO BID 0,Included $0.00
Option 9. 24-Inch Work Bumper NOBID NO BID $4,224.00 $8,448.00
Option 10. 12-Inch Bumper NOBID NO BID 0,Included $0.00
Option 11. 16,000 Lb. Pintle Hitch NOBID NO BID $275.00 $550.00 ea
Option 11A. Valve Key Brackets NOBID NO BID $1,776.00 $3,552.00
Option 12. Ladder Brackets NOBID NO BID $375.00 $750.00
Item 26 Total Extended Cost NOBID $144,718.00

27 Crane Body Std. 50,000 Ft/Lb. NOBID NO BID No Bid
Option 1. Master Lock System NOBID NO BID
Option 2. Additional Shelving Package for 50K Body NOBID NO BID
Option 3. Tool Tray NOBID NO BID
Option 4. Drop Well for Gas Bottles NOBID NO BID
Option 5. Bottle Holders to Secure Gas Bottle NOBID NO BID
Option 6. Compartment Lighting NO BID NOBID
Option 7. Flood Lights NOBID NOBID
Option 8. Additional Flood Lights NOBID NO BID
Option 9. Crane Boom Support NOBID NO BID
Option 10. 24-Inch Work Bumper NOBID NO BID
Option 11. Valve Key Brackets NOBID NO BID
Option 12. Ladder Brackets NOBID NO BID
Option 13. Pintle Hitch, 16,000 Lb. NOBID NO BID
Option 14. Air Pintle Hitch. 90,000 Lb. NOBID NO BID
Option 15. Delete Drawers Compartment H NOBID NO BID
Option 16. Slide Out Shelf in Compartment D and J NOBID NO BID
Option 17A. Spray-on Liner, Cargo Area NOBID NO BID
Sfp;s;::ifep;ly—on Liner, Bumper Rear Body, Tops NOBID NOBID
gzt;(:-lal:z gj{f::;?a Including Bed Floor, Tailgate, NOBID NOBID
Option 20. Lift Gate, 1,600 Lb. NOBID NO BID
Option 21. Labor to Mount Lift Gate to 50K Body NOBID NO BID
Option 22. Rotary Screw Compressor NO BID NOBID
Item 27 Total Extended Cost NO BID

28 5-Cubic Yard Steel Dump Body 84-Inch CA $53,000.00 $106,000.00 $47,921.00 $95,842.00
Option 1. Central Hydraulic System $17,000.00 $34,000.00 $20,675.00 $41,350.00
Option 2. Spread Apron Included $0.00 $1,213.00 $2,426.00
Option 3. 16,000 Lb. Pintle Ball Hitch $450.00 $900.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 4. Toolbox $600.00 $1,200.00 $640.00 $1,280.00
Option 5A. Rumbar Sideboards $0.00 $0.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 5B. Steel Sideboards $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,650.00 $3,300.00
Option 7. 20-Inch Steps in Place of Ladder -$200.00 -$400.00 -$1,184.00 -$2,368.00
Item 28 Total Extended Cost $144,100.00 $141,830.00

29 5-Cubic Yard Stainless Steel Dump Body 84-Inch CA $55,500.00 $55,500.00 $64,576.00 $64,576.00
Option 1. Central Hydraulic System $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $20,675.00 $20,675.00
Option 2. Spread Apron. Included $0.00 $1,213.00 $1,213.00




Option 3. 16,000 Lb. Pintle Ball Hitch $450.00 $450.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 4. Toolbox $600.00 $600.00 $640.00 $640.00
Option 5A. Rumbar Sideboards $0.00 $0.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 5B. Steel Sideboards $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $2,645.00 $2,645.00
I QuickiscomnetHyaraul ysamisUsed) No Uetare 000
Item 29 Total Extended Cost $74,750.00 $89,749.00

30 Item 30: 10-Cubic Yard Steel Dump Body 120-Inch CA $56,500.00 $113,000.00 $50,613.00 $101,226.00
Option 1. Central Hydraulic System $17,000.00 $34,000.00 $20,675.00 $41,350.00
Option 2. Spread Apron Included $0.00 $1,213.00 $2,426.00
Option 3. 16,000 Lb. Pintle Ball Hitch $450.00 $900.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 4. Toolbox $600.00 $1,200.00 $640.00 $1,280.00
Option 5A. Rumbar Sideboards $0.00 $0.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 5B. Steel Sideboards $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $2,046.00 $4,092.00
Option 7. ¥%-Inch Floor Included $0.00 $2,637.00 $5,274.00
Option 8. 20-Inch Steps in Place of Ladder -$200.00 -$400.00 -$1,184.00 -$2,368.00
Item 30 Total Extended Cost $151,100.00 $153,280.00

21 1:_$-Cu.bicYard Steel Dump Body 126-Inch CA (11-14 Yard Range $56,600.00 $113,200.00 $51,726.00 $103,452.00
with Sideboards)
Option 1. Central Hydraulic System $17,000.00 $34,000.00 $20,675.00 $41,350.00
Option 2. Spread Apron Included $0.00 $1,213.00 $2,426.00
Option 3. 16,000 Lb. Pintle Ball Hitch $450.00 $900.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 4. Toolbox $600.00 $1,200.00 $640.00 $1,280.00
Option 5A. Rumbar Sideboards $0.00 $0.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 5B. Steel Sideboards $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $2,046.00 $4,092.00
_Optio_n G.A_\\'rControls forRais_ing Bed(N_ot Required Included $0.00 No Upcharge $0.00
if Quick Disconnect Hydraulic System is Used)
Option 7. ¥%-Inch Floor Included $0.00 $2,637.00 $5,274.00
Option 8. 20-Inch Steps in Place of Ladder -$200.00 -$400.00 -$1,184.00 -$2,368.00
Item 31 Total Extended Cost $151,300.00 $155,506.00

32 :rs‘:‘Z':g‘;a‘;‘:‘:‘;:::?;;e;l Dump Body 126-Inch CA (11-14 $64,400.00 $64,400.00 $67,778.00 $67,778.00
Option 1. Central Hydraulic System $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $20,675.00 $20,675.00
Option 2. Spread Apron Included $0.00 $1,213.00 $1,213.00
Option 3. 16,000 Lb. Pintle Ball Hitch $450.00 $450.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 4. Toolbox $600.00 $600.00 $640.00 $640.00
Option 5A. Rumbar Sideboards $0.00 $0.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Option 5B. Steel Sideboards $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $3,227.00 $3,227.00
Option 6. Ar Controls for Raising Bed (Not Required Included $0.00 No Upcharge $0.00
if Quick Disconnect Hydraulic System is Used)
Option 7. %-Inch Floor Included $0.00 $2,637.00 $2,637.00
Option 8. 20-Inch Steps in Place of Ladder -$200.00 -$200.00 -$1,184.00 -$1,184.00
Item 32 Total Extended Cost $83,450.00 $94,986.00

33 g’g“l’f:“:{a:d';‘;:‘::;;i 2:1:!::"” Rip-Rap Bed 120-Inch $67,150.00 $134,300.00 $57,510.00 $115,020.00
Option 1. Central Hydraulic System $17,000.00 $34,000.00 $20,675.00 $41,350.00
Option 2. Pintle Ball Hitch, 16,000 Lb $450.00 $900.00 $1,185.00 $2,370.00
Option 3. Pintle Hitch, 90,000 Lb $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,402.00 $4,804.00
Option 4. Toolbox $600.00 $1,200.00 $640.00 $1,280.00
Option 5. Trailer Tow Package $650.00 $1,300.00 $1,220.00 $2,440.00
Option 7. Hydraulic Tailgate $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $5,591.00 $11,182.00
Option 8. Spread Apron Included Included $1,213.00 $2,426.00
Option 9. 20-Inch Steps in Place of Ladder -$200.00 -$400.00 -$1,184.00 -$2,368.00
gszggslg;\cr\am and Boomer Rack, Add &-Inchto $500.00 $1,000.00 $592.00 $1,184.00
Option 11. 2-Inch Oak Sideboard Extensions $250.00 $500.00 $530.00 $1,060.00




Item 33 Total Extended Cost $179,800.00 $180,748.00

2 12-Cub|¢_:Yar_d Dump Body, Rip-Rap Bed 126-Inch CA (12-16 Yard $67,500.00 $135,000.00 $58,405.00 $116,810.00
Range with )
Option 1. Central Hydraulic System $17,000.00 $34,000.00 $20,675.00 $41,350.00
Option 2. Pintle Ball Hitch, 16,000 Lb. $650.00 $1,300.00 $1,185.00 $2,370.00
Option 3. Pintle Hitch, 90,000 Lb. $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,402.00 $4,804.00
Option 4. Toolbox $600.00 $1,200.00 $640.00 $1,280.00
Option 5. Trailer Tow Package $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,220.00 $2,440.00
9pl|9n G.IA\rC0mrols forRallslng Bed (Not Required Included $0.00 No Upcharge $0.00
Jif Ouick Disconnect Hvdraulic System is Used)
Option 7. Hydraulic Tailgate $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $5,591.00 $11,182.00
Option 8. Spread Apron Included $0.00 $1,213.00 $2,426.00
Option 9. 20-Inch Steps in Place of Ladder -$200.00 -$400.00 -$1,184.00 -$2,368.00
0pt|0|110.Cham&BoomerRack,Add 8-Inchto $500.00 $1,000.00 $592.00 $1,184.00
Chassis CA
Option 11. 2-Inch Oak Sideboard Extensions $250.00 $500.00 $530.00 $1,060.00
Item 34 Total Extended Cost $181,100.00 $182,538.00
14-Cubic Yard D Body, Rip-Rap Bed 132-Inch CA Without

35 ~uble Yard Bump Bocy, Rip-Rap Se ne fthou $69,900.00 $139,800.00 $61,638.00 $123,276.00
Chain Rack (14-18 Yard Range with Sideboards)
Option 1. Central Hydraulic System $17,000.00 $34,000.00 $20,675.00 $41,350.00
Option 2. Pintle Ball Hitch, 16,000 Lb $650.00 $1,300.00 $1,185.00 $2,370.00
Option 3. Pintle Hitch, 90,000 Lb. $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,402.00 $4,804.00
Option 4. Toolbox $600.00 $1,200.00 $640.00 $1,280.00
Option 5. Trailer Tow Package $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,220.00 $2,440.00
_Optm_n 6. A_\\rControls for Rals_mg Bed (N_ot Required Included $0.00 No Upcharge $0.00

|if Quick Disconnect Hvdraulic Svstem is Used)
Option 7. Hydraulic Tailgate $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $5,591.00 $11,182.00
Option 8. Spread Apron Included $0.00 $1,213.00 $2,426.00
Option 9. 20-Inch Steps in Place of Ladder -$200.00 -$400.00 -$1,184.00 -$2,368.00
0pt|oj 10. Chain & Boomer Rack, Add 8-Inch to $500.00 $1,000.00 $592.00 $1,184.00
Chassis CA
Option 11. 2-Inch Oak Sideboard Extensions $250.00 $500.00 $530.00 $1,060.00
Item 35 Total Extended Cost $185,900.00 $189,004.00
TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:(AlL costs must be included or Your Bid will be disqualified) $2,138,367.00 $2,606,879.00
Delivery: 60-240 Days 60-240 Days
Annual Price Adjustment: 5.0% 5.5%
Notes: N/A N/A

THE CITY DOES NOT GUARANTEE ANY SPECIFIC QUANTITY OR NUMBER OR PURCHASES, IF ANY, THAT WILL BE MADE DURING THE AGREEMENT TERM.




