CITY OF

[TULSA

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor
Tulsa, OK 74103

1. Delivery:

TAC 1219C

Bid Opening Date: December 11, 2025

Water Castings, Manholes, Sealing, Materials, and Anodes
Water & Sewer Department

Iif Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or to begin providing Services:

Buyer: Julie Miller

Jamiller@cityoftulsa.org

Please contact if you have any questions

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in Your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City Terminating the Agreement and pursuing collection under any
performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing

Award of Bid may be made by sections, by individual items or whole Bid whichever is best for the City of Tulsa; you do not have to Bid all section for Your Bid to be considered responsive, but to be
considered for a section, all items in the section must be Bid

Section 1: Water Castings Ferguson Enterprises, LLC Core & Main LP DP Supply Co.
ltem A Descriptior_n_ Me.ter San Lids ) Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “WMetercan Number Number Number
1 Meter Can: Lid for 1-1/2” Service 250 $30.59 $7,647.50 SIGMA MB1611TT-35 $32.25 $8,062.50 SIGMA MB147TT-35 NB NB N/A
2 me;ezrsfj?)“sﬁ)‘d for2" Senice (Remote Read) 36°x36" 349 $30.59 $10,675.91 SIGMA MB1611TT-35 $32.25 $11,255.25 SIGMA MB147TT8-35 NB NB N/A
3 Meter Can w/Rim for 2" Service 15 $720.91 $10,813.65 SIGMA MB65SET $695.00 $10,425.00 SIGMA MB65ET NB NB N/A
4 Meter Can Center Ring for 2" Service 15 $125.13 $1,876.95 SIGMA MB1472TT-35 $410.00 $6,150.00 SIGMA MB65CRING NB NB N/A
5 Metor Can with Rim and Lid for 6/8, % & T 50 $151.40 $7,570.00 SIGMA MB61BT $745.00 $37,250.00 SIGMA MB65G NB NB N/A
ltem B Meter Can_l__ids.- HI:‘)‘PE ) Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “WMetercan”) Number Number Number
1 :eDra'ieMEter Can wilid 58, %", and 1" 1,200 $70.65 $84,780.00 DFW DDFW1800181MDQTU $68.50 $82,200.00 DFW 1800-18IMPQT NB NB N/A
Extended Cost, Section 1 Total: $123,364.01 $155,342.75 NB
Section 2:Manholes Ferguson Enterprises, LLC Core & Main LP DP Supply Co.
ltem Descriptior.l:. Me.ter ?an Lids - HI?’PE Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “WMetercan”) Number Number Number
1 Manhole Frame and Lid 24" x24" 2 $960.83 $1,921.66 EJ 00824709 $990.00 $1,980.00 EJ 824709 $982.06 $1,964.12 EJ 00824709
(Neenah R6660-KH)
2 Manhole Frame and Lid 30" x 48" 2 $3,318.69 $6,637.38 EJ 00823327A01 $3,431.00 $6,862.00 EJ 823303 $3,395.53 $6,791.06 EJ 00823303
(Neenah R6663-NH)
3 Rim, HD Reversable 4” for Valve Vaults 2 $145.77 $291.54 EJ 00213215 $152.00 $304.00 EJ 213215 $148.97 $297.94 EJ 002213215
4 Lid, HD for Valve Vault Reversable Rim 2 $132.02 $264.04 EJ 00213243 $136.20 $272.40 EJ 213243 $134.79 $269.58 EJ 00213243
5 2" Adjustment Rings (Neenah) 100 $133.53 $13,353.00 EJ 41901210 $137.80 $13,780.00 EJ 41901210 $136.33 $13,633.00 EJ 41901210
6 3" Adjustment Rings (Neenah) 100 $190.12 $19,012.00 EJ 41901310 $196.60 $19,660.00 EJ 41901310 $194.50 $19,450.00 EJ 41901310
7 23 1/4" Lid (Neenah) 200 $131.62 $26,324.00 EJ 00213241 $136.20 $27,240.00 EJ 213241 $134.79 $26,958.00 EJ 00213241
Extended Cost, Section 2 Total: $67,803.62 $70,098.40 $69,363.70
Section 3: Valve Boxes Ferguson Enterprises, LLC Core & Main LP DP Supply Co.
ltem Descriptior.l:. Va!ve ?oxes ) Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “WValveBox”) Number Number Number
Valve Box Riser 2-1/4”
1 (Tyler for Series 6850) 350 $20.63 $7,220.50 SIGMA VB2602 $22.25 $7,787.50 STAR UBR2-CL 35 NB NB N/A
2 E’T"’;fr 3235’“6”5‘0” 1% 150 $38.93 $5,839.50 SIGMA VB630224 $56.00 $8,400.00 STAR UBEX18SCL35 NB NB N/A
Valve Box Drop Lid
3 (Tyler #685055) 265 $20.53 $5,440.45 SIGMA VB2600W $23.00 $6,095.00 STAR UBLIOHD35 NB NB N/A
Valve Box Top Section
4 (Tyler Series 6850/562-5) 205 $30.77 $6,307.85 SIGMA 2621 $51.20 $10,496.00 STAR UBT16SHD35 NB NB N/A
Valve Box Bottom Section
5 (Tyler Ser. 6850/562-S) 180 $39.37 $7,086.60 SIGMA SVB2622 $51.20 $9,216.00 STAR UBB24SHD35 NB NB N/A
Extended Cost, Section 3 Total: $31,894.90 $41,994.50 NB
Section 4: Sealing Materials Ferguson Enterprises, LLC Core & Main LP DP Supply Co.
ltem Descriptior_I:_ Se.alin‘g‘; Materi.als” Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “Wpacking”) Number Number Number
1 %‘;th S:"’;ged Packing 1/4" (Square interlocking) 8 $10.14 $81.12 Teadit P2138.14 $65.00 $520.00 TREADIT 2138 NB NB NA
2 %‘;Zi S:";jged Packing 5/16" (Square interlocking) 8 $10.14 $81.12 Teadit P2138.516 $65.00 $520.00 TREADIT 2138 NB NB NA
3 %‘;Zi S:Ziged Packing 3/8" (Square interlocking) 5 $10.14 $50.70 Teadit P2138.38 $65.00 $325.00 TREADIT 2138 NB NB NA
4 _I(?erc;fjist S:a;ged Packing 7/16" (Square interlocking) 2 $10.14 $20.28 Teadit P2138.716 $65.00 $130.00 TREADIT 2138 NB NB NA
5 %‘;’Zi ?:ziged Packing 1/2" (Square interlocking) 4 $10.14 $40.56 Teadit P2138.12 $65.00 $260.00 TREADIT 2138 NB NB NA
6 Pipe Joint Compound 1# Cans with Applicators 100 $25.41 $2,541.00 Rectorseal REC23431 $36.50 $3,650.00 OATEY 31231 NB NB NA
7 Poly wrap - Thickness 8MILS, 18" W (200' Roll) 100 $83.65 $8,365.00 AAThread A70002220 $78.00 $7,800.00 ACCUCAST WRAP 18X200 NB NB NA
8 Polytape 2" (for Polywrap) 100 $4.58 $458.00 ProSelect PSPWT210 $19.80 $1,980.00 BRECCO 100-500-01005 NB NB NA
9 E';’sgcarbon Joint Sealant 3/8"X25' (Gore-Tex 4 $182.56 $730.24 Gallagher Fluid Seal FCJTPTFE $150.00 $600.00 GRAINGER 21TF48 NB NB NA
10 Teflon Tape 1/2"W X 320" L 750 $0.71 $532.50 ProSelect PSTTD520 $19.50 $14,625.00 BMI 031393 NB NB NA
11 '\Nﬂgfgr(js:ket 3/4"ID X1-3/16" OD X1/8" Thick 350 $0.087 $30.45 ProSelect PSMCGF $0.37 $129.50 FORD GT114 NB NB NA
12 '\Nﬂgfgr(js:ket 1D X1-1/27 OD X1/8" Thick 35 $0.10 $3.50 ProSelect PSMCGG $0.60 $21.00 FORD GT120 NB NB NA
TR Flex Seal Kit, 6 McWane TRFSKO06 or
13 Acceptable Equivalent 50 N/Q $72.00 $3,600.00 MCWANE TRFSK 6 NB NB NA
TR Flex Seal Kit, 8" McWane TRFSK08 or
14 Acceptable Equivalent 100 N/Q $94.00 $9,400.00 MCWANE TRFSK 8 NB NB NA
TR Flex Seal Kit, 10” McWane TRFSK10 or
15 Acceptable Equivalent 100 N/Q $122.00 $12,200.00 MCWANE TRFSK 10 NB NB NA
TR Flex Seal Kit, 12” McWane TRFSK12 or
16 Acceptable Equivalent 50 N/Q $160.00 $8,000.00 MCWANE TRFSK 12 NB NB NA
TR Flex Seal Kit, 16” McWane TRFSK16 or
17 Acceptable Equivalent 50 N/Q $230.00 $11,500.00 MCWANE TRFSK 16 NB NB NA
TR Flex Seal Kit, 18" McWane TRFSK18 or
18 Acceptable Equivalent 50 N/Q $285.00 $14,250.00 MCWANE TRFSK 18 NB NB NA
19 A Hlox Soel kit 21 ToWane TRFSK24 or 50 N/Q $550.00 $27,500.00 MCWANE TRFSK 24 NB NB NA
ceptable Equivalent
20 T Plox Seal kit 30’ HoWane TRFSKS0 or 50 N/Q $750.00 $37,500.00 MCWANE TRFSK 30 NB NB NA
ceptable Equivalent
21 piox Seel kit 90 ToWane TRFSKSG or 50 N/Q $1,003.60 $50,180.00 MCWANE TRFSK 36 NB NB NA
ceptable Equivalent
Extended Cost, Section 4 Total: $12,934.47 $204,690.50 NB
Section 5: Anodes Ferguson Enterprises, LLC Core & Main LP DP Supply Co.
Item Anodes Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part # Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part # Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #
1 Anode, Magnesium (#32D5) W/10’ #12 T.W. Leads 2 $292.10 $584.20 MESA A32HPMA $550.00 $1,100.00 MESA PRODUCTS 32DS NB NB NA
2 node. Magnesium (#1-1) Wrte'#6 AWG RIIPE 1 $375.00 $375.00 MESA H150SAM $465.00 $465.00 MESA PRODUCTS H1 NB NB NA
Extended Cost, Section 5 Total: $959.20 $1,565.00 NB
TOTAL COST: SECTIONS 1-5
. . . . g 236, 2 473,691.1 , 7
(All costs must be included or Your Bid will be disqualified) CPRE R $473,691.15 $69,363.70
. Sec1: 6-8 weeks / Sec2: 2-14 Weeks / Sec3: 1-3Weeks /Sec4:N/Q Secbh: 2- .
Delivery: Stock to 6 weeks Typically <5 Days
3 Weeks
Annual Price Adjustment: 10% 10% 5%
THE CITY DOES NOT GUARANTEE ANY SPECIFIC QUANTITY OR NUMBER OF PURCHASES, IF ANY, THAT WILL BE MADE DURING THE AGREEMENT TERM.
Section 1: Water Castings Utility Technology Services (UTS) Consolidated Pipe and Supply Utility Supply Co.
ltem A Descriptior.n. Me.ter Can Lids Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “WMetercan” Number Number Number
1 Meter Can: Lid for 1-1/2” Service 250 NO BID $262.08 $65,520.00 MB1472TT-35 Sigma $30.65 $7,662.50 Sigma MB1611TT-35
2 me;ezrsfj?)“sﬁ)‘d for2" Senice (Remote Read) 36°x36" 349 NO BID $262.08 $91,465.92 MB147TT-35 Sigma $30.65 $10,696.85 Sigma MB1611TT-35
3 Meter Can w/Rim for 2" Service 15 NO BID $728.00 $10,920.00 MBG65ET SIGMA $721.65 $10,824.75 Sigma MB65ET
4 Meter Can Center Ring for 2" Service 15 NO BID $126.36 $1,895.40 MB1472TT-35 SIGMA $125.30 $1,879.50 Sigma MC1472TT-35
5 eter Can with Rim and Lid for 516, % & 1 50 NO BID $206.26 $10,313.00 MB1472TT-35 SIGMA $187.00 $9,350.00 Sigma Raven 1324-18
ltem B Meter Can.l_.ids.- HDPE Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “WMetercan”) Number Number Number
HDPE Meter Can wi/Lid 5/8”, %", and 1" DFW1800D-18-MIDQT_DEEP_TULSA OldCastle 15202002 OldCastle
1 Senice 1,200 NO BID $69.64 $83,568.00 DEW $62.55 $75,060.00 14195021
Extended Cost, Section 1 Total: $0.00 $263,682.32 $115,473.60
Section 2:Manholes Utility Technology Services (UTS) Consolidated Pipe and Supply Utility Supply Co.
ltem Description_'::_ Me.ter E:an Lids - HI?’PE Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “WMetercan”) Number Number Number
1 Manhole Frame and Lid 24"x 24" 2 $1,147.826 $2,295.65 NEENAH 6660-KH $970.29 $1,940.58 EJ 00824709 No Quot
(Neenah R6660-KH) A e - : 9. 0 Luote
Manhole Frame and Lid 30" x48”
2 (Neenah R6663-NH) 2 $3,153.261 $6,306.52 NEENAH 6663-NH $3,354.80 $6,709.60 EJ 00823303 No Quote
3 Rim, HD Reversable 4” for Valve Vaults 2 $240.217 $480.43 NEENAH DF-1296-R $147.20 $294.40 EJ 00213215 No Quote
4 Lid, HD for Valve Vault Reversable Rim 2 $244.565 $489.13 NEENAH DF-1296 $133.18 $266.36 EJ 00213243 No Quote
5 2" Adjustment Rings (Neenah) 100 $146.739 $14,673.90 NEENAH DF-18508 $134.71 $13,471.00 EJ 41901210 No Quote
6 3" Adjustment Rings (Neenah) 100 $192.391 $19,239.10 NEENAH DF-1850-D $192.19 $19,219.00 EJ 41901310 No Quote
7 23 1/4" Lid (Neenah) 200 $145.652 $29,130.40 NEENAH DF-1265 $133.18 $26,636.00 EJ 00213241 No Quote
Extended Cost, Section 2 Total: $72,615.14 $68,536.94 $0.00
Section 3: Valve Boxes Utility Technology Services (UTS) Consolidated Pipe and Supply Utility Supply Co.
ltemn Descriptior_n_Va!ve Boxes Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “WValveBox”) Number Number Number
Valve Box Riser 2-1/4” .
1 (Tyler for Series 6850) 350 $48.163 $16,857.05 EAST JORDAN 85008025 $17.16 $6,006.00 TYLER UNION 145547 $20.45 $7.157.50 Sigma VB2602
2 E/Ta;l‘fr 2235’“6”90” 18’ 150 $89.728 $13,459.20 EAST JORDAN 85606024 $58.34 $8,751.00 TYLER UNION 145158 $39.00 $5,850.00 Sigma VB6302-24
3 Ef)ll\fr iggsDOrgg)Lid 265 $28.065 $7,437.23 EAST JORDAN 06800001 $12.58 $3,333.70 TYLER UNION 145325 $20.25 $5,366.25 Sigma D-VB2600W
Valve Box Top Section _
4 (Tyler Series 6850/562-S) 205 $87.315 $17,899.58 EAST JORDAN 8507016 $51.48 $10,553.40 TYLER UNION 144946 $30.65 $6,283.25 Sigma VB2621
Valve Box Bottom Section i
5 (Tyler Ser. 6850/562-S) 180 $93.217 $16,779.06 EAST JORDAN 85506024 $56.06 $10,090.80 TYLER UNION 145011 $39.00 $7,020.00 Sigma VB2622
Extended Cost, Section 3 Total: $72,432.11 $38,734.90 $31,677.00
Section 4: Sealing Materials Utility Technology Services (UTS) Consolidated Pipe and Supply Utility Supply Co.
ltem Descriptior_n_ Se.aling Materi.als Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
(See Specification “Wpacking”) Number Number Number
1 %‘;th S:"’;ged Packing 1/4" (Square interlocking) 8 NO BID $16.23 $129.84 TREADIT P2138.14 $22.00 $176.00 Champion Hi-Tech FLX2138-250
2 Cross Bra ied Packing 5/16" (Square Interlocking) 8 NO BID $16.23 $129.84 TREADIT P2138.516 $22.00 $176.00 Champion Hi-Tech FLX2138-312
3 o e Facking 38 (Squareinteriocking) 5 NO BID $16.23 $81.15 TREADIT P2138.38 $22.00 $110.00 Champion Hi-Tech FLX2138-375
4 %‘;Zi S:"’;ged Packing 7/16" (Square interlocking) 2 NO BID $16.23 $32.46 TREADIT P2138.716 $22.00 $44.00 Champion Hi-Tech FLX2138-437
5 %‘;Zi S:";jged Packing 1/2" (Square interlocking) 4 NO BID $16.23 $64.92 TREADIT P2138.12 $22.00 $88.00 Champion Hi-Tech FLX2138-500
6 Pipe Joint Compound 1# Cans with Applicators 100 NO BID $15.58 $1,558.00 OATEY 15520 $16.25 $1,625.00 Oatey 2046S
7 Poly wrap - Thickness 8MILS, 18" W (200' Roll) 100 NO BID $111.97 $11,197.00 TRUMBULL 388-18200 $130.00 $13,000.00 EGW 625-100-01370
8 Polytape 2" (for Polywrap) 100 NO BID $6.99 $699.00 TRUMBULL 364-9975 $7.00 $700.00 Weld-On TA-33-PW21
9 E'}f;carbo” Joint Sealant 3/8"X25' (Gore-Tex 4 NO BID $205.18 $820.72 GORE 0025E $45.00 $180.00 Champion Hi-Tech JS-375/25
10 Teflon Tape 1/2"W X 320" L 750 NO BID $10.12 $7,590.00 BLUE MONSTER 76003 $1.00 $750.00 Weld-On TA-S260
1" ANA::)eF:rce;s:ket 3/4"ID X 1-3/16” OD X 1/8” Thick 350 NO BID $1.40 $490.00 CORLEY $0.15 $52.50 EGW 200-225-01555
12 ANA::;aF:rSs:ket 1"ID X 1-1/2” OD X 1/8” Thick 35 NO BID $2.00 $70.00 CORLEY $0.15 $5.25 EGW 200-225-02035
13 15 Flex Seal Kit‘, 6” McWane TRFSKO06 or 50 NO BID $14.30 $715.00 MCWANE TRFSKO06 $36.65 $1 ,832.50 US Pipe 6000005311
ceptable Equivalent
14 XS Flex Seal Kit‘, 8" McWane TRFSKO08 or 100 NO BID $17.32 $1 ,732.00 MCWANE TRFSKO08 $39.00 $3,900_00 US Pipe 6000005312
ceptable Equivalent
15 ZCR Flex Seal Kit., 10” McWane TRFSK10 or 100 NO BID $27.60 $2,760.00 MCWANE TRFSK10 $68.55 $6,855_00 US Pipe 6000005491
ceptable Equivalent
16 LI? Flex Seal Kit., 12” McWane TRFSK12 or 50 NO BID $39.03 $1,951.50 MCWANE TRFSK12 $75.65 $3,782.50 US Pipe 6000005313
ceptable Equivalent
17 LI? Flex Seal Kit., 16” McWane TRFSK16 or 50 NO BID $39.59 $1,979.50 MCWANE TRFSK16 $117.00 $5,850.00 US Pipe 6000005323
ceptable Equivalent
18 E Flex Seal Kit, 18” MciWane TRFSK18 or 50 NO BID $81.00 $4,050.00 MCWANE TRFSK18 $172.55 $8,627.50 US Pipe 6000005482
ceptable Equivalent
19 LI? Flex Seal Kit., 24” McWane TRFSK24 or 50 NO BID $181.16 $9,058.00 MCWANE TRFSK24 $358.10 $17,905.00 US Pipe 6000005325
ceptable Equivalent
20 LI? Flex Seal Kit., 30” McWane TRFSK30 or 50 NO BID $243.24 $12,162.00 MCWANE TRFSK30 $443.20 $22,160.00 US Pipe 6000005113
ceptable Equivalent
21 ;S Flex Seal Kit, 36" MciWane TRFSK36 or 50 NO BID $325.17 $16,258.50 MCWANE TRFSK36 $568.20 $28,410.00 US Pipe 6000005214
ceptable Equivalent
Extended Cost, Section 4 Total: $0.00 $45,108.93 $116,229.25
Section 5: Anodes Utility Technology Services (UTS) Consolidated Pipe and Supply Utility Supply Co.
Item Anodes Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part # Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part # Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #
1 Anode, Magnesium (#32D5) W/10’ #12 T.W. Leads 2 NO BID N/A $268.00 $536.00 Mesa 32-HE—£—S’]IOI\]-1£-TW-SOL-
Anode, Magnesium (#H-1) W/15’ #6 AWG HMWPE Mesa 50-H1-P-15-6-HMWPE-
2 Leads 1 NO BID N/A $424.00 $424.00 STR-BK-SIN-N
Extended Cost, Section 5 Total: $0.00 N/A $960.00
TOTAL COST: SECTIONS 1-5
(All costs must be included or Your Bid will be disqualified) $145,047.25 CRAGEEA DAL BRI
Delivery: N/A 30-45 Days Stock-2 Weeks
Annual Price Adjustment: N/A 8% N/A

THE CITY DOES NOT GUARANTEE ANY SPECIFIC QUANTITY OR NUMBER OF PURCHASES, IF ANY, THAT WILL BE MADE DURING THE AGREEMENT TERM.



mailto:Jamiller@cityoftulsa.org

