CITY OF

TULSA

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department IFB 26-425 Project Buyer: Darin Johnson
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Stepmills and Dubbell Racks darinjohnson@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Fire Department Please contact if you have any questions.

Bid Opening Date: November 20, 2025

Delivery:
If Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or begin providing Services.

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in Your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and pursuing
collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity

Pricing:
Push Pedal Pull Fitness Superstore, Inc.
Est.
ITEM Description Annual Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
QTY

StairMaster 8Gx Series Gauntlet

1 StepMill (#9-5395-8Gx-LED-60) 11 $4,562.50 $50,187.50 $7,119.20 $78,311.20
*NO SUBSTITUTES**
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD

g [Station#ld 1 $633.00 $633.00 $381.65 $381.65
3602 S. Lewis Ave, Tulsa OK 74105 ’ | ' '
(No Removal at this location)
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD

3 [Mtation#32 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
5814 E. 91st St., Tulsa OK 74137 ’ ' ' '
(No Removal at this location)
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #3 61 N.

4 Utica Ave., Tulsa OK 74110 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
Removal of old equipment from TFD Station #3 61 N.

> Utica Ave., Tulsa OK 74110 1 $60.00 $60.00 i )
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #9

6 11211 S Yale Ave., Tulsa OK 7413 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
Removal of old equipment from TFD Station #9

! 11211 S Yale Ave., Tulsa OK 74137 1 $60.00 $60.00 i )
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #10 508

8 E. Pine St., Tulsa OK 74106 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
Removal of old equipment from TFD Station #10 508

9 E. Pine St., Tulsa OK 74106 1 $60.00 $60.00 i )
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #12

10 3911 5. 32nd W. Ave,, Tulsa OK 74107 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
Removal of old equipment from TFD Station #12

" 3911S. 32 W. Ave., Tulsa OK 74107 1 $60.00 $60.00 i )



mailto:darinjohnson@cityoftulsa.org

Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #18

12 4802 S. Peoria Ave., Tulsa OK 74105 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
Removal of old equipment from TFD Station #18

13 4802 S. Peoria Ave., Tulsa OK 74105 1 $60.00 $60.00 ) i
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #19 509

14 E. 56th St. N., Tulsa OK 74126 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
Removal of old equipment from TFD Station #19 509

15 E. 56th St. N., Tulsa OK 74126 1 $60.00 $60.00 i )
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #23

16 4348 E. 51st St., Tulsa OK 74135 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
Removal of old equipment from TFD Station #23

7 lazage. s1st St., Tulsa OK 74135 1 $60.00 $60.00 i )
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #25

18 7419 E. 42nd PL., Tulsa OK 74145 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
Removal of old equipment from TFD Station #25

19 7419 E. 42nd PI., Tulsa OK 74145 1 $60.00 $60.00 i )
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #29

20 7429 S. Lewis Ave., Tulsa OK 74136 1 $591.00 $591.00 $381.65 $381.65
Removal of old equipment from TFD Station #29

21 7429 S. Lewis Ave., Tulsa OK 74136 1 $60.00 $60.00 i )
TKO Strength & Performance 3-Tier Horizontal

22 Dumbbell Rack (Holds 5-75 LBS) - (#890HDR-BK) 5 $725.00 $3,625.00 NO BID NO BID
**NO SUBSTITUTES**
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #4 524

23 West 12th St., Tulsa OK 74119 1 $122.00 $122.00 NO BID NO BID
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #7 3005

24 East 15th St., Tulsa OK 74104 1 $122.00 $122.00 NO BID NO BID
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #12

25 3911S. 32nd W. Ave., Tulsa OK 74107 1 $122.00 $122.00 NOBID NOBID
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #18

26 4802 S. Peoria Ave., Tulsa OK 74105 1 $122.00 $122.00 NOBID NO BID
Freight/Delivery/Installation to TFD Station #23

27 4348 E. 51st St., Tulsa OK 74135 1 $122.00 $122.00 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED: (All costs must be included
OST NOT TO EXCEED: ( $61,505.50 $82,500.35
or your bid will be disqualified)
Delivery: 30 Days ARO
Annual Price Adjustment: 0% 5%
Notes: N/A N/A

The City does not guarantee any specific quantity or number of purchases, if any, that will be made during the agreement period.




