
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 1085A Buyer: Julie Miller
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor High Visibility Shirts jamiller@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Human Resources Department Please contact if you have any questions

Date: May 11, 2023

Delivery: 

If Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or to begin providing Services:

Pricing:

Item Description
Estimate 
Annual 

Quantity
Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturer & 

Part Number Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturer & 
Part Number Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturer & 

Part Number Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturer & 
Part Number

1 High Visibility Shirts

1a Medium with pocket (short sleeve) 130 $18.30 $2,379.00 Majestic 75-5305 $11.75 $1,527.50 Majestic Glove 75-
5305 $20.50 $2,665.00 Reflective Apparel 

Factory 102CT $22.48 $2,922.40 24-104

Medium without pocket (short sleeve) 130 $16.53 $2,148.90 Majestic 75-5303 $10.95 $1,423.50 Majestic Glove 75-
5303 $20.25 $2,632.50 Custom No Bid

Medium with pocket (long sleeve) 130 $21.70 $2,821.00 Majestic 75-5355 $13.65 $1,774.50 Majestic Glove 75-
5355 $23.95 $3,113.50 202ct $26.48 $3,442.40 24-204

Medium without pocket (long sleeve) 130 $31.13 $4,046.90 Max Apparel 
MAX416 $14.00 $1,820.00 Majestic Glove 75-

535 $23.65 $3,074.50 Custom No Bid

1b Large  with pocket (short sleeve) 539 $18.30 $9,863.70 Majestic 75-5305 $11.75 $6,333.25 Majestic Glove 75-
5305 $20.50 $11,049.50 102ct $22.48 $12,116.72 24-104

Large without pocket (short sleeve) 539 $16.53 $8,909.67 Majestic 75-5303 $10.95 $5,902.05 Majestic Glove 75-
5303 $20.25 $10,914.75 Custom No Bid

Large with pocket (long sleeve) 539 $21.70 $11,696.30 Majestic 75-5355 $13.65 $7,357.35 Majestic Glove 75-
5355 $23.95 $12,909.05 202ct $26.48 $14,272.72 24-204

Large without pocket (long sleeve) 539 $31.13 $16,779.07 Max Apparel 
MAX416 $14.00 $7,546.00 Majestic Glove 75-

535 $23.65 $12,747.35 Custom No Bid

1c  Extra Large (XL) with pocket (short sleeve) 765 $18.30 $13,999.50 Majestic 75-5305 $11.75 $8,988.75 Majestic Glove 75-
5305 $20.50 $15,682.50 102ct $22.48 $17,197.20 24-104

Extra Large (XL) without pocket (short sleeve) 765 $16.53 $12,645.45 Majestic 75-5303 $10.95 $8,376.75 Majestic Glove 75-
5303 $20.25 $15,491.25 Custom No Bid

Extra Large (XL) with pocket (long sleeve) 765 $21.70 $16,600.50 Majestic 75-5355 $13.65 $10,442.25 Majestic Glove 75-
5355 $23.95 $18,321.75 202ct $26.48 $20,257.20 24-204

Extra Large (XL) without pocket (long sleeve) 765 $31.13 $23,814.45 Max Apparel 
MAX416 $14.00 $10,710.00 Majestic Glove 75-

535 $23.65 $18,092.25 Custom No Bid

1d 2XL with pocket (short sleeve) 647 $18.30 $11,840.10 Majestic 75-5305 $11.75 $7,602.25 Majestic Glove 75-
5305 $20.50 $13,263.50 102ct $22.48 $14,544.56 24-104

2XL without pocket (short sleeve) 647 $16.53 $10,694.91 Majestic 75-5303 $10.95 $7,084.65 Majestic Glove 75-
5303 $20.25 $13,101.75 Custom No Bid

2XL with pocket (long sleeve) 647 $21.70 $14,039.90 Majestic 75-5355 $13.65 $8,831.55 Majestic Glove 75-
5355 $23.95 $15,495.65 202ct $26.48 $17,132.56 24-204

2XL without pocket (long sleeve) 647 $32.38 $20,949.86 Max Apparel 
MAX416 $14.00 $9,058.00 Majestic Glove 75-

535 $23.65 $15,301.55 Custom No Bid

1e 3XL with pocket (short sleeve) 423 $18.30 $7,740.90 Majestic 75-5305 $11.75 $4,970.25 Majestic Glove 75-
5305 $24.20 $10,236.60 102ct $22.48 $9,509.04 24-104

3XL without pocket (short sleeve) 423 $16.53 $6,992.19 Majestic 75-5303 $10.95 $4,631.85 Majestic Glove 75-
5303 $24.00 $10,152.00 Custom No Bid  

 You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and pursuing collection under any 
performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

Hard Hat Safety and Glove LLCBig Dome Promotions LLC A & A Sales Associates, LL Brewer & Associates LLC

mailto:jamiller@cityoftulsa.org


3XL with pocket (long sleeve) 423 $21.70 $9,179.10 Majestic 75-5355 $13.65 $5,773.95 Majestic Glove 75-
5355 $27.75 $11,738.25 202ct $26.48 $11,201.04 24-204

3XL with pocket (short sleeve) 423 $32.38 $13,696.74 Max Apparel 
MAX416 $14.00 $5,922.00 Majestic Glove 75-

535 $27.50 $11,632.50 Custom No Bid     

1f 4XL without pocket (short sleeve) 172 $18.30 $3,147.60 Majestic 75-5305 $11.75 $2,021.00 Majestic Glove 75-
5305 $24.20 $4,162.40 102ct $22.48 $3,866.56 24-104

4XL with pocket (long sleeve) 172 $16.53 $2,843.16 Majestic 75-5303 $10.95 $1,883.40 Majestic Glove 75-
5303 $24.00 $4,128.00 Custom No Bid  

4XL without pocket (long sleeve) 172 $21.70 $3,732.40 Majestic 75-5355 $13.65 $2,347.80 Majestic Glove 75-
5355 $27.75 $4,773.00 202ct $26.48 $4,554.56 24-204

4XL without pocket (long sleeve) 172 $32.38 $5,569.36 Max Apparel 
MAX416 $14.00 $2,408.00 Majestic Glove 75-

535 $27.50 $4,730.00 Custom No Bid

1g 5XL with pocket (short sleeve) 30 $18.30 $549.00 Majestic 75-5305 $11.75 $352.50 Majestic Glove 75-
5305 $24.20 $726.00 102ct $22.48 $674.40 24-104

5XL without pocket (short sleeve) 30 $16.53 $495.90 Majestic 75-5303 $10.95 $328.50 Majestic Glove 75-
5303 $24.00 $720.00 Custom No Bid

5XL with pocket (long sleeve) 30 $21.70 $651.00 Majestic 75-5355 $13.65 $409.50 Majestic Glove 75-
5355 $27.75 $832.50 202ct $26.48 $794.40 24-204

5XL without pocket (long sleeve) 30 $32.38 $971.40 Max Apparel 
MAX416 $14.00 $420.00 Majestic Glove 75-

535 $27.50 $825.00 Custom No Bid

1h 6XL with pocket (short sleeve) 18 $18.30 $329.40 Majestic 75-5305 $11.75 $211.50 Majestic Glove 75-
5305 $28.25 $508.50 102ct $22.48 $404.64 24-104

6XL without pocket (short sleeve) 18 $29.62 $533.16 Max Apparel 
MAX414 $10.95 $197.10 Majestic Glove 75-

5303 $28.00 $504.00 Custom No Bid

6XL with pocket (long sleeve) 18 $21.70 $390.60 Majestic 75-5355 $13.65 $245.70 Majestic Glove 75-
5355 $30.95 $557.10 202ct $26.48 $476.64 24-204

6XL without pocket (long sleeve) 18 $32.38 $582.84 Max Apparel 
MAX416 $14.00 $252.00 Majestic Glove 75-

535 $30.50 $549.00 Custom No Bid

Item Description
Estimate 
Annual 

Quantity
Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturer & 

Part Number Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturer & 
Part Number Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturer & 

Part Number Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturer & 
Part Number

1 High Visibility Shirts

1a Medium with pocket (short sleeve) 130 $14.00 $1,820.00 ST11-3 $12.79 $1,662.70 212211LE $8.02 $1,042.60 $12.00 $1,560.00 DM-SSP-1

Medium without pocket (short sleeve) 130 $25.00 $3,250.00 3751 $12.79 $1,662.70 212211LE $7.96 $1,034.80 $11.00 $1,430.00 DM-SSNP-2

Medium with pocket (long sleeve) 130 $17.00 $2,210.00 ST21-3 $17.43 $2,265.90 212222LE $8.67 $1,127.10 $15.00 $1,950.00 DM-LSP-1

Medium without pocket (long sleeve) 130 $32.50 $4,225.00 3742 $17.43 $2,265.90 2122222LE $8.31 $1,080.30 $13.80 $1,794.00 DM-LSNP-2

1b Large  with pocket (short sleeve) 539 $14.00 $7,546.00 ST11-3 $12.79 $6,893.81 212211LE $8.02 $4,322.78 $12.00 $6,468.00 DL-SSP-1

Large without pocket (short sleeve) 539 $25.00 $13,475.00 3751 $12.79 $6,893.81 212211LE $7.96 $4,290.44 $11.00 $5,929.00 DL-SSNP-2

Large with pocket (long sleeve) 539 $17.00 $9,163.00 ST21-3 $17.43 $9,394.77 212222LE $8.67 $4,673.13 $15.00 $8,085.00 DL-LSP-1

Large without pocket (long sleeve) 539 $32.50 $17,517.50 3742 $17.43 $9,394.77 2122222LE $8.31 $4,479.09 $13.80 $7,438.20 DL-LSNP-2

1c  Extra Large (XL) with pocket (short sleeve) 765 $14.00 $10,710.00 ST11-3 $12.79 $9,784.35 212211LE $8.02 $6,135.30 $12.00 $9,180.00 DXL-SSP-1

Extra Large (XL) without pocket (short sleeve) 765 $25.00 $19,125.00 3751 $12.79 $9,784.35 212211LE $7.96 $6,089.40 $11.00 $8,415.00 DXL-SSNP-2

International Promotional Ideas Inc. Northern Safety Co., Inc. Elite Textile Trading LLC Delta Contracting Group Inc

Fixed 5%

TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:                                                                 
(All cost must be included or Your Bid will be disqualified)

Delivery:

Annual Price Adjustment:

3 -4 weeks21 Days

$240,633.96 $137,153.40
102CT & 202CT are stock 21 days/pockless shirts are 

custom 90 days ARO 14 Days ARO

CPI-U

$250,631.20 $133,367.04



Extra Large (XL) with pocket (long sleeve) 765 $17.00 $13,005.00 ST21-3 $17.43 $13,333.95 212222LE $8.67 $6,632.55 $15.00 $11,475.00 DXL-LSP-1

Extra Large (XL) without pocket (long sleeve) 765 $32.50 $24,862.50 3742 $17.43 $13,333.95 2122222LE $8.31 $6,357.15 $13.80 $10,557.00 DXL-LSNP-2

1d 2XL with pocket (short sleeve) 647 $14.00 $9,058.00 ST21-3 $12.79 $8,275.13 212211LE $8.02 $5,188.94 $12.30 $7,958.10 D2XL-SSP-1

2XL without pocket (short sleeve) 647 $29.00 $18,763.00 3751 $12.79 $8,275.13 212211LE $7.96 $5,150.12 $11.00 $7,117.00 D2XL-SSNP-2

2XL with pocket (long sleeve) 647 $17.00 $10,999.00 ST21-3 $17.43 $11,277.21 212222LE $8.67 $5,609.49 $15.18 $9,821.46 D2XL-LSP-1

2XL without pocket (long sleeve) 647 $35.00 $22,645.00 3742 $17.43 $11,277.21 2122222LE $8.31 $5,376.57 $13.80 $8,928.60 D2XL-LSNP-2

1e 3XL with pocket (short sleeve) 423 $15.00 $6,345.00 ST11-3 $12.79 $5,410.17 212211LE $8.02 $3,392.46 $12.50 $5,287.50 D3XL-SSP-1

3XL without pocket (short sleeve) 423 $29.00 $12,267.00 3751 $12.79 $5,410.17 212211LE $7.96 $3,367.08 $12.45 $5,266.35 D3XL-SSNP-2

3XL with pocket (long sleeve) 423 $19.00 $8,037.00 ST21-3 $17.43 $7,372.89 212222LE $8.67 $3,667.41 $14.30 $6,048.90 D3XL-LSP-1

3XL with pocket (short sleeve) 423 $37.00 $15,651.00 3742 $17.43 $7,372.89 2122222LE $8.31 $3,515.13 $13.98 $5,913.54 D3XL-LSNP-2

1f 4XL without pocket (short sleeve) 172 $15.00 $2,580.00 ST11-3 $12.79 $2,199.88 212211LE $8.02 $1,379.44 $12.70 $2,184.40 D4XL-SSP-1

4XL with pocket (long sleeve) 172 $31.00 $5,332.00 3751 $12.79 $2,199.88 212211LE $7.96 $1,369.12 $12.30 $2,115.60 D4XL-SSNP-2

4XL without pocket (long sleeve) 172 $19.00 $3,268.00 ST21-3 $17.43 $2,997.96 212222LE $8.67 $1,491.24 $15.35 $2,640.20 D4XL-LSP-1

4XL without pocket (long sleeve) 172 $37.00 $6,364.00 3742 $17.43 $2,997.96 2122222LE $8.31 $1,429.32 $14.90 $2,562.80 D4XL-LSNP-2

1g 5XL with pocket (short sleeve) 30 $19.00 $570.00 ST11-3 $12.79 $383.70 212211LE $8.02 $240.60 $12.88 $386.40 D5XL-SSP-1

5XL without pocket (short sleeve) 30 $36.00 $1,080.00 3751 $12.79 $383.70 212211LE $7.96 $238.80 $12.65 $379.50 D5XL-SSNP-2

5XL with pocket (long sleeve) 30 $20.00 $600.00 ST11-3 $17.43 $522.90 212222LE $8.67 $260.10 $16.24 $487.20 D5XL-LSP-1

5XL without pocket (long sleeve) 30 $37.00 $1,110.00 3742 $17.43 $522.90 2122222LE $8.31 $249.30 $16.00 $480.00 D5XL-LSNP-2

1h 6XL with pocket (short sleeve) 18 $20.00 $360.00 ST11-3 $12.79 $230.22 212211LE $8.02 $144.36 $12.90 $232.20 D6XL-SSP-1

6XL without pocket (short sleeve) 18 $37.00 $666.00 3751 $12.79 $230.22 212211LE $7.96 $143.28 $12.65 $227.70 D6XL-SSNP-1

6XL with pocket (long sleeve) 18 $22.00 $396.00 ST21-3 $17.43 $313.74 212222LE $8.67 $156.06 $16.25 $292.50 D6XL-LSP-1

6XL without pocket (long sleeve) 18 $40.00 $720.00 3742 $17.43 $313.74 2122222LE $8.31 $149.58 $16.00 $288.00 D6XL-LSNP-2

$142,899.15

Annual Price Adjustment: Fixed 0%

Delivery: 30 Days 2 -3 Business Days Lead time: 45 - 60 Days ARO                                                              
Start Date: 05/05/2023 45 - 60 Days from date of Order

TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:                                                                 
(All cost must be included or Your Bid will be disqualified) $253,720.00 $164,638.56 $89,783.04
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