Tulsa

A New Kind of Energy.

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 136G Buyer: Angie Tune
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Fire Hydrant Parts atune@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Date: April 6, 2023
Delivery:

If Your Bid is Accepted, state thye number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or to begin providing Services:

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified inYOur Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and prusuing collection under any performance bond, as well as
seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

Pricing:

HYDRANT PARTS LIST FOR DARLING B62B. THE PARTS SPECIFIED HEREIN SHALL BE

SECTION |  DARLING OR ACCEPTABLE EQUIVALENT. THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE TO BE STOCKED BY Core & Main LP Utility Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises LLC | Utility Technology Services, Inc.
THE SELLER IN THE QUANTITIES LISTED BELOW. PARTS LISTED ARE FOR 5 " HYDRANT.

Iltem Description Estimated Quarterly Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 10 $198.00 $1,980.00 $205.16 $2,051.60
2 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 10 $835.00 $8,350.00 $848.12 $8,481.20
3 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION [ $305.00 $1,830.00 $265.05 $1,590.30
4 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION 6 $365.00 $2,190.00 $313.08 $1,878.48
5 18" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $405.00 $1,215.00 $354.24 $1,062.72
6 24" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $465.00 $1,395.00 $404.75 $1,214.25
TOTAL EXTENDED COST FOR SECTION | TO BE INCLUDED IN
SECTION | $16,960.00 $16,278.55 No Bid No Bid
All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified)

Identify Pricing List: AFC AMERICAN FLOW CONTROL 5-22

Discount % 10% 0%

HYDRANT PARTS LIST FOR DARLING B-84B. THE PARTS SPECIFIED HEREIN
SHALL BE DARLING OR ACCEPTABLE EQUIVALENT. THE FOLLOWING ITEMS

SECTION Il 2RETO BE STOCKED BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER IN THE QUANTITIES Core & Main LP Utility Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises LLC | Utility Technology Services, Inc.
LISTED BELOW. PARTS LISTED ARE FOR 5 %" HYDRANT:
Item Description Estimated Quarterly Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 10 $155.00 $1,550.00 $148.07 $1,480.70
2 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 10 $815.00 $8,150.00 $827.53 $8,275.30
3 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION 6 $270.00 $1,620.00 $233.87 $1,403.22
4 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION 6 $325.00 $1,950.00 $271.91 $1,631.46
5 18" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $370.00 $1,110.00 $310.58 $931.74
6 24" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $400.95 $1,202.85 $349.25 $1,047.75
Identify Pricing List: AFC AMERICAN FLOW CONTROL 5-22
Discount % 10% 0%
HYDRANT PARTS SPECIFIED HERIN SHALL BE MUELLER OR ACCEPTABLE
EQUIVALENT.
SECTION Il THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE TO BE STOCKED BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER Core & Main LP Utility Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises LLC | Utility Technology Services, Inc.
IN THE QUANTITIES LISTED BELOW. PARTS LISTED ARE FOR 5-1/4”
HYDRANT.
Item Description Estimated Quarterly Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 10 $185.00 $1,850.00 $172.45 $1,724.50 $196.73 $1,967.39
2 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 10 $650.00 $6,500.00 $620.71 $6,207.10 $657.35 $6,573.59
3 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION [ $395.00 $2,370.00 $378.75 $2,272.50 $366.30 $2,197.83
4 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION 6 $480.00 $2,880.00 $446.02 $2,676.12 $423.91 $2,543.48
5 18" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $530.00 $1,590.00 $505.25 $1,515.75 $494.56 $1,483.70
6 24" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $615.00 $1,845.00 $570.32 $1,710.96 $556.52 $1,669.57
Identify Pricing List: MUELLER MUELLER MUELLER

Discount % 5% +25%




THE PARTS SPECIFIED HEREIN SHALL BE WATEROUS WB-67 OR
ACCEPTABLE EQUAL.

SECTION IV THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE TO BE STOCKED BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER Core & Main LP Utility Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises LLC | Utility Technology Services, Inc.
IN THE QUANTITIES LISTED BELOW. PARTS LISTED ARE FOR 5-1/4"
HYDRANT.
Item Description Estimated Quarterly Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 5 $199.50 $997.50 $192.19 $960.95
2 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 5 $830.00 $4,150.00 $794.32 $3,971.60
3 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $330.00 $990.00 $281.89 $845.67
4 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $385.00 $1,155.00 $329.91 $989.73
5 18" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $440.00 $1,320.00 $377.94 $1,133.82
6 24" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $495.00 $1,485.00 $426.04 $1,278.12
TOTAL EXTENDED COST FOR SECTION IV: . "
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) $10,097.50 $9,179.89 No Bid No Bid
Identify Pricing List: AFC AMERICAN FLOW CONTROL

Discount %

7%

0%

HYDRANT PARTS FOR KENNEDY GUARDIAN OR ACCEPTABLE EQUAL.
THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE TO BE STOCKED BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER

SECTIONV |\ THE QUANTITIES LISTED BELOW. PARTS LISTED ARE FOR 5 -1/4 Core & Main LP Utility Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises LLC | Utility Technology Services, Inc.
HYDRANT.
Iltem Description Estimated Quarterly Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 5 $189.00 $945.00 $179.42 $897.10
2 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 5 $560.00 $2,800.00 $543.48 $2,717.40
3 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $345.00 $1,035.00 $324.30 $972.90
4 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $397.50 $1,192.50 $369.73 $1,109.19
5 18" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $445.00 $1,335.00 $423.55 $1,270.65
6 24" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $520.00 $1,560.00 $469.68 $1,409.04
TOTAL EXTENDED COST FOR SECTION V: ) !
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) $8,867.50 $8,376.28 No Bid No Bid
Identify Pricing List: KENNEDY KENNEDY

Discount %

5%

0%

THE PARTS SPECIFIED HEREIN SHALL BE CLOW OR ACCEPTABLE
EQUIVALENT.

SECTION VI THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE TO BE STOCKED BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER Core & Main LP Utility Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises LLC | Utility Technology Services, Inc.
IN THE QUANTITIES LISTED BELOW. PARTS LISTED ARE FOR  5-1/4"
HYDRANT.
Item Description Estimated Quarterly Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 5 $195.00 $975.00 $167.23 $836.15
2 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 5 $670.00 $3,350.00 $620.71 $3,103.55
3 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $385.00 $1,155.00 $362.04 $1,086.12
4 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $472.00 $1,416.00 $426.34 $1,279.02
5 18" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $535.00 $1,605.00 $482.96 $1,448.88
6 24" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $610.00 $1,830.00 $545.16 $1,635.48
TOTAL EXTENDED COST FOR SECTION VI: . "
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) $10.331.00 $9,389.20 No Bid No Bid
Identify Pricing List: CLOwW CLOW VALVE

Discount %

5%

+25%

THE PARTS SPECIFIED HEREIN SHALL BE CLOW OR ACCEPTABLE
EQUIVALENT.

SECTION VIl THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE TO BE STOCKED BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER Core & Main LP Utility Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises LLC | Utility Technology Services, Inc.
IN THE QUANTITIES LISTED BELOW. PARTS LISTED ARE FOR  5-1/4”
HYDRANT.
Iltem Description Estimated Quarterly Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 5 $195.00 $975.00 $486.30 $2,431.50
2 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 5 $670.00 $3,350.00 $620.71 $3,103.55
3 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $385.00 $1,155.00 $362.04 $1,086.12
4 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $472.00 $1,416.00 $426.34 $1,279.02
5 18" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $535.00 $1,605.00 $482.96 $1,448.88
6 24" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $610.00 $1,830.00 $547.31 $1,641.93
(AN osts must be inladed o your B i bs cisquaife) $10,351.00 $10.91.00 No Bid Nogid
Identify Pricing List: Clow Clow Valve

Discount %

5%

25%




THE PARTS SPECIFIED HEREIN SHALL BE M&H #129 OR ACCEPTABLE

EQUIVALENT.
SECTION VIII  THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE TO BE STOCKED BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER Core & Main LP Utility Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises LLC | Utility Technology Services, Inc.
IN THE QUANTITIES LISTED BELOW. PARTS LISTED ARE FOR 5-1/4"
HYDRANT.
Iltem Description Estimated Quarterly Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 5 $166.95 $834.75 $178.84 $894.20
2 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 5 $750.00 $3,750.00 $697.63 $3,488.15
3 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $360.00 $1,080.00 $324.30 $972.90
4 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $404.50 $1,213.50 $369.73 $1,109.19
5 18" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $465.00 $1,395.00 $423.55 $1,270.65
6 24" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $515.00 $1,545.00 $469.68 $1,409.04
TOTAL EXTENDED COST FOR SECTION VI: . .
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) $9.818.25 $9,144.13 No Bid No Bid
Identify Pricing List: M&H M & H VALVE

Discount %

5%

THE PARTS SPECIFIED HEREIN SHALL BE EAST JORDAN WATERMASTER

5CD250 OR ACCEPTABLE EQUIVALENT.

SECTION IX  THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE TO BE STOCKED BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER Core & Main LP Utility Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises LLC | Utility Technology Services, Inc.
IN THE QUANTITIES LISTED BELOW. PARTS LISTED ARE FOR 5-1/4"
HYDRANT.
Item Description Estimated Quarterly Usage Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost
1 TRAFFIC REPAIR KIT 5 $230.00 $1,150.00 $130.90 $654.50 $135.24 $676.20
2 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 5 $365.00 $1,825.00 $360.84 $1,804.20 $372.87 $1,864.34
3 6" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $376.00 $1,128.00 $356.45 $1,069.35 $490.33 $1,471.00
4 12" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $470.00 $1,410.00 $421.45 $1,264.35 $645.69 $1,937.07
5 18" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $530.00 $1,590.00 $478.07 $1,434.21 $612.76 $1,838.27
6 24" HYDRANT EXTENSION 3 $605.00 $1,815.00 $540.27 $1,620.81 $679.49 $2,038.47
TOTAL EXTENDED COST FOR SECTION VII .
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) $8,918.00 $7.847 42 No Bid $9,825.35
Identify Pricing List: EJ EAST JORDAN EJ Hydrant Kits/Parts
Discount % 5% +25% 16%
TOTAL EXTENDED COST FOR SECTION | THRU VII $107,941.10 $102,083.57 $16,435.56 $9,825.36

(All cost must be included or your Bid will be disquialified)

Delivery:

Stock to 14 Days

Stock - 8 Weeks

Annual Price Adjustment:

Fixed 7%

Fixed 5%

Fixed 5%




