) Tulsa

A New Kind of Energy.

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 1214B Buyer: Angie Tune
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Couplings, Clamps & Restrainers atune@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Date: March 9, 2023
1. Delivery:
If your Bid is accepted state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your Agreement and pursuing collection
under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing
Couplings, Clamps & Restrainers Utility Supply Company Core & Main LP Powerseal Pipeline Products Inc
SLEEVES & COUPLINGS Estimate Yearly . Manufacturers Name and . Manufacturers Name and . Manufacturers Name and
It P, " i

em (See Specification "Wfitting CI") Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Part Number Unit Cost Extended Cost Part Number Unit Cost Extended Cost Part Number
Transition Coupling 12° SMITH-BLAIR 441-147201350-

1 (Semith 8 Blair Ormal 441.14201350.900) 2 $196.25 $392.50 500 $198.00 $396.00 SMITH-BLAIR 441-14201350-900 $255.16 $510.32 POWERSEAL 3501
Transition Coupling

2 (Smith-Blair Omni 441-00001350-9001) 1 $208.87 $208.87 SMITH-BLAIR 441-00001350-900 $211.00 $211.00 $255.16 $255.16 POWERSEAL 3501
12.75" t0 13.20" X 13.20" TO 13.50” SMITH-BLAIR 441-0001350-9001

3 oo sayd DPIT Cost 247 2 $870.28 $1,740.56 SMITH-BLAIR 413-26322580-603 $880.00 $1,760.00 SMITH-BLAIR 413-26322580-603 $970.62 $1,941.24 POWERSEAL 3501

4 onemronny sappy 8 DPIT Cast 307 1 $992.54 $992.54 SMITH-BLAIR 413-33153200-603 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 SMITH-BLAIR 413-33153200-603 $1,374.44 $1,374.44 POWERSEAL 3501

5 oot 3131 74 0 52.00" X 32.40° T0 32.74" 1 $992.54 $992.54 SMITH-BLAIR 413-62743200-603 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 SMITH-BLAIR 413-32743200-603 $1,374.44 $1,374.44 POWERSEAL 3501

6 onemromnt sapgy8 DPIT Cast 367 1 $1,039.30 $1,039.30 SMITH-BLAIR 413-39353830-603 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 SMITH-BLAIR 413-39353830-603 $2,826.50 $2,826.50 POWERSEAL 3501

7 Coupling 4" X 8.8” (Hymax 860-54-0108-16) 25 $211.15 $5,278.75 HYMAX 860-54-0108-16 $210.00 $5,250.00 HYMAX 860-54-0108-16 NO BID
Full Circle Coupling 4" X 10"

8 o t6010-001) 64 $139.98 $8,958.72 SMITH-BLAIR 227-00048010-001 $139.80 $8,947.20 SMITH-BLAIR 227-048010-001 $163.08 $10,437.12 POWERSEAL 3122
Coupling 6” X 10.8"

0 e Si163.16) 25 $279.63 $6,990.75 HYMAX 860-54-0163-16 $280.00 $7,000.00 HYMAX 860-54-0163-16 NO BID
Full Circle Coupling 6" X 10"

10 o eo10-001) 380 $147.92 $56,209.60 SMITH-BLAIR 227-00069010-001 $149.00 $56,620.00 SMITH-BLAIR 227-069010-001 $161.41 $61,335.80 POWERSEAL 3122
Full Circle Coupling 8" X 10"

% o a0810-001) 100 $159.33 $15,933.00 SMITH-BLAIR 227-00090510-001 $160.00 $16,000.00 SMITH-BLAIR 227-090510-001 $185.64 $18,564.00 POWERSEAL 3122
Full Circle Coupling 10" X 10"

12 o onos01) 12 $222.87 $2,674.44 SMITH-BLAIR 227-00111010-001 $223.00 $2,676.00 SMITH-BLAIR 227-111010-001 $263.52 $3,162.24 POWERSEAL 3122
Coupling 12 X 10.8"

13 e a0-0515.16) 6 $479.38 $2,876.28 HYMAX 860-54-0315-16 $475.00 $2,850.00 HYMAX 860-54-0315-16 NO BID

14 T o e 2 ot 227-132015001) 60 $340.47 $20,428.20 SMITH-BLAIR 227-00132015-001 $303.00 $18,180.00 FORD F2-1392-158H $270.45 $16,227.00 POWERSEAL 3122
Coupling 16" X 11.6”

15 e 0-0.0404.167) 6 $1,313.02 $7,878.12 HYMAX 860-56-0434-16P $1,310.00 $7,860.00 HYMAX 860-54-0434-16P NO BID
Full Circle Coupling 16" X 15"

1 (Smith 3 B 20820171519.001) 12 $559.56 $6,714.72 SMITH-BLAIR 228-20171515-001 $345.00 $4,140.00 FORD F21790-155H $340.35 $4,084.20 POWERSEAL 3123
Coupling 24" X 11.6”

17 e a0-0506-167) 6 $1,776.34 $10,658.04 HYMAX 860-56-0606-16P $1,790.00 $10,740.00 HYMAX 860-54-0606-16P NO BID
Full Circle Coupling 24" X 30"

18 (Smitn s B 208 20045330.001) 1 $2,239.64 $2,239.64 SMITH-BLAIR 228-30243830-001 $1,380.00 $1,380.00 FORD F3-2548-30SH $958.85 $958.85 POWERSEAL 3123
Full Circle Coupling 24" X 30"

19 (Smitn s B 8 22957030.001) 1 $2,256.73 $2,256.73 SMITH-BLAIR 228-30257030-001 $1,395.00 $1,395.00 FORD F3-2680-30SH $1,065.39 $1,065.39 POWERSEAL 3123
Full Circle Coupling 28" X 30"

2 (Smitn 3 B 28 22506220.001) 1 $2,385.79 $2,385.79 SMITH-BLAIR 228-30296230-001 $1,490.00 $1,490.00 FORD F3-3072-30SH $1,183.77 $1,183.77 POWERSEAL 3123

21 oa00792.900 B S e & Bl O 4412 5 $89.94 $449.70 SMITH-BLAIR 441-00000722-900 $90.85 $454.25 SMITH-BLAIR 441-0000722-900 $91.27 $456.35 POWERSEAL 3501

2 ransition Gouping (Poverseal 3501) 2 $396.90 $793.80 SMITH-BLAIR 441-18901780-900 $430.00 $860.00 SMITH-BLAIR 441-18901780-900 $433.64 $867.28 POWERSEAL 3501
Transition Coupling

2 17.40° TO 18.46" X 18.46° TO 19.00" 1 $425.25 $425.25 SMITH-BLAIR 441-00001780-900 $430.00 $430.00 SMITH-BLAIR 441-0001780-900 $541.58 $541.58 POWERSEAL 3501
(Smith & Blair 41100001780-900)

2 ransiton Souping (Poverseal 3501) o 2 $1,156.11 $2,312.22 ROMAC 501-20"X20"X7" $648.00 $1,296.00 FPRD FCS-2000-2250A10R $541.58 $1,083.16 POWERSEAL 3501

2 o Couping (Powerseal 3501) 21,3570 21.75" 2 $1,156.11 $2,312.22 ROMAC 501-22.25"X21.75"X7" $650.00 $1,300.00 FORD FC5-2000-2250-A10R $570.22 $1,140.44 POWERSEAL 3501

Jtem Bell Joint Clamp Estimate Annual

See Specification "Wfitting CI") Quantity
C.1. Bell Joint CI: 4"

26 e b 50.000) 10 $116.76 $1,167.60 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00000480-000 $82.00 $820.00 FORD FBC-500 $116.20 $1,162.00 POWERSEAL 3232
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Couplings, Clamps & Restrainers

Utility Supply Company

Core & Main LP

Powerseal Pipeline Products Inc

C.1. Bell Joint Clamp 6"

27 (ot & Biar 224-5600.000) 35 $128.59 $4,500.65 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00000690-000, $102.15 $3,575.25 FORD FBC-710 $158.57 $5,549.95 POWERSEAL 3232
C.1. Bell Joint Clamp 8"

28 (ot & Biar 224-5005.000) 5 $177.68 $888.40 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00000905-000 $119.50 $597.50 FORD FBC-930 $162.84 $814.20 POWERSEAL 3232
C.1. Bell Joint Clamp 10"

2 (ot Biar 204 10.000) 5 $223.26 $1,116.30 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00001110-000, $166.20 $831.00 FORD FBC-1140 $189.60 $948.00 POWERSEAL 3232
C.1. Bell Joint Clamp 12"

30 (ot Biar 247 320.000) 15 $241.48 $3,622.20 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00001320-000, $170.00 $2,550.00 FPRD FBC-1350 $273.15 $4,097.25 POWERSEAL 3232
C.1. Bell Joint Clamp 16"

31 (ot & Biar 2047 740-000) 10 $377.07 $3,770.70 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00001740-000, $380.00 $3,800.00 SMITH-BLAIR 274-1740-000 $332.57 $3,325.70 POWERSEAL 3232
C.1. Bell Joint Clamp 20"

32 (ot Biar 245 0-000) 1 $608.50 $608.50 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00002160-000 $614.00 $614.00 SMITH-BLAIR 274-2160-000 $686.60 $686.60 POWERSEAL 3232
C.1. Bell Joint Clamp 24"

3 (ot Biar 224-5280-000) 15 $693.00 $10,395.00 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00002580-000, $700.00 $10,500.00 SMITH-BLAIR 274-2580-000 $966.82 $14,502.30 POWERSEAL 3232

34 C.1. Bell Joint Clamp 30" (Dresser 160) 2 $1,222.18 $2,444.36 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00003174-000 $1,235.00 $2,470.00 SMITH-BLAIR 274-3174-000 $1,087.08 $2,174.16 POWERSEAL 3232

35 C.I. Bell Joint Clamp 36" (Dresser 160) 1 $1,469.23 $1,469.23 SMITH-BLAIR 274-00003796-000 $1,480.00 $1,480.00 SMITH-BLAIR 274-3796-000

ltem # FLANGE COUPLING ADAPTERS Estimate Annual

|(See Specification "WfittingCI") Quantity
Flange Coupling Adapter 3" SMITH-BLAIR 912-900369603-

36 (Smith & Blair 912-038003-000) 20 $108.80 $2,176.00 $110.00 $2,200.00 SMITH-BLAIR 912-038003-000 $137.85 $2,757.00 POWERSEAL 3526
Flange Coupling Adapter 3"

37 (Hymex 874.54-03008812) 25 $186.11 $4,652.75 SMITH-BLAIR 874-54-03008812 $185.00 $4,625.00 HYMAX 974-54-03008812 NO BID
Flange Coupling Adapter 4"

38 (Smith & Blair 912-048004-000) 15 $135.84 $2,037.60 SMITH-BLAIR 912-90048604-000; $137.00 $2,055.00 SMITH-BLAIR 912-0480004-000 $124.68 $1,870.20 POWERSEAL 3521
Flange Coupling Adapter 4"

39 (Hymex 874.54-04010812) 25 $240.30 $6,007.50 HYMAX 874-54-04010812 $240.00 $6,000.00 HYMAX 874-54-04010812
Flange Coupling Adapter 6"

40 (Smith & Blair 912-069006-000) 2 $173.46 $346.92 SMITH-BLAIR 912-90069606-000; $175.00 $350.00 SMITH-BLAIR 912-069006-000 $128.43 $256.86 POWERSEAL 3521
Flange Coupling Adapter 8"

@ (Smith & Blair 912-090508-000) 2 $238.10 $476.20 SMITH-BLAIR 912-90091108-000; $212.00 $424.00 SMITH-BLAIR 912-090508-000 $144.62 $289.24 POWERSEAL 3521

42 fs‘f;'i‘-“heEi.‘;g:";‘1ffﬂ%q:féco) 3 $431.04 $1,293.12 SMITH-BLAIR 912-90116010-000; $338.75 $1,016.25 SMITH-BLAIR 912-111010-000 $252.18 $756.54 POWERSEAL 3521
Flange Coupling Adapter 12"

43 (Smith & Blair 912-132012-000) 1 $479.36 $479.36 SMITH-BLAIR 912-90135012-000; $480.00 $480.00 SMITH-BLAIR 912-132012-000 $282.29 $282.29 POWERSEAL 3521

ltem # Companion Flanges & Joint Restrainers Estimate Annual

|(See Specification "Wfitting CI") Quantity

44 Joint Restrainer 3" Megalug 1103 25 $21.55 $538.75 STAR PIPE SGDPPKO3N $22.15 $553.75 STAR SGDPO3N

45 Joint Restrainer 4" Megalug 1104 35 $22.83 $799.05 STAR PIPE SGDPPK04N $24.00 $840.00 STAR SGDP04N

46 Joint Restrainer 6" *Megalug 1106 375 $26.85 $10,068.75 STAR PIPE SGDPPKO06N $27.15 $10,181.25 STAR SGDPO06N

47 Joint Restrainer 8" Megalug 1108 40 $40.35 $1,614.00 STAR PIPE SGDPPK08N $41.65 $1,666.00 STAR SGDPO08N

48 Joint Restrainer 10" Megalug 1110 10 $59.80 $598.00 STAR PIPE SGDPPK10N $62.00 $620.00 STAR SGDP10N

49 Joint Restrainer 12" Megalug 1112 75 $87.14 $6,535.50 STAR PIPE SGDPPK12 $89.00 $6,675.00 STAR SGDP12

50 Joint Restrainer 14” Megalug 1114 50 $115.66 $5,783.00 STAR PIPE SGDPPK14 $117.00 $5,850.00 STAR SGDP14

51 Joint Restrainer 16"Megalug 1116 40 $165.07 $6,602.80 STAR PIPE SGDPPK16 $166.15 $6,646.00 STAR SGDP16

52 Joint Restrainer 20" Megalug 1120 50 $290.38 $14,519.00 STAR PIPE SGDPPK20 $292.80 $14,640.00 STAR SGDP20

43 Joint Restrainer 24” Megalug 1124 40 $403.20 $16,128.00 STAR PIPE SGDPPK24 $410.00 $16,400.00 STAR SGDP24

54 Joint Restrainer 30" Megalug 1130 20 $1,018.04 $20,360.80 STAR PIPE SGDPPK30 $1,065.00 $21,300.00 STAR SGDP30

55 Joint Restrainer 36” Megalug 1136 20 $1,297.57 $25,951.40 STAR PIPE SGDPPK36 $1,315.00 $26,300.00 STAR SGDP36

56 Joint Restrainer 48" Megalug 1148 15 $2,545.88 $38,188.20 STAR PIPE SGDPPK48 $2,585.00 $38,775.00 STAR SGDPPK48

TOTAL EXTENDED COST NOT TO EXCEED: $358 281.92 $349 470.45 $168 861.57
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) ’ " ’ " ’ "

Delivery|

Stock - 6 Weeks

Stock to 20 Days Under Normal Market Conditions

7 - 10 Business Days

Annual Price Adjustment

Fixed 5%

Fixed 10%

Fixed 5%
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