Tulsa

A New Kind of Energy.

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 1217B Buyer: Angie Tune
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Special Meters & Valves atune@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Date: March 2, 2023

1. Delivery:
If Your Bid is Accepted, State the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or to begin providing Services:

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City Terminating the Agreement and pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other
damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing
Valves (See Specification "WValveGTCA") Utility Supply Co. Core & Main LP Fortiline LLC
Item Special Meter Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufactureres Name and Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufactureres Name and Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufactureres Name and
Part Number Part Number Part Number

1 Brass Meter Valve 1-1/2" 3 $408.59 $1,225.77 JONES MUELLER 35-0557 $460.00 $1,380.00 JONES J372F NO BID
(Jones J-372F)

2 Brass Meter Valve 2" 6 $461.07 $2,766.42 JONES MUELLER 35-0557 $515.00 $3,090.00 JONES J372F NO BID
(Jones J-372F)
Gate Valve " "

ftem (See Specification “WValveGTCA”) Estimate Annual Quantity

3 Brass Gate Valve, FIPY 1-1/2° 20 $147.14 $2,942.80 HAMMOND 18645 $112.00 $2,240.00 HAMMOND VALVE $149.04 $2,998.80 HAMMOND 606
(125 PSliHammond 606) : 942 ! 240, ! 998,

4 e 6y 95 $207.13 $19,677.35 HAMMOND 18645 $162.00 $15,380.00 HAMMOND 606 $214.96 $20,421.20 HAMMOND 606
(125 PSliHammond 606) . 677. ! 390, : 421
Gate Valve FIPT

5 (Non-Rising Stem) 2" 8 $364.78 $2,918.24 AFC $410.00 $3,280.00 AVK 03-063TTN $411.20 $3,289.60 CLOW F6103

6 Resilent Wedged Mech, 3 $378.00 $14,742.00 AFC $425.00 $16,575.00 AVK 25-050-MMM $425.60 $16,508.40 CLOW F6100
(Non-Rising Stim) Gate Valve 2" ! g ! .| 3 3 X X .

7 Resilent-Wedged Mech, 7 $507.73 $4,184.11 AFC $670.00 $4,690.00 AVK 65-100-MMM $673.82 $4,716.74 CLOW F6100
(Non-Rising Stim) Gate Vaive 4* : 184, ! 690, : 716.

8 Resilent Wedged Mech, 36 $763.00 $27,468.00 AFC $855.00 $30,780.00 AVK 65-150-MMM $855.24 $30,788.64 CLOW F6100
(Non-Rising Stim) Gate Valve 6" ! B 8 .| 3 . . , .

9 Resilient-Wedged Mech. 9 $1,214.11 $10,926.99 AFC $1,375.00 $12,375.00 AVK 65-200-MMM $1,369.53 $12,325.77 CLOW F6100
(Non-Rising Stim) Gate Vaive 8" 214. 926 375, 375, 369. 325,

10 Resiient Wedged Wech, 1 $1,892.73 $1,892.73 AFC $2,300.00 $2,300.00 AVK 65-250-MMM $2,135.48 $2,135.48 CLOW F6100
(Non-Rising Stim) Gate Valve 10" B g v g 1+ ! g . N . L .

i Resilient-Wedged Mech. 2 $2,395.17 $4,790.34 AFC $2,730.00 $5,460.00 AVK 65-300-MMM $2,702.19 $5,404.38 CLOW F6100
(Non-Rising Stim) Gate Vaive 12° 395. 790. 730, 460, 702, 404,

12 Resilient-Wedged Mech. 1 $7,575.76 $7,575.76 AFC $9,400.00 $9,400.00 AVK 45-400-MMM $8,266.51 $8,266.51 CLOW F6100
(Non-Rising Stim) Gate Valve 16" 575 575, 400, 400, 266 ,266.
Resilient-Wedged Fig

13 (Non-Rising Stem) Gate Valve 2" 6 $373.73 $2,242.38 AFC $420.00 $2,520.00 AVK 25-050-FFN $421.57 $2,520.42 CLOW F6102
Resilient Wedged Fig

14 (Outside Yoke) Gate Valve 3" 12 $755.62 $9,067.44 AFC $845.00 $10,140.00 AVK 5103F2546 $1,266.12 $15,193.44 CLOW F6136
Resilient-Wedged Fig

15 R g S o Valve 3 12 $530.44 $6,365.28 AFC $645.00 $7,740.00 AVK 65-080-FFN $507.80 $7,173.60 CLOW F6102
Resilient-Wedged Fig

1 (Non-Rising Stem) Gate Valve 4” 12 $592.28 $7,107.36 AFC $680.00 $8,160.00 AVK 65-100-FFN $668.06 $8,016.72 CLOW F6102
Resilient-Wedged Fig

17 (Outside Yoke) Gate Valve 4" 20 $779.33 $15,586.60 AFC $950.00 $19,000.00 AVK 5104F4546 $1,450.52 $29,010.40 CLOW F6136
Resilient-Wedged Fig

18 (NonRising Stom) Gete Valve 6" 40 $791.78 $31,671.20 AFC $900.00 $36,000.00 AVK 65-150-FFN $887.89 $35,515.60 CLOW F6102
Resilient-Wedged Fig

19 (Outside Yoke) Gate Valve 6" 12 $1,012.28 $12,147.36 AFC $1,300.00 $15,600.00 AVK 5106F4546 $1,883.97 $22,607.64 CLOW F6136
Resilient-Wedged Fig

20 (NerRising Storn) Gate Valve & 12 $1,237.44 $14,840.28 AFC $1,400.00 $16,800.00 AVK 65-200-FFN $1,387.98 $16,655.76 CLOW F6102
Resilient-Wedged Fig

2 (Ovte Yok date Valve & 6 $1,545.84 $9,275.04 AFC $2,000.00 $12,000.00 AVK 45-200-FFO $2,878.23 $17,260.38 CLOW F6136
Resilient-Wedged Fig

22 (Outside Yoke) Gate Vaive 10" 6 $2,271.89 $13,631.34 AFC $2,900.00 $17.400.00 AVK 45-250-FFO $4,230.40 $25,436.40 CLOW F6136
Resilient-Wedged Fig

2 g S o Valve 10° 6 $1,965.44 $11,792.64 AFC $2,300.00 $13,800.00 AVK 65-250-FFN $2.217.27 $13,303.62 CLOW F6102
Resilient-Wedged Fig

2 (NonRising Sterm) Gate Valve 12° 6 $2,373.78 $14,242.68 AFC $2,700.00 $16,200.00 AVK 65-300-FFN $2,677.42 $16,064.52 CLOW F6102
Resilient-Wedged Fig

25 ot Yo e vaive 12° 6 $2,957.89 $17,747.34 AFC $3,800.00 $22,800.00 AVK 45-300-FFO $5,519.77 $33,118.62 CLOW F6136
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Valves (See Specification "WValveGTCA")

Utility Supply Co.

Core & Main LP

Fortiline LLC

Item Special Meter Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufa:;:r;r:;:;l:?e and Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufa:;:r;r:;:;l:?e and Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufa:;:r;r:;:;l:?e and
26 Resilient-Wedged Gate Valve 24" 2 $21,212.12 $42,424.24 AFC $26,000.00 $52,000.00 AVK 55-600-FFN $22,982.49 $45,964.98 CLOW F6100
27 Resilient-Wedged Gate Valve 30" 2 $35,424.24 $70,848.48 AFC $45,000.00 $90,000.00 AVK 55 $43,735.79 $87,471.58 CLOW F6100
28 Resilient-Wedged Gate Valve 36" 2 $52,575.76 $105,151.52 AFC $71,000.00 $142,000.00 AVK 55 $65,410.53 $130,821.06 CLOW F6100

Check Valve " "

Item (See Specification "WValveGTCA") Estimate Annual Quantity
29 Check Valve (Flg) 2" 1 $812.12 $812.12 PRATT 0200-8001ABILW $11,250.00 $11,250.00 AVK 5502CVAVK $1,007.03 $1,007.03 CLOW 1106
30 Check Valve (Fig) 3" 12 $1,005.74 $12,068.88 AFC $1,295.00 $15,540.00 AVK 5503CVAVK $723.22 $8,678.64 CLOW 1106
31 Check Valve (Fig.) 4" 2 $1,242.32 $2,484.64 AFC $1,500.00 $3,000.00 AVK 5504CVAVK $893.51 $1,787.02 CLOW 1106
32 Check Valve (Fig.) 6" 6 $1,865.96 $11,195.76 AFC $2,060.00 $12,360.00 AVK 5506CVAVK $1,341.84 $8,051.04 CLOW 1106
33 Check Valve (Fig.) 8" 10 $2,731.13 $27,311.30 AFC $3,100.00 $31,000.00 AVK 5508CVAVK $1,964.14 $19,641.40 CLOW 1106
34 Check Valve (Fg.) 10" 10 $4,901.00 $49,010.00 AFC $5,000.00 $50,000.00 AVK 5510CVAVK $3,524.61 $35,246.10 CLOW 1106

Tapping Valves . N

tem (See Specification "WValveGTCA") Estimate Annual Quantity
35 C.I. Tapping Valve (Fig.) 4” 20 $753.67 $15,073.40 AFC $875.00 $17,500.00 AVK 65-100-MFN $850.05 $17,001.00 CLOW F6114
36 Tapping Valve (Mech) 6" 20 $1,064.00 $21,280.00 AFC $1,260.00 $25,200.00 AVK 65-150-MFN $1,200.78 $24,015.60 CLOW F6114
37 Tapping Valve (Mech) 8" 20 $1,570.33 $31,406.60 AFC $1,845.00 $36,900.00 AVK 65-200-MFN $1,782.45 $35,649.00 CLOW 6114
38 Tapping Valve (Mech) 10" 20 $2,382.73 $47,654.60 AFC $2,775.00 $55,500.00 AVK 65-250-MFN $2,687.80 $53,756.00 CLOW 6114
39 Tapping Valve (Mech) 12" 20 $3,598.78 $71,975.60 AFC $4,150.00 $83,000.00 AVK 65-300-MFN $4,060.19 $81,203.80 CLOW 6114
40 Tapping Valve (Mech) 16" 20 $8,787.88 $175,757.60 AFC $9,000.00 $180,000.00 AVK 65-400-MFN $9,612.80 $192,256.00 CLOW 6114

Item Air and Vacuum Valve Estimate Annual Quantity

Air and Vacuum Valve 2"
4 (300 PSI/APCO 145C) 8 $557.78 $4,462.24 ARI D-040 $650.00 $5,200.00 CRISPIN UL20 NO BID
Ball Valve " "

Item (See Specification "WValve Ball") Estimate Annual Quantity
42 Manual Ball Valve 16" 1 $43,403.03 $43,403.03 PRATT 16BVRI-0630 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 PRATT 16BVRI-0630-MM NO BID
43 Ball Valve 20" 1 $53,781.82 $53,781.82 PRATT 20BVRI-0630 $57,500.00 $57,500.00 PRATT 20BVRI-0630-MM NO BID
44 Ball Valve 24" 1 $64,165.66 $64,165.66 PRATT 24BVRI-0630 $71,500.00 $71,500.00 PRATT 24BVRI-0630-MM NO BID
45 Ball Valve 30" 1 $97,266.67 $97,266.67 PRATT 30BVRI-0630 $102,950.00 $102,950.00 PRATT 30BVRI-0630-MM NO BID
46 Ball Valve 36" 1 $118,158.59 $118,158.59 PRATT 36BVRI-0630 $124,500.00 $124,500.00 PRATT 36BVRI-0630-MM NO BID

Butterfly Valve . "

Item (See Specification “WValveBfly") Estimate Annual Quantity
a7 Butterfly Valve 16" 1 $4,277.78 $4,277.78 PRATT 16IFF-0542-SSLHP3 $4,900.00 $4,900.00 AVK 165816 BFV NO BID
48 Butterfly Valve 24" 1 $8,862.63 $8,862.63 PRATT 24IFF-0542-SSLHP4 $11,400.00 $11,400.00 AVK 248816 BFV NO BID
49 Butterfly Valve 30" 1 $15,970.71 $15,970.71 PRATT 30IFF-0542-SSLHPA $25,000.00 $25,000.00 AVK 308766 BFV NO BID
50 Butterfly Valve 36" 1 $18,628.28 $18,628.28 PRATT 36IFF-0542-SSLHPA $30,000.00 $30,000.00 AVK 368766 BFV NO BID

Torque Limiter . N

Item (See Specification “WValveTLD") Estimate Annual Quantity

51 Torque Limiting Device for Valves 1 $1,723.23 $1,723.23 Pratt $1,225.00 $1,225.00 PRATT 1873331 NO BID
Back Flow Valve " "
tem (See Specification “WValveDCVA”) Estimate Annual Quantity
52 Top Load Back Flow Valve 2" 35 $758.00 $26,530.00 WATTS 0391007 $775.00 $27,125.00 WATTS LF009M2-QT
AT e be disqualifi $1,408,521.83 $1,616,670.00 $1,091,390.89
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) ’ ’ ’ ’ ) ’
Delivery Stock - 6 weeks 14 Days
Annual Price Adjustment Fixed 5% Fixed 7%

Notes
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