
City of Tulsa TAC 443F Senior Buyer: Donny Tiemann
Purchasing Department Safety Supplies dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Water & Sewer Department please contact
Tulsa, OK  74103 Date: February 16, 2023

1. Delivery: 

If Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or to begin providing Services:

2. Pricing

No. Description
Pkg Qty Qty of 

Pkgs
Est. Total 

Annual Qty Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number

1
Antihistamine, Diphenhydramine 25 mg - 200 
packs per box. Individual packs not to exceed 25 
mg.

1 20 20 $13.85 $277.00 PROSTATT 2675 $11.81 $236.20 MEDIQUE 18447 $15.62 $312.40 MEDIQUE 18447 $11.52 $230.40 18447 1303467 $14.95 $299.00 MEDIQUE MEDI8447

2 Aspirin - 325mg – 250 packs per box. Individual 
packs not to exceed 325 mg 1 20 20 $6.20 $124.00 PROSTATT 2121 $6.03 $120.60 MEDIQUE 80548 $16.69 $333.80 MEDIQUE 11613 $10.58 $211.60 80348 1014527 $15.31 $306.20 MEDIQUE MEDI1613

3 Cream, Cert burn cream 1 gm 6 10 60 $1.75 $105.00 PROSTATT 2166 $3.94 $236.40 MEDIQUE 26073 $3.62 $217.20 ACME UNITED FAE-7011 $3.89 $233.40 FAE-7011 1054807 $4.97 $298.20 MEDIQUE MED26073

4 Cream, Interpro Ivy Shield Topical cream (no 
aerosol) or equal. 4 oz. bottle 1 80 80 $3.55 $284.00 PROSTATT 2633 $7.14 $571.20 MEDIQUE 83666 $5.34 $427.20 IVY X 18050AC $6.23 $498.40 2881444 109599 $6.00 $480.00 LOGISTICS SUPPLY IVY18050AC

5 Skin cleanser, Tecnu outdoor (or equal) used for 
removing poison oak and ivy oils – 4 oz. bottle 1 80 80 $7.75 $620.00 PROSTATT 2634 $7.50 $600.00 MEDIQUE 8360 $3.02 $241.60 IVY X (SOLD BY 

CASE 12) 18-060 $8.95 $716.00 8360 1049095 $11.79 $943.20 LOGISTICS SUPPLY TEC2554HT

6 Cream, Medicated Skin Cream, SBS40, 5 oz. 
tube. (Boren 1083621 or equal) 1 485 485 $5.25 $2,546.25 ORS SBS100ML $4.46 $2,163.10 SC JOHNSON SJNSBS100ML $3.05 $1,479.25 SC JOHNSON 

PROFESSIONAL SBS100ML $3.13 $1,518.05 SBS100ML 618062 $3.13 $1,518.05 LOGISTICS SUPPLY SB40

7 Eye Wash – 1 oz. bottle.North 020699 or equal 1 20 20 $1.80 $36.00 PROSTATT 2052 $4.69 $93.80 NORTH 20699 $5.50 $110.00 HONEYWELL 20699 $2.87 $57.40 19828 1014515 $2.92 $58.40 MEDIQUE MED19828

8

First Aid Kit – Small plastic10 unit truck kit  – to 
include antiseptic BZK towelettes 10/bx; nitrile 
gloves 2 pr/bx; adhesive tape ½” x 2-1/2 yd 2/bx; 
cert burn cream 1 gm 6/bx; 32 sq” absorbent 
compress 1/bx; 3x3 gauze pads 4/bx; triangular 
bandage 3/bx; bandage compress 4” 1/bx; 2” 
gauze compress 4/bx; 1x3 plastic 
bandages316/bx.

1 85 85 $13.70 $1,164.50 PROSTATT 796 $22.20 $1,887.00 FIRST AID ONLY 91322 $40.77 $3,465.45 HRADNOR 64058085 $29.66 $2,521.10 FAST733ANSI 924264038 $13.40 $1,139.00 KRS NASCA ANC10-9-FAKP

9 Sunscreen – SPF 30 – Lotion (4 oz.) Waterproof; 
must provide UVA & UVB protection. 1 50 50 $5.90 $295.00 PROSTATT 2378 $5.81 $290.50 FIRST AID ONLY 18-204-001 $7.78 $389.00 SC JOHNSON 

PROFESSIONAL SUN100ML $10.78 $539.00 122019-HS 1049096 $4.57 $228.50 GLOBAL 
INDUSTRIAL SUN71666

10 Sunscreen – SPF 50 – Lotion (4 oz.) Waterproof; 
must provide UVA & UVB protection. 1 50 50 $13.11 $655.50 KREWD 16639 $3.73 $186.50 SUNX T9FB2322389 $14.24 $712.00 KREWD 6351 8OZ BOTTLE $12.85 $642.50 16631 921806033 $4.72 $236.00 GLOBAL 

INDUSTRIAL SUN61666

$5,506.55

No. Description Pkg Qty Qty of 
Pkgs

Est. Total 
Annual Qty Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number

1 Bee Bopper II, Wasp and Hornet Spray 61011 or 
equal (14 oz ) 1 500 500 $8.20 $4,100.00 RAID 668006 $7.112000 $3,556.00 SPRAYON 075577-90857 $5.50 $2,750.00 ARI 61011 $109.94 $54,970.00 ITW PRO BRANDS 18320DY12/CS $5.59 $2,795.00 621044 621044 $5.55 $2,775.00 ARI ARI61011

2 Repellant - Bug Barrier II 61604 or equal (6oz.) 1 500 500 $8.75 $4,375.00 OFF 317189 $5.152900 $2,576.45 3M 051131-67777 $6.07 $3,035.00 ARI 610604 $79.01 $39,505.00 QUEST 435001QC12/CS $6.39 $3,195.00 621045 621045 $5.88 $2,940.00 ARI ARI61604

3 Evaporative Cooling bandana ties. Koolwrap or 
equal 1 43 43 $2.20 $94.60 OCCONOMY 940 $1.400000 $60.20 PIP 616314-79399 $1.93 $82.99 ERGODYNE 12301 $11.62 $499.66 PYRAMEX CNB12PKRB $2.38 $102.34 12305 1002915 $2.24 $96.32 ERGODYNE ERG12307

4 Towel, Ergodyne Chill It Cooling Towel. #12420 or 
equal 1 15 15 $7.70 $115.50 EVGODYNE 12420 $3.917647 $58.76 PIP 616314-25218 $6.07 $91.05 ERGODYNE 12420 $1.98 $29.70 PYRAMEX C260 $4.23 $63.45 12411 1322299 $6.47 $97.05 ERGODYNE ERG12420

5
Gloves, Brown Jersey, poly cotton, knit wrist, pair.

1 70 70 $47.00 $3,290.00 CORDOVA 1400P $0.600000 $42.00 PIP 616314-04230 $0.74 $51.80 MCR 7100D $0.52 $36.40 SAF-T-GLOVE 90 $0.75 $52.50 495-1JJ843 495-1JJ1843 $0.68 $47.60 GENERAL WORK 
PRODUCTS CWPG4503

6
Gloves, Cowhide Driver’s. LargePIP #158L or 
equal, pair. 1 4650 4650 $4.45 $20,692.50 CORDOVA 8223 $4.517647 $21,007.06 PIP 616314-08412 $5.49 $25,528.50 PIP 68-158/L $3.24 $15,066.00 SAF-T-GLOVE L4260 $5.70 $26,505.00 68158/L 99905077 $2.86 $13,299.00 GENERAL WORK 

PRODUCTS GWPG8834 $5.95 $27,667.50 PIP 158L

7
Gloves, Neox-coated reinforced neoprene. PIP 
#8040 or equal, pair 1 100 100 $1.53 $153.00 CORDOVA 5014 $2.717647 $271.76 PIP 616314-06579 $3.49 $349.00 PIP 58-8040 $1.49 $149.00 SAF-T-GLOVE 785 $3.38 $338.00 5435L 1006197 $2.12 $212.00 GENERAL WORK 

PRODUCTS GWPG2234

8 Gloves, Nitrile. Small.8-mil thickness. 50/ box. 1 25 1250 $8.75 $10,937.50 GLOVESAFE EDC901SM $6.176471 $7,720.59 PIP 616314-11337 $10.63 $13,287.50 CORDOVA 4097S $12.00 $15,000.00 SEATTLE GLOVE V09MPFS $7.00 $8,750.00 1334830 1334830 $12.23 $15,287.50 PIP PIP63-338PF/S $7.50 $9,375.00 DIAMOND PIP63-338PF/S

9 Gloves, Nitrile. Medium.8-mil thickness. 50/ box. 1 25 1250 $8.75 $10,937.50 GLOVESAFE EDC902MEO $6.176471 $7,720.59 PIP 616314-11344 $10.63 $13,287.50 CORDOVA 4097M $12.00 $15,000.00 ADENNA CAT455 $7.00 $8,750.00 1334831 1334831 $12.23 $15,287.50 PIP PIP63-338PF/M $7.50 $9,375.00 DIAMOND PIP63-338PF/M

10 Gloves, Nitrile. Large.8-mil thickness. 50/ box. 1 25 1250 $8.75 $10,937.50 GLOVESAFE ELC1903 $6.176471 $7,720.59 PIP 616314-11351 $10.63 $13,287.50 CORDOVA 4097L $12.00 $15,000.00 ADENNA CAT456 $7.00 $8,750.00 1334832 1334832 $12.23 $15,287.50 PIP PIP63-338PF/L $7.50 $9,375.00 DIAMOND PIP63-338PF/L

11
Gloves, Nitrile. X-Large.8-mil thickness. 50 per 
box. 1 25 1250 $8.75 $10,937.50 GLOVESAFE EDC 0104XL $6.176471 $7,720.59 PIP 616314-11365-

076490-07304 $10.63 $13,287.50 CORDOVA 4097XL $12.00 $15,000.00 ADENNA CAT458 $7.00 $8,750.00 1334833 1334833 $12.23 $15,287.50 PIP PIP63-338PF/XL $7.50 $9,375.00 DIAMOND PIP63-338PF/XL

12
Gloves, Nitrile coated work gloves. Medium. Only 
Ansell Edmont Hycron 27-607 will be accepted, 
pair

1 50 50 $6.98 $349.00 EDMONT 27-6607/M $3.20 $160.00 ANSELL 076490-07302 $3.40 $170.00 ANSELL 27-607-8 $4.18 $209.00 ANSELL 27-607-8 $4.28 $214.00 27-607 1001302 $3.50 $175.00 ANSELL 27-607-M $5.25 $262.50 ANSELL 27-607-M

13
Gloves, Nitrile coated work gloves. Large. Only 
Ansell Edmont Hycron 27-607 will be accepted, 
pair

1 50 50 $6.98 $349.00 EDMONT 27-607/L $3.20 $160.00 ANSELL 076490-06099 $3.40 $170.00 ANSELL 27-607-9 $4.18 $209.00 ANSELL 27-607-9 $4.50 $225.00 27-607 BSS27-607 $3.50 $175.00 ANSELL 27-607-L $5.25 $262.50 ANSELL 27-607-L

14
Gloves, Nitrile coated work gloves. X-Large. Only 
Ansell Edmont Hycron 27-607 will be accepted, 
pair

1 3900 3900 $6.98 $27,222.00 EDMONT 27-607-XL $3.20 $12,480.00 ANSELL 076490-06099 $3.40 $13,260.00 ANSELL 27-607-10 $4.18 $16,302.00 ANSELL 27-607-10 $4.50 $17,550.00 27-607 1000653 $4.00 $15,600.00 ANSELL 127-607-XL $5.25 $20,475.00 ANSELL 127-607-XL

15

Gloves, Heavyweight Disposable Latex Medical 
Examination Gloves. 11 mil thickness, 12 in. 
length, fully textured palm and finger grip, powder 
free   Size Small   50 per box

1 14 14 $15.65 $219.10 CORDOVA 4030/S $8.705882 $121.88 NUTREND HER005 $16.86 $236.04 PIP 2550/S $12.51 $175.14 MCR SAFETY 7211PFS $17.81 $249.34 SG-375-5 99309203 $16.57 $231.98 PIP PIP2550/S

16

Gloves, Heavyweight Disposable Latex Medical 
Examination Gloves. 11 mil thickness, 12 in. 
length, fully textured palm and finger grip, powder 
free   Size Medium   50 per box

1 14 14 $15.65 $219.10 CORDOVA 4030 $8.705882 $121.88 NUTREND HER005 $16.86 $236.04 PIP 2550/M $12.51 $175.14 MCR SAFETY 7211PFM $15.82 $221.48 SG-375-M 99309204 $16.57 $231.98 PIP PIP2550/M

17

Gloves, Heavyweight Disposable Latex Medical 
Examination Gloves.11 mil thickness, 12 in. 
length, fully textured palm and finger grip, powder 
free.  Size Large.  50 per box

1 14 14 $9.75 $136.50 GLOVESAFE PS50L $8.705882 $121.88 NUTREND HER006 $16.86 $236.04 PIP 2550/L $12.51 $175.14 MCR SAFETY 7211PFL $16.06 $224.84 SG-375-L 99309205 $16.57 $231.98 PIP PIP2550/L

18

Gloves, Heavyweight Disposable Latex Medical 
Examination Gloves. 11 mil thickness, 12 in. 
length, fully textured palm and finger grip, powder 
free.  Size X-large.  50 per box

1 14 14 $9.75 $136.50 GLOVESAFE PS50L $8.705882 $121.88 NUTREND HER008 $16.86 $236.04 PIP 2550 $12.51 $175.14 MCR SAFETY 7211PFXL $7.00 $98.00 1334806 1334806 $16.57 $231.98 PIP PIP2550/XL

19
Gloves, Mechanics gel pad anti-vibration gloves. 
Size Small. Pair. 1 50 50 $9.75 $487.50 GLOVESAFE PS50L $8.705882 $435.29 NUTREND HER008 $16.86 $843.00 PIP 2550/L $12.51 $625.50 MCR SAFETY 7211PF-2XL $13.41 $670.50 5049XL 1024219 $16.57 $828.50 PIP PIP2550/L

20 Gloves, Mechanics gel pad anti-vibration gloves. 
Size Medium  Pair 1 50 50 $20.00 $1,000.00 IMPACTO AV408-30 $10.600000 $530.00 VALEO VO4869ME $18.94 $947.00 PIP 120-4400/M $17.13 $856.50 PIP 120-4400M $27.33 $1,366.50 16453 1033391 $8.75 $437.50 CORDOVA COR77172M

21 Gloves, Mechanics gel pad anti-vibration gloves. 
Size Large  Pair 1 50 50 $20.00 $1,000.00 IMPACTO AV408-20 $10.600000 $530.00 VALEO VI4869SM $18.94 $947.00 PIP 120-440/S $17.13 $856.50 PIP 120-44S $27.33 $1,366.50 16453 1033391 $8.75 $437.50 CORDOVA COR77172M

22 Gloves, Mechanics gel pad anti-vibration gloves. 
Size X-Large  Pair 1 50 50 $20.00 $1,000.00 IMPACTO AV408-30 $10.600000 $530.00 VALEO VI4869ME $18.94 $947.00 PIP 120-440/M $17.13 $856.50 PIP 120-44M $27.33 $1,366.50 16453 1033391 $8.75 $437.50 CORDOVA COR77172M

23 Gloves, PIP G-TEK Maxiflex Micro-foam glove #34-
874 or equal; medium  pair 1 24 24 $20.00 $480.00 IMPACTO AV408-40 $10.600000 $254.40 VALEO VI4869LE $18.94 $454.56 PIP 120-440/L $17.13 $411.12 PIP 120-4400L $27.33 $655.92 16454 103392 $8.75 $210.00 CORDOVA COR77171L

24 Gloves, PIP G-TEK Maxiflex Micro-foam glove #34-
874 or equal; large  pair 1 24 24 $20.00 $480.00 IMPACTO AV408-50 $10.600000 $254.40 VALEO VI4869XL $18.94 $454.56 PIP 120-4400/XL $17.13 $411.12 PIP 120-4400XL $27.33 $655.92 16454 1033393 $8.75 $210.00 CORDOVA COR77174XL

25 Gloves, PIP G-TEK Maxiflex Micro-foam glove #34-
874 or equal; X-large  pair 1 40 40 $1.85 $74.00 PIP 34-315/L $3.129412 $125.18 PIP 616314-17988 $4.01 $160.40 PIP 37-874/XL $2.42 $96.80 SAF-T-GLOVE 1182#10 $4.42 $176.80 34-874/XL 99497948 $4.23 $169.20 PIP PIP34-874/XL

26 Gloves, PIP G-TEK Maxiflex Micro-foam glove #34-
874 or equal; 2 XL  pair 1 40 40 $1.85 $74.00 PIP 34-315/XL $3.129412 $125.18 PIP 616814-06606 $4.01 $160.40 PIP 37-874/XXL $2.42 $96.80 SAF-T-GLOVE 1182#11 $4.42 $176.80 34-874/XXL 99497950 $4.23 $169.20 PIP PIP34-874/L

27 Gloves, PIP Powergrab Thermo Hi Visibility 
Orange gloves or equal  pair 1 70 70 $7.00 $490.00 PIP 41-1328 $6.752941 $472.71 PIP 616314-03406 $8.20 $574.00 PIP 41-1400 $6.07 $424.90 PIP 41-1328 $7.47 $522.90 41-1328/L 9923447148 $6.99 $489.30 PIP PIP41-1328/L

28 Gloves, Work Gloves – Small, Pair.Wells Lamont 
#4100 or equal 1 55 55 $4.75 $261.25 GLOVESAFE 3000/L $3.647089 $200.59 PIP 616314-07392 $3.67 $201.85 PIP 82-7563/S $2.24 $123.20 SAF-T-GLOVE 6644S $2.50 $137.50 12010S 1099833 $2.28 $125.40 PIP PIP85-7500/S

29 Gloves, Work Gloves – Medium, Pair. Wells 
Lamont #4100 or equal  1 50 50 $4.75 $237.50 GLOVESAFE 3000/M $3.647089 $182.35 PIP 616314-07408 $3.67 $183.50 PIP 82/7563/M $2.24 $112.00 SAF-T-GLOVE 6644M $2.50 $125.00 12010M 1099832 $2.28 $114.00 PIP PIP85-7500/M

30 Gloves, Work Gloves – Large, Pair. Wells Lamont 
#4100 or equal 1 225 225 $4.75 $1,068.75 GLOVESAFE 3000/L $3.647089 $820.60 PIP 616314-07415 $3.67 $825.75 PIP 82/7563/L $2.24 $504.00 SAF-T-GLOVE 6644L $2.69 $605.25 12010L 99507484 $2.28 $513.00 PIP PIP85-7500/L

31 Gloves, Work Gloves – X-Large, Pair. Wells 
Lamont #4100 or equal 1 550 550 $4.75 $2,612.50 GLOVESAFE 3000/XL $3.647059 $2,005.88 PIP 616314-07422 $3.67 $2,018.50 PIP 82/7563/XL $2.24 $1,232.00 SAF-T-GLOVE 6644XL $2.69 $1,479.50 12010XL 1099834 $2.28 $1,254.00 PIP PIP85-7500/X-L

32 Glove Liners – PIP 35-c410 or equal, pair 1 5100 5100 $0.40 $2,040.00 CORDOVA 344/L $6.635294 $33,840.00 PIP 616314-02335 $0.70 $3,570.00 PIP 35-C410 $0.31 $1,581.00 SAF-T-GLOVE 85GYL $0.33 $1,683.00 9638LM 1010411 $0.64 $3,264.00 PIP PIP35-C410/L $0.89 $4,539.00 PIP PIP35-C410/L

33
Hard Hat Winter Liner, North Safety WL12 or 
equal. 1 150 150 $12.50 $1,875.00 OCCONOMY LZ620 $15.211760 $2,281.76 NORTH NORTH WL12 $17.76 $2,664.00 HONEYWELL 

NORTH WL12 $4.54 $681.00 OCCUNOMIX WL4 $6.36 $954.00 16821 1007314 $6.20 $930.00 OCCUNOMIX OCCLLB600

34 Paint, Fluorescent blue inverted marking spray 
17oz can (Spray-on 03620 or equal) 1 1000 1000 $6.50 $6,500.00 KRYLON A03620004 $3.941176 $3,941.18 KRYLON 075577-93620 $4.41 $4,410.00 KRYON A03620004 $5.34 $5,340.00 KRYLON 12/CS 3620 $4.50 $4,500.00 A03620004 690304 $5.63 $5,630.00 KRYLON KRYS03620

35 Paint, Fluorescent green inverted marking spray 
17oz can (Spray-on 03630 or equal) 1 250 250 $6.50 $1,625.00 KRYLON A03630004 $4.235294 $1,058.82 KRYLON 075577-93630 $4.41 $1,102.50 KRYON A03630004 $4.62 $1,155.00 KRYLON 12/CS 3630 $4.50 $1,125.00 A03630004 608515 $5.63 $1,407.50 KRYLON KRYS03630

36 Paint, Pink marking spray 20 oz can (Krylon 
s03612 or equal) 1 350 350 $6.75 $2,362.50 KRYLON A03612004 $3.936706 $1,377.85 KRYLON 075577-93612 $4.41 $1,543.50 KRYON A03612004 $5.09 $1,781.50 KRYLON 12/CS 3622 $4.50 $1,575.00 A03612004 608516 $5.63 $1,970.50 KRYLON KRYS03612

37 Paint, Traffic Federal Yellow Spray 20 oz can 
(Spray-on 03801 or equal) 1 50 50 $12.00 $600.00 KRYLON K00449007 $3.936706 $196.84 KRYLON 075577-93801 $4.41 $220.50 KRYON A036801004 $4.62 $231.00 KRYLON 12/CS 3801 $8.06 $403.00 QT0380100 920379515 $5.63 $281.50 KRYLON KRY03801

38 Paint, White Marking spray 20 oz can (Spray-on 
03901 or equal) 1 800 800 $6.50 $5,200.00 KRYLON A03901004 $3.936706 $3,149.36 KRYLON 075577-93901 $4.41 $3,528.00 KRYON A03901004 $4.40 $3,520.00 KRYLON 12/CS 3901 $8.06 $6,448.00 QT0390100 920379514 $5.63 $4,504.00 KRYLON KRYS03901

39
Flashlight, 3-AAA batteries, LED, Dual output, 207 
Lumens high output, 114 Lumens low output. 
(Cree R2  3 Watt or equal)

1 100 100 $35.00 $3,500.00 BRIGHTSTAR XPP-54226 $50.152940 $5,015.29 PELICAN 7110 $17.36 $1,736.00 ENERGIZER DIY3AAA-BXTB NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.24 $1,124.00 2168705 2168705 $25.13 $2,513.00 ROUGHNECK RAYRN3AAA-BA

40 Flashlight, 3-Cell(Ray-o-vac r-3d or equal) 1 250 250 $18.50 $4,625.00 RAYOVAC 01Y3AAABXTB $53.905880 $13,476.47 PELICAN 019428-13522 $4.80 $1,200.00 ENERGIZER 1251L  NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.37 $5,092.50 2168703 2168703 $18.29 $4,572.50 BRIGHTSTAR BR12224LED

41 Lantern, 6-volt, LED(Eveready 5109 or equal) 1 100 100 $47.00 $4,700.00 BRIGHTSTAR 8050 $321.729400 $32,172.94 PELICAN 19428-12223 $10.19 $1,019.00 ENERGIZER BEPLN6V-BTB NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.14 $714.00 5109LS 1038901 $6.90 $690.00 ENERGIZER EVE5109LS

42 Wheel Chocks 10”x6”x8” Grainger #2A092 or 
equal 1 25 25 $23.50 $587.50 CHECKERS RC815 $42.870590 $1,071.76 MONSTER UC1500-4.5 $20.09 $502.25 CHECKERS RC815 $18.64 $466.00 TRUE FORCE WC47CH $30.09 $752.25 RWC-8 540079 $19.40 $485.00 MAXXHAUL 80681

43
Barricade tape, yellow background with black 
lettering shall read “caution open trench”.  2 mil, 3” 
wide by 1000’ roll

1 120 120 $32.00 $3,840.00 NATIONAL MARLOW PT-2 $8.282353 $993.88 HARRIS BT-19AL $18.89 $2,266.80 PRESCO B3103Y3 $16.46 $1,975.20 HARRIS 
INDUSTRIES BT019 $20.00 $2,400.00 B3103Y3 1306431 $6.58 $789.60 IRONWEAR IRO1100-12

44
Orange Vinyl Flagging Tape – 1-3/16” x 150’ (VST 
18) 1 44 44 $2.50 $110.00 PRESCO TF06 $1.576470 $69.36 HARRIS VST18 $1.69 $74.36 PRESCO TFO $1.85 $81.40 HARRIS 

INDUSTRIES VST-18 $2.24 $98.56 TFOG 1306582 $1.57 $69.08 GENERAL WORK 
PRODUCTS TFTFO

45

Fencing, Safety Orange, High Density 
Polyethylene, 48” high by Fifty Foot (50’) length 
roll, Mesh size 1 ¼” X 1 ½” Diamond Shape. 
Value Brand #64090204 or acceptable equal

1 100 100 $48.75 $4,875.00 CORTINA 03-900 $47.058820 $4,705.88 CORTINA 03-906-MGO $42.16 $4,216.00 CORTINA 03-900 $35.87 $3,587.00 TRUE FORCE SF4100TF $39.00 $3,900.00 03-900 1327965 $54.06 $5,406.00 CORTINA 03-900

46

Traffic safety cones: one-piece construction 28” 
height, 13” base, fluorescent red/orange color with 
orange being the predominant color, 
preassembled with 6-inch white reflector band 4 
inches from the top and a 4-inch reflector band, 2 
inches below the 6-inch band. Reflector band 
material shall have a smooth, sealed outer 
surface which will display the same approximate 
color day and night. Cones shall meet the 
following performance criteria: heat resistance – 
no slump after 8 hours at 150 degrees f. Low 
temperature strength – 10-foot lbs.’ at 10-degrees 
f. Tensile strength – 1100 psi, hardness – 70

1 1100 1000 $16.50 $16,500.00 LAKESIDE 
PLASTICS 2825-SMM $17.647060 $17,647.06 CORTINA 03-500-52 $16.97 $16,970.00 LAKESIDE 2825-5-MM $21.77 $21,770.00 JBC SAFETY TC-28R $16.99 $16,990.00 1002803 1002803 $16.25 $16,250.00 LAKESIDE 2825-05-MM $24.00 $24,000.00 JBC JB2RS70032CT3176

4

$151,652.67

No. Description Pkg Qty Qty of 
Pkgs

Est. Total 
Annual Qty Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number

1

Hard Hat – Wide Brim – Color White – Bullard 
#C33R or equal. Full brim hard hat with ratchet 
suspension and cotton brow pad that meets or 
exceeds ANSI Z89.1 Class E & G, Type I. The 
suspension shall be 6 pt. ratchet system. Made in 
USA. NO SUBSTITUTIONS. Hard hat will include 
the City of Tulsa logo in black/white pad printed on 
the front of the hard hat. Imprint will be included in 
the unit cost.

1 140 140 $30.00 $4,200.00 BULLARD E33RWHITE $21.22353 $2,971.29 BULLARD 33WWR $22.33 $3,126.20 BULLARD C33R-WHITE $24.48 $3,427.20 BULLARD BYB90293 $12.67 $1,773.80 HP24110 ART#25382 99826744 $15.15 $2,121.00 RADIANS RADQHR6-WHITE 
LOGO $20.00 $2,800.00 BULLARD 33WJR

2

Hard Hat – Wide Brim – Color Green – Bullard 
#C33R or equal. Full brim hard hat with ratchet 
suspension and cotton brow pad that meets or 
exceeds ANSI Z89.1 Class E & G, Type I. The 
suspension shall be 6 pt. ratchet system. Made in 
USA.  NO SUBSTITUTIONS. Hard hat will include 
the City of Tulsa logo in black/white pad printed on 
the front of the hard hat. Imprint will be included in 
the unit cost.

1 140 140 $30.00 $4,200.00 BULLARD C33RGREEN $21.223530 $2,971.29 BULLARD 33FGR $22.33 $3,126.20 BULLARD C33R-GREEN $24.48 $3,427.20 BULLARD BYB90294 $10.27 $1,437.80 HP24135 ART#25382 91015696 $15.15 $2,121.00 RADIANS RADQHR6-GREEN 
LOGO $20.00 $2,800.00 BULLARD 33HGR

3

Hard Hat – Wide Brim – Color Orange – Bullard 
#C33R or equal. Full brim hard hat with ratchet 
suspension and cotton brow pad that meets or 
exceeds ANSI Z89.1 Class E & G, Type I. The 
suspension shall be 6 pt. ratchet system. Made in 
USA. NO SUBSTITUTIONS. Hard hat will include 
the City of Tulsa logo in black/white pad printed on 
the front of the hard hat. Imprint will be included in 
the unit cost.

1 140 140 $30.00 $4,200.00 BULLARD C33ORANGE $21.223530 $2,971.29 BULLARD 33ORR $22.33 $3,126.20 BULLARD C33R-ORANGE $24.48 $3,427.20 BULLARD BYB223393 $10.27 $1,437.80 HP24140 ART#25382 91015697 $15.15 $2,121.00 RADIANS RADQHR6-ORANGE 
LOGO $20.00 $2,800.00 BULLARD 33HOR

4 Hard Hat bracket Insert, fits Bullard Wide Brim, 
#C33R 1 25 25 $13.50 $337.50 BULLARD 1126 $12.505880 $312.65 R3 164811241 $13.46 $336.50 BULLARD RS6RC $12.49 $312.25 BULLARD RS6RC $4.29 $107.25 HP241 91015714 $6.50 $162.50 RADIANS RADHHSR6

5 Face Shield, Bullard. Fits Bullard adaptor model 
1126 1 50 50 $2.30 $115.00 BULLARD 840ME $8.623529 $431.18 R3 164808201 $9.76 $488.00 BULLARD 860P $2.26 $113.00 BULLARD 840ME $2.44 $122.00 E840ME 922888223 $2.50 $125.00 RADIANS RADV40815-CP

6 Face Shield Adaptor, Bullard model 1126. Fits 
Bullard full brim hardhat. 1 50 50 $15.00 $750.00 BULLARD SS6 $10.588240 $529.41 R3 164805291 $12.84 $642.00 BULLARD 112G $12.06 $603.00 BULLARD 112G $13.89 $694.50 112G 99493603 $8.67 $433.50 RADIANS RADHG-410-A4F

7 Full brim hat sun shield must fit Bullard #C33R 
hard hat. Bullard #SS6 1 50 50 $15.00 $750.00 BULLARD SS6 $12.670590 $633.53 43 164803311 $14.11 $705.50 BULLARD SS6 $13.56 $678.00 BULLARD SS6 $15.56 $778.00 SS6 99493749 $8.00 $400.00 RADIANS RADRHHS-01

8

Full Body Harness –Small. Full body harness, 
polyester webbing, 420-425 lb. capacity rating, 
back & shoulder D-rings, tongue buckle leg 
straps. Must comply with ANSI/OSHA standards. 
Evaluation will also include comfort features on 
body contact points.

1 10 10 $110.00 $1,100.00 GUARDIAN FALL 
PROTECTION 37132-XS-S $74.117650 $741.18 3M 840779-16113 $408.00 $4,080.00 3M DBI SALA 1402145 $77.32 $773.20 3M PROTECTA 1161549 $149.18 $1,491.80 1161214 1334414 $79.79 $797.90 FRENCH CREEK FRE650D-S

Hard Hat Safety and Glove LLC R. S. HUGHES COMPANY INC. Anixter Inc. SAF-T-GLOVE FASTENAL COMPANY TRANSCO SUPPLY CO. INC Mini Wing USA

Hard Hat Safety and Glove LLC R. S. HUGHES COMPANY INC. Anixter Inc. SAF-T-GLOVE FASTENAL COMPANY TRANSCO SUPPLY CO. INC Mini Wing USA

Mini Wing USAFASTENAL COMPANY TRANSCO SUPPLY CO. INC

$7,167.85

$143,898.85

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in Your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well 
as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

Section 2: Industrial Supply Items

Section 3: Personal Protection

$6,385.30$6,107.25

Section 2: Industrial Suppies Sub Total

SAF-T-GLOVE

Section 1: First Aid Subtotal

Hard Hat Safety and Glove LLC R. S. HUGHES COMPANY INC. Anixter Inc.Section 1: First Aid Items

$173,407.30 $199,207.16 $153,322.93 $236,452.36

$7,687.90

1 of 3

mailto:dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org


City of Tulsa TAC 443F Senior Buyer: Donny Tiemann
Purchasing Department Safety Supplies dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Water & Sewer Department please contact
Tulsa, OK  74103 Date: February 16, 2023

1. Delivery: 

If Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or to begin providing Services:

2. Pricing

No. Description
Pkg Qty Qty of 

Pkgs
Est. Total 

Annual Qty Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number

Mini Wing USAFASTENAL COMPANY TRANSCO SUPPLY CO. INC

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in Your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well 
as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

SAF-T-GLOVEHard Hat Safety and Glove LLC R. S. HUGHES COMPANY INC. Anixter Inc.Section 1: First Aid Items

9

Full Body Harness – Medium. Full body harness, 
polyester webbing, 420-425 lb. capacity rating, 
back & shoulder D-rings, tongue buckle leg 
straps. Must comply with ANSI/OSHA standards. 
Evaluation will also include comfort features on 
body contact points. 

1 10 10 $110.00 $1,100.00 GUARDIAN FALL 
PROTECTION 37133-M-L $74.117650 $741.18 3M 840779-16115 $408.00 $4,080.00 3M DBI SALA 1402146 $77.32 $773.20 3M PROTECTA 1161550 $146.34 $1,463.40 1161205 1334415 $79.79 $797.90 FRENCH CREEK FRE650D-M

10

Full Body Harness – Large. Full body harness, 
polyester webbing, 420-425 lb. capacity rating, 
back & shoulder D-rings, tongue buckle leg 
straps. Must comply with ANSI/OSHA standards. 
Evaluation will also include comfort features on 
body contact points.

1 10 10 $110.00 $1,100.00 GUARDIAN FALL 
PROTECTION 37133-M-L $74.117650 $741.18 3M 840779-16115 $408.00 $4,080.00 3M DBI SALA 1402147 $77.32 $773.20 3M PROTECTA 1161550 $146.34 $1,463.40 1161205 1334415 $79.79 $797.90 FRENCH CREEK FRE650D-L

11

Full Body Harness –Extra-Large 1X. Full body 
harness, polyester webbing, 420-425 lb. capacity 
rating, back & shoulder D-rings, tongue buckle leg 
straps. Must comply with ANSI/OSHA standards. 
Evaluation will also include comfort features on 
body contact points.

1 10 10 $115.00 $1,150.00 GUARDIAN FALL 
PROTECTION 37134-XL-2X2 $74.117650 $741.18 3M 840779-16119 $408.00 $4,080.00 3M DBI SALA 1402148 $77.32 $773.20 3M PROTECTA 1161551 $146.34 $1,463.40 1161207 1334417 $83.78 $837.80 FRENCH CREEK FRE650D-XL

12

Full Body Harness – Extra-large 2X. Full body 
harness, polyester webbing, 420-425 lb. capacity 
rating, back & shoulder D-rings, tongue buckle leg 
straps. Must comply with ANSI/OSHA standards. 
Evaluation will also include comfort features on 
body contact points.

1 10 10 $115.00 $1,150.00 GUARDIAN FALL 
PROTECTION 37134-XL-2XL $80.470590 $804.71 3M 840779-16121 $408.00 $4,080.00 3M DBI SALA 1402149 $83.95 $839.50 3M PROTECTA 1161552 $158.76 $1,587.60 1161208 1334418 $87.97 $879.70 FRENCH CREEK FRE650-2XL

13

Full Body Harness – Extra-large and 3X. Full body 
harness, polyester webbing, 420-425 lb. capacity 
rating, back & shoulder D-rings, tongue buckle leg 
straps. Must comply with ANSI/OSHA standards. 
Evaluation will also include comfort features on 
body contact points.

1 10 10 $115.00 $1,150.00 GUARDIAN FALL 
PROTECTION 371353XL $450.86 $4,508.60 3M DBI SALA 1113014 NO BID $92.14 $921.40 1161545 1334531 $92.36 $923.60 FRENCH CREEK FRE650D-3XL

14

Full Body Harness – Extra-large and 4X. Full body 
harness, polyester webbing, 420-425 lb. capacity 
rating, back & shoulder D-rings, tongue buckle leg 
straps. Must comply with ANSI/OSHA standards. 
Evaluation will also include comfort features on 
body contact points.

1 10 10 N/A $455.00 $4,550.00 HONEYWELL 
MILLER AC-QC-BDP/4XLGN NO BID $92.14 $921.40 1161545 1334531 $96.99 $969.90 FRENCH CREEK FRE650D-4X

15

Full Body Harness – Extra-large and 5X. Full body 
harness, polyester webbing, 420-425 lb. capacity 
rating, back & shoulder D-rings, tongue buckle leg 
straps. Must comply with ANSI/OSHA standards. 
Evaluation will also include comfort features on 
body contact points.

1 10 10 N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO 5XAVAILABLE NO 5X AVAILABLE $104.30 $1,043.00 FRENCH CREEK FRE650D-5X

16
Lanyard 25 ft safety rope snap loop ends. Miller – 
no substitutions 1 95 95 $90.00 $8,550.00 MILLER 300LZ7-25FTBL $74.810000 $7,106.95 3M 612230-98516 $95.67 $9,088.65 HONEYWELL 

MILLER
198RLS-2-

Z7/25FTWH $100.23 $9,521.85 MILLER 198RLS-2-Z7/25FTWH $195.80 $18,601.00 213WLS-Z7/25FTYL 1078250 $49.95 $4,745.25 MILLER 410-25

17
Dust Mask with exhale valve – must meet NIOSH 
N95 standard 1 250 250 $15.00 $3,750.00 3M 8210V $4.670588 $1,167.65 3M 051141-90282 $2.53 $632.50 3M 9211 $1.17 $292.50 CORDOVA DM10V $1.80 $450.00 50051131497110 99406922 $2.51 $627.50 3M 8511

18

Particulate filter 3M 2091 NIOSH approved P100 - 
two in a pack.  2 100 200 $8.50 $1,700.00 3M 2091 $7.303294 $1,460.66 3M 051131-07000 $4.43 $886.00 3M 2091 $7.61 $1,522.00 3M 2091 $9.59 $1,918.00 50051131070009 1001883 $8.73 $1,746.00 3M 2091

19
Respirator 3M 6100 or equal – dual element with 
interchangeable filters.  Face piece only 1 12 12 $15.50 $186.00 3M 6100 $13.642940 $163.72 3M 051181-07024 $16.57 $198.84 3M 6100 $14.21 $170.52 3M 6100 $17.02 $204.24 50051131070245 1001891 $16.75 $201.00 3M 6100

20
Respirator 3M 6200 or equal– dual element with 
interchangeable filters.  Face piece only 1 24 24 $15.50 $372.00 3M 62006300 $13.642940 $327.43 3M 051131-07025 $16.57 $397.68 3M 6200 $14.21 $341.04 3M 6200 $17.02 $408.48 50051131070252 1001892 $16.75 $402.00 3M 69200

21
Respirator 3M 6300 or equal – dual element with 
interchangeable filters.  Face piece only 1 36 36 $15.50 $558.00 3M 7003 $13.642940 $491.15 MAGIC 051131-07026 $16.57 $596.52 3M 6300 $14.21 $511.56 3M 6300 $17.06 $614.16 50051131070269 1001893 $16.75 $603.00 3M 6300

22 Respirator cleaning wipes (box of 100) 1 20 20 $26.50 $530.00 HONEYWELL H6A/V $4.705882 $94.12 3M ST100DN $0.59 $11.80 3M 504 $6.27 $125.40 PYRAMEX HCW100 $6.00 $120.00 1048161 1048161 $6.00 $120.00 RADIANS RADRWAF-100

23
Ear muff – 3M 330-3001 ear #1000 or equal

1 75 75 $18.75 $1,406.25 3M H6A/V $15.237180 $1,142.79 3M 093045-08061 $18.50 $1,387.50 3M H6/A/V $19.66 $1,474.50 3M 330-3001 $12.25 $918.75 LS0100CS 99975103 $22.25 $1,668.75 3M H6A/V

24 Ear muff, Aearo E.A.R. Model 1000 Muff NRR 
20db or equal 1 150 150 $18.75 $2,812.50 3M QD-30RC $15.237180 $2,285.58 SPERTAN 033552-005889 $18.50 $2,775.00 3M H6/A/V $7.54 $1,131.00 HONEYWELL QM-24 $12.25 $1,837.50 LS0100CS 99975103 $9.52 $1,428.00 QM24PLUS

25
Ear-plug corded – 26dB – Sperian qd-30rc or 
equal. 50 560 28000 $85.00 $47,600.00 HOWARD LEICHT SB1820ST $53.241180 $1,490,753.04 PYRAMEX SB1820ST $27.91 $781,480.00 HONEYWELL LPF-30 $64.43 $1,804,040.00 HONEYWELL QD-30RC $0.21 $5,880.00 920097935 920097935 $29.00 $812,000.00 HOWARD LEIGHT HOWMAX-30

26

Safety Glasses – Black frames with gray anti-fog 
lens (SB1820ST).Pyramex Venture II or equal.  
Must meet ANSI Z87 + standard. 

1 400 400 $3.50 $1,400.00 PYRAMER SB1810ST $3.035294 $1,214.12 PYRAMEX SB1880ST $3.69 $1,476.00 PYRAMEX SB1820ST $2.87 $1,148.00 PYRAMEX 4800B-AFGY $4.13 $1,652.00 SB1820ST 91001502 $2.60 $1,040.00 GWP SGRIVALGREYA/F $5.00 $2,000.00 PYRATEX SB1820ST

27

Safety Glasses – Black frames with clear mirror 
lens. 4800B-AFGY.Pyramex Venture II equal.    
Must meet ANSI Z87 + standard. 1 450 450 $3.05 $1,372.50 PYRAMER 6205 $3.035294 $1,365.88 PIP 616314-02660 $2.76 $1,242.00 PYRAMEX SB1810S $2.38 $1,071.00 PYRAMEX 4800B-AFC $4.13 $1,858.50 4800B-AFGY 91001500 $2.60 $1,170.00 GWP SCRIVALI/O

28
Safety goggles all safe-g211-13sg/10115 or equal

1 60 60 $1.20 $72.00 PYRAMER RV23110/XL $2.458824 $147.53 PIP 616314-71317 $2.19 $131.40 MCR 2230R $1.58 $94.80 PYRAMEX G205ST $1.98 $118.80 1008341 1008341 $2.05 $123.00 MCR MCR2220

29

Safety Vests with reflectorized vertical stripes. 
(1X) Must meet ANSI/ISEA 107-2010; class 3/level 
2 Color: high visibility yellow. 1 100 100 $8.50 $850.00 PYRAMER RV23110/2XL $6.682353 $668.24 PIP 616314-71256 $11.94 $1,194.00 RADIANS SV272-3ZGM-XL $7.98 $798.00 PYRAMEX RVZ3110-XL $10.00 $1,000.00 22025 1014616 $9.51 $951.00 CORDOVA CORV3001-XL

30

Safety Vests with reflectorized vertical stripes. 
(2X) Must meet ANSI/ISEA 107-2010; class 3/level 
2; Color: high visibility yellow. 1 50 50 $8.50 $425.00 PYRAMER RVZ311013XL $6.682353 $334.12 PIP 616314-71263 $11.94 $597.00 RADIANS SV272-3ZGM-2X $7.98 $399.00 PYRAMEX RVZ3110-2X $10.00 $500.00 22027 1014617 $9.51 $475.50 CORDOVA CORV3001-2XL

31
Safety Vests with reflectorized vertical stripes. 
(3X) Must meet ANSI/ISEA 107-2010; class 3/level 
2; Color: high visibility yellow.

1 50 50 $8.50 $425.00 PYRAMER RV23110/4XL $6.682353 $334.12 PIP 616314-71270 $11.94 $597.00 RADIANS SV272-32GM-3X $7.98 $399.00 PYRAMEX RVZ3110-3X $10.00 $500.00 22027 1014617 $9.51 $475.50 CORDOVA CORV3001-3XL

32

Safety Vests with reflectorized vertical stripes. 
(4X) Must meet ANSI/ISEA 107-2010; class 3/level 
2; Color: high visibility yellow.

1 15 15 $8.50 $127.50 PYRAMER RV23110/4XL $6.682353 $100.24 PIP 616814-71317 $11.94 $179.10 RADIANS SV272-32GM-4X $7.98 $119.70 PYRAMEX RVZ3110-4X $10.00 $150.00 22029 1014618 $9.51 $142.65 CORDOVA CORV3001-4XL

33

Safety Vests with reflectorized vertical stripes. 
(5X) Must meet ANSI/ISEA 107-2010; class 3/level 
2; color: high visibility yellow.

1 7 7 $8.50 $59.50 PYRAMER RV23110/5X $6.682353 $46.78 PIP 616314-71287 $11.94 $83.58 RADIANS SV272-3ZGM-5X $7.98 $55.86 PYRAMEX RVZ23110-5X $10.00 $70.00 22029 1014618 $9.51 $66.57 CORDOVA CORV3001-5XL

34

Rain-suit combined as a set in a fluorescent lime-
green bag. Set to be defined as a jacket, bib 
overall & carry bag. Small. Tingley Part numbers. 
Jacket; J53122, Bib overall: O53122, Bag: B53102

1 20 20 $84.00 $1,680.00 TINGLEY J53122053122B5310
2SMALL

$70.988240 $1,419.76 TINGLEY 053122-S $86.20 $1,724.00 TINGLEY J53122.SM/053122.S
M/B53102.UN $76.57 $1,531.40 TINGLEY J53122.SM/053122.S

M/B53102.UN $96.00 $1,920.00 J53122KIT BSSSM $86.15 $1,723.00 TINGLEY TIN22174-SM $89.00 $1,780.00 TINGLEY

35

Rain-suit combined as a set in a fluorescent lime-
green bag. Set to be defined as a jacket, bib 
overall & carry bag. Medium.Tingley Part 
numbers. Jacket; J53122, Bib overall: O53122, 
Bag: B53102

1 40 40 $84.00 $3,360.00 PYRAMER J53122053122B5310
2MED $70.988240 $2,839.53 TINGLEY 053122-MD $86.20 $3,448.00 TINGLEY J53122.MD/053122.

MD/B53102.UN $76.57 $3,062.80 TINGLEY J53122.MD/053122.
MD/B53102.UN $96.00 $3,840.00 J53122KIT BSSMD $86.15 $3,446.00 TINGLEY TIN22174-MED $89.00 $3,560.00 TINGLEY

36

Rain-suit combined as a set in a fluorescent lime-
green bag. Set to be defined as a jacket, bib 
overall & carry bag. Large.Tingley Part numbers. 
Jacket; J53122, Bib overall: O53122, Bag: B53102

1 120 120 $84.00 $10,080.00 TINGLEY JF312205312285310
2L $70.988240 $8,518.59 TINGLEY 053122-LG $86.20 $10,344.00 TINGLEY J53122.G/053122.LG

/B53102.UN $76.57 $9,188.40 TINGLEY J53122.G/053122.LG
/B53102.UN $96.00 $11,520.00 J53122KIT BSSLG $86.15 $10,338.00 TINGLEY TN22174-L $89.00 $10,680.00 TINGLEY

37

Rain-suit combined as a set in a fluorescent lime-
green bag. Set to be defined as a jacket, bib 
overall & carry bag. X-Large.Tingley Part 
numbers. Jacket; J53122, Bib overall: O53122, 
Bag: B53102

1 100 100 $84.00 $8,400.00 TINGLEY JF53122053122B531
02XL $70.988240 $7,098.82 TINGLEY 053122-XL $86.20 $8,620.00 TINGLEY J53122.XL/053122.X

L/B53102.UN $76.57 $7,657.00 TINGLEY J53122.XL/053122.X
L/B53102.UN $96.00 $9,600.00 K53122KIT BSSXL $86.15 $8,615.00 TINGLEY TIN22174-01 $95.00 $9,500.00 TINGLEY

38

Rain-suit combined as a set in a fluorescent lime-
green bag. Set to be defined as a jacket, bib 
overall & carry bag. XX-Large.Tingley Part 
numbers. Jacket; J53122, Bib overall: O53122, 
Bag: B53102

1 75 75 $87.00 $6,525.00 TINGLEY JF3122053122B5310
2XXL $73.105880 $5,482.94 TINGLEY 053122-2X $88.77 $6,657.75 TINGLEY J53122.2X/053122.2

X/B53102.UN $78.85 $5,913.75 TINGLEY J53122.2X/053122.2
X/B53102.UN $96.00 $7,200.00 J53122KIT BSS2X $88.75 $6,656.25 TINGLEY TIN22174-02 $95.00 $7,125.00 TINGLEY

39

Rain-suit combined as a set in a fluorescent lime-
green bag. Set to be defined as a jacket, bib 
overall & carry bag. 3X-LargeTingley Part 
numbers. Jacket; J53122, Bib overall: O53122, 
Bag: B53102

1 100 100 $87.00 $8,700.00 TINGLEY J53122053122B5310
23XL $73.105880 $7,310.59 TINGLEY 053122-3X $88.77 $8,877.00 TINGLEY J53122.3X/053122.3

X/B853102.UN $78.85 $7,885.00 TINGLEY J53122.3X/053122.3
X/B853102.UN $96.00 $9,600.00 J53122KIT BSS3X $88.75 $8,875.00 TINGLEY TIN22174-03 $95.00 $9,500.00 TINGLEY

40

Rain-suit combined as a set in a fluorescent lime-
green bag. Set to be defined as a jacket, bib 
overall & carry bag. 4X-Large.Tingley Part 
numbers. Jacket; J53122, Bib overall: O53122, 
Bag: B53102

1 20 20 $87.00 $1,740.00 TINGLEY J53122053122B5310
24XL

$73.105880 $1,462.12 TINGLEY 053122-4X $88.77 $1,775.40 TINGLEY J53122.4X/053122.4
X/B853102.UN $78.85 $1,577.00 TINGLEY J53122.4X/053122.4

X/B853102.UN $96.00 $1,920.00 J53122KIT BSS4X $88.75 $1,775.00 TINGLEY TIN22174-04 $95.00 $1,900.00 TINGLEY

41

Rain-suit combined as a set in a fluorescent lime-
green bag. Set to be defined as a jacket, bib 
overall & carry bag. 5x-LargeTingley Part 
numbers. Jacket; J53122, Bib overall: O53122, 
Bag: B53102

1 50 50 $87.00 $4,350.00 TINGLEY J53122053122B5310
25XL $73.105880 $3,655.29 TINGLEY 053122-5X $88.77 $4,438.50 TINGLEY J53122.5X/053122.5

X/B583102.UN $78.85 $3,942.50 TINGLEY J53122.5X/053122.5
X/B583102.UN $96.00 $4,800.00 J53122KIT BSS5X $88.75 $4,437.50 TINGLEY TIN22174-05 $95.00 $4,750.00 TINGLEY

42

Rain-suit combined as a set in a fluorescent lime-
green bag. Set to be defined as a jacket, bib 
overall & carry bag. 6x-LargeTingley Part 
numbers. Jacket; J53122, Bib overall: O53122, 
Bag: B53102

1 5 5 N/A NO BID $88.77 $443.85 TINGLEY J53122.6X/053122./6
X/B53102.UN NO BID NO BID NO 6XL AVAILABLE $88.75 $443.75 TINGLEY TIN22174-06 $100.00 $500.00 TINGLEY

43 Boot Liner size small fits 5-7.  Servus #28000 or 
equal, pair 1 Pr 2 2 $20.00 $40.00 SERVUS 28000/SM $14.705880 $29.41 SERVUS 28000SZSM $17.86 $35.72 ROCKY BRANDS 2800-SM $18.70 $37.40 SERVUS 28000S $19.69 $39.38 2800-TNM-SML 1300441 $25.20 $50.40 ORS NASCO RAN28000-S $20.00 $40.00 SERVUS 28000

44 Boot Liner size medium fits 8-9.  Servus #28000 
or equal, pair 1 Pr 35 35 $20.00 $700.00 SERVUS 28000/ME $14.705880 $514.71 SERVUS 2800SMMD $17.86 $625.10 ROCKY BRANDS 2800-MD $18.70 $654.50 SERVUS 28000M $19.69 $689.15 2800-TNM-MED 1300440 $25.20 $882.00 ORS NASCO RAN28000-M $20.00 $700.00 SERVUS 28000

45 Boot Liner size large fits 10-11.  Servus #28000 or 
equal, pair 1 Pr 85 85 $20.00 $1,700.00 SERVUS 28000/LG $14.705880 $1,250.00 SERVUS 2800SZLG $17.86 $1,518.10 ROCKY BRANDS 2800-LG $18.70 $1,589.50 SERVUS 28000L $19.69 $1,673.65 2800-TNM-LG 1300439 $25.20 $2,142.00 ORS NASCO RAN28000-L $20.00 $1,700.00 SERVUS 28000

46 Boot Liner size X-Large fits 12-13.Servus #28000 
or equal, pair. 1 Pr 45 45 $20.00 $900.00 SERVUS 28000/XL $14.705880 $661.76 SERVUS 2800SZXL $17.86 $803.70 ROCKY BRANDS 2800-XL $18.70 $841.50 SERVUS 28000XL $19.69 $886.05 2800-TNM-1XL 1300437 $25.20 $1,134.00 ORS NASCO RAN28000-XL $20.00 $900.00 SERVUS 28000

47 Knee Boots, Size 5 Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 5 5 $36.00 $180.00 DUNLOP 896820005 $28.388240 $141.94 ONGUARD 791079-15058 $34.47 $172.35 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $75.90 TINGLEY 4202-5 $28.55 $142.75 43151.05 921820602 $20.70 $103.50 ORS NASCO RAN18821-5

48 Knee Boots, Size 6.Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 5 5 $36.00 $180.00 DUNLOP 896820006 $28.388240 $141.94 ONGUARD 791079-15059 $34.47 $172.35 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $75.90 TINGLEY 4202-6 $21.84 $109.20 VBP1206 1327263 $20.70 $103.50 ORS NASCO RAN18821-6

49 Knee Boots, Size 7.Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 5 5 $36.00 $180.00 DUNLOP 896820007 $28.388240 $141.94 ONGUARD 791079-15010 $34.47 $172.35 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $75.90 TINGLEY 4202-7 $21.84 $109.20 VBP1207 1327264 $20.70 $103.50 ORS NASCO RAN18821-7

50 Knee Boots, Size 8.Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 20 20 $36.00 $720.00 DUNLOP 896820008 $28.388240 $567.76 ONGUARD 791079-15061 $34.47 $689.40 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $303.60 TINGLEY 4202-8 $21.84 $436.80 VBP1208 1327265 $20.70 $414.00 ORS NASCO RAN18821-8

51 Knee Boots, Size 9.Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 50 50 $36.00 $1,800.00 DUNLOP 896820009 $28.388240 $1,419.41 ONGUARD 791079-15862 $34.47 $1,723.50 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $759.00 TINGLEY 4202-9 $21.84 $1,092.00 VBP1209 1327266 $20.70 $1,035.00 ORS NASCO RAN18821-9

52 Knee Boots, Size 10.Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 70 70 $36.00 $2,520.00 DUNLOP 896820010 $28.388240 $1,987.18 ONGUARD 791079-15063 $34.47 $2,412.90 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $1,062.60 TINGLEY 4202-10 $21.84 $1,528.80 VBP1210 1327259 $20.70 $1,449.00 ORS NASCO RAN18821-10

53 Knee Boots, Size 11.Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 75 75 $36.00 $2,700.00 DUNLOP 896820011 $28.388240 $2,129.12 ONGUARD 791079-15064 $34.47 $2,585.25 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $1,138.50 TINGLEY 4202-11 $21.84 $1,638.00 VBP12011 1327260 $20.70 $1,552.50 ORS NASCO RAN18821-11

54 Knee Boots, Size 12.Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 60 60 $36.00 $2,160.00 DUNLOP 896820012 $28.388240 $1,703.29 ONGUARD 791079-15065 $34.47 $2,068.20 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $910.80 TINGLEY 4202-12 $22.71 $1,362.60 VBP1212 1327261 $20.70 $1,242.00 ORS NASCO RAN18821-12

55 Knee Boots, Size 13.Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 45 45 $36.00 $1,620.00 DUNLOP 896820013 $28.388240 $1,277.47 ONGUARD 791079-15066 $34.47 $1,551.15 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $683.10 TINGLEY 4202-13 $22.71 $1,021.95 VPB12013 1327262 $20.70 $931.50 ORS NASCO RAN18821-13

56 Knee Boots, Size 14Onguard Number 89682 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 20 20 $36.00 $720.00 DUNLOP 896820014 $28.388240 $567.76 ONGUARD 791079-15067 $34.47 $689.40 DUNLOP 89682 $15.18 $303.60 TINGLEY 4202-14 $35.98 $719.60 89682.14 99876748 $20.70 $414.00 ORS NASCO RAN18821-14

57 Hip Boots, Size 6.Rainfair Number 24009091 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 5 5 $99.00 $495.00 LACROSSE 2400909106 $129.49 $647.45 DUNLOP 86856 $65.53 $327.65 CORDOVA 7802-6 $76.39 $381.95 2400-9091-6 1019992 $78.25 $391.25 CORDOVA CORBHS-6

58 Hip Boots, Size 7.Rainfair Number 24009091 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 5 5 $99.00 $495.00 LACROSSE 2400909107 $60.564710 $302.82 PIP 728746-23166 $129.49 $647.45 DUNLOP 86856 $65.53 $327.65 CORDOVA 7802-7 $105.00 $525.00 7942-7 1045118 $78.25 $391.25 CORDOVA CORBHS-7

59 Hip Boots, Size 8.Rainfair Number 24009091 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 20 20 $99.00 $1,980.00 LACROSSE 2400909108 $60.564710 $1,211.29 PIP 728746-23180 $129.49 $2,589.80 DUNLOP 86856 $65.53 $1,310.60 CORDOVA 7802-8 $105.00 $2,100.00 7942-8 1045119 $78.25 $1,565.00 CORDOVA CORBHS-8

60 Hip Boots, Size 9.Rainfair Number 24009091 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 50 50 $99.00 $4,950.00 LACROSSE 2400909109 $60.564710 $3,028.24 PIP 728746-23128 $129.49 $6,474.50 DUNLOP 86856 $65.53 $3,276.50 CORDOVA 7802-9 $105.00 $5,250.00 7942-9 1045120 $78.25 $3,912.50 CORDOVA CORBHS-9

61 Hip Boots, Size 10.Rainfair Number 24009091 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 70 70 $99.00 $6,930.00 LACROSSE 249091010 $60.564710 $4,239.53 PIP 728746-12135 $129.49 $9,064.30 DUNLOP 86856 $65.53 $4,587.10 CORDOVA 7802-10 $105.00 $7,350.00 7942-10 1045121 $78.25 $5,477.50 CORDOVA CORBHS-10

62 Hip Boots, Size 11.Rainfair Number 24009091 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 75 75 $99.00 $7,425.00 LACROSSE 24909111 $60.564710 $4,542.35 PIP 728746-23142 $129.49 $9,711.75 DUNLOP 86856 $65.53 $4,914.75 CORDOVA 7802-11 $105.00 $7,875.00 7942-11 1045122 $78.25 $5,868.75 CORDOVA CORBHS-11

63 Hip Boots, Size 12.Rainfair Number 24009091 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 60 60 $99.00 $5,940.00 LACROSSE 2400909112 $60.564710 $3,633.88 PIP 728746-23159 $129.49 $7,769.40 DUNLOP 86856 $65.53 $3,931.80 CORDOVA 7802-12 $105.00 $6,300.00 7942-12 1045123 $78.25 $4,695.00 CORDOVA CORBHS-12

64 Hip Boots, Size 13.Rainfair Number 24009091 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 45 45 $99.00 $4,455.00 LACROSSE 2400909113 $60.564710 $2,725.41 PIP 728746-23713 $129.49 $5,827.05 DUNLOP 86856 $65.53 $2,948.85 CORDOVA 7802-13 $105.00 $4,725.00 7942-13 1045124 $78.25 $3,521.25 CORDOVA CORBHS-13

65 Hip Boots, Size 14.Rainfair Number 24009091 or 
equivalent 1 Pr 20 20 $99.00 $1,980.00 LACROSSE 2400909114 $60.564710 $1,211.29 PIP 728746-23104 $129.49 $2,589.80 DUNLOP 86856 $65.53 $1,310.60 CORDOVA 7802-14 $105.00 $2,100.00 7942-14 1045125 $78.25 $1,565.00 CORDOVA CORBHS-14

66 Shoe Studs – Stud type. Servus brand SR101 or 
equal; Size: Small/Medium. Women’s. 1 15 15 $24.00 $360.00 IMPACTO STRIPE20 $10.88 $163.20 GLOBAL IRT3610SM $25.79 $386.85 IMPACTO STIDE20 NO BID $15.43 $231.45 16753 1014412 $24.38 $365.70 ERGODYNE ERG16753

67 Shoe Studs – Stud type. Servus brand SR101or 
equal;Sizes: large. Women’s. 1 15 15 $24.00 $360.00 IMPACTO STRIDE40L $10.88 $163.20 GLOBAL ITR3610MED $25.79 $386.85 IMPACTO STRIDE30 NO BID $15.43 $231.45 16754 1014413 $24.38 $365.70 ERGODYNE ERG16754

68 Shoe Studs – Stud type. Servus brand SR101or 
equal. Sizes: X-large. Women’s. 1 10 10 $24.00 $240.00 IMPACTO STRIDE50XL $10.88 $108.80 GLOBAL ITR2510LRG $25.79 $257.90 IMPACTO STRIDE30 NO BID $15.43 $154.30 16755 1014414 $24.38 $243.80 ERGODYNE ERG16755

69
Shoe Studs – Stud type. Servus brand SR101 or 
equal. Sizes: small/ medium. Men’s. 1 15 15 $24.00 $360.00 IMPACTO STRIDE20 OR 30 

S/M
$10.882350 $163.24 GLOBAL GLOVE ITR3610MD $18.93 $283.95 ERGODYNE 16773 NO BID $15.43 $231.45 16753 1014412 $24.38 $365.70 ERGODYNE ERG16753

70
Shoe Studs – Stud type. Servus brand SR101 or 
equal. Sizes: Large. Men’s. 1 25 25 $24.00 $600.00 IMPACTO STRIDE40L $10.882350 $272.06 GLOBAL GLOVE ITR3610LG $18.93 $473.25 ERGODYNE 16774 NO BID $15.43 $385.75 16754 1014413 $24.38 $609.50 ERGODYNE ERG16754

71
Shoe Studs – Stud type. Servus brand SR101 or 
equal. Sizes: X-Large. Men’s. 1 15 15 $24.00 $360.00 IMPACTO STRIDE50XL $10.882350 $163.24 GLOBAL GLOVE ITR2510XL $18.93 $283.95 ERGODYNE 16775 NO BID $15.43 $231.45 16755 1014414 $24.38 $365.70 ERGODYNE ERG16755
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City of Tulsa TAC 443F Senior Buyer: Donny Tiemann
Purchasing Department Safety Supplies dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Water & Sewer Department please contact
Tulsa, OK  74103 Date: February 16, 2023

1. Delivery: 

If Your Bid is Accepted, state the number of Days You need to deliver the Supplies and/or to begin providing Services:

2. Pricing

No. Description
Pkg Qty Qty of 

Pkgs
Est. Total 

Annual Qty Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number Price Each Extended Cost Manufacturer Part Number

Mini Wing USAFASTENAL COMPANY TRANSCO SUPPLY CO. INC

You must be able to deliver the Supplies and/or Services as specified in Your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating the Agreement and pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well 
as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

SAF-T-GLOVEHard Hat Safety and Glove LLC R. S. HUGHES COMPANY INC. Anixter Inc.Section 1: First Aid Items

72
Shoe Studs – Stud type. Servus brand SR101 or 
equal. Sizes: XX- Large. Men’s. 1 10 10 $28.00 $280.00 SERVUS SR101-BLM-2XL $10.882350 $108.82 GLOBAL GLOVE ITR3610XL $18.93 $189.30 ERGODYNE 16775 NO BID $13.52 $135.20 16756 99894653 $24.38 $243.80 ERGODYNE ERG1676

73
White Disposable Protective Coveralls (box of 25) 
Size Medium TY120SWHMD002500 Tyvek or 
equal

25 1 25 $140.00 $3,500.00 DUPONT TY120MED $119.764700 $2,994.12 DUPONT TY1205MD $145.43 $3,635.75 DUPONT TY120SWHM002500 $90.00 $2,250.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC412M $2.27 $56.75 1050109 1050109 $86.15 $2,153.75 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA412-M $284.00 $7,100.00 TYVEK

74
White Disposable Protective Coveralls (box of 25) 
Size Large TY120SWHLG002500 Tyvek or equal 25 2 50 $140.00 $7,000.00 DUPONT TY120L $119.764700 $5,988.24 DUPONT TY1205L $145.43 $7,271.50 DUPONT TY120SWHLG00250

0 $90.00 $4,500.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC412L $2.27 $113.50 1050110 1050110 $86.15 $4,307.50 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA412-L $284.00 $14,200.00 TYVEK

75
White Disposable Protective Coveralls (box of 25) 
Size X-large TY120SWHXL002500 Tyvek or equal 25 3 75 $140.00 $10,500.00 DUPONT TY120XL $119.764700 $8,982.35 DUPONT TY1205XL $145.43 $10,907.25 DUPONT TY120SWHXL00250

0 $90.00 $6,750.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC412XL $2.03 $152.25 1050111 1050111 $86.15 $6,461.25 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA412-XL $284.00 $21,300.00 TYVEK

76
White Disposable Protective Coveralls (box of 25) 
Size 2X-large TY120SWH2X002500 Tyvek or 
equal

25 2 50 $150.00 $7,500.00 DUPONT TY1202XL $126.929400 $6,346.47 DUPONT TY12052XL $154.13 $7,706.50 DUPONT TY120SWHXL00250
0 $90.00 $4,500.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC412-2XL $2.15 $107.50 1050112 1050112 $86.15 $4,307.50 LAKELAND LAK-MINSA412-2XL $290.00 $14,500.00 TYVEK

77
White Disposable Protective Coveralls (box of 25) 
Size 3X-large TY120SWH3X002500 Tyvek or 
equal

25 1 25 $160.00 $4,000.00 DUPONT TY1203XL $134.564700 $3,364.12 DUPONT TY1203XL $163.40 $4,085.00 DUPONT TY120SWH3X00250
0 $90.00 $2,250.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC412-3XL $3.78 $94.50 1050113 1050113 $90.46 $2,261.50 LAKELAND LAK-MINSA412-3XL $292.00 $7,300.00 TYVEK

78

White Disposable Protective Coveralls (box of 25) 
Size 4X-large TY120SWH4X002500 Tyvek or 
equal

25 1 25 $170.00 $4,250.00 DUPONT TY1204XL $145.317600 $3,632.94 DUPONT TY1204XL $176.46 $4,411.50 DUPONT TY120SWH4X00250
0 $90.00 $2,250.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC412-4XL $2.76 $69.00 1050114 1050114 $94.98 $2,374.50 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA412-4XL $292.00 $7,300.00 TYVEK

79

White Disposable Protective Coveralls (box of 25) 
Size 5X-large TY120SWH5X002500 Tyvek or 
equal 25 1 25 $189.00 $4,725.00 DUPONT TY1205XL $156.917600 $3,922.94 DUPONT TY1205XL $190.54 $4,763.50 DUPONT TY120SWH5X00250

0 $90.00 $2,250.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC412-5XL $3.05 $76.25 PB120SWH5X002500 1047398 $99.74 $2,493.50 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA412-5X $389.00 $9,725.00 TYVEK

80
White Disposable Protective Coveralls w/ Hoods 
(box of 25) Size Medium TD127SWBMD0025CM 
Tyvek or equal

25 1 25 $160.00 $4,000.00 DUPONT TY127M $135.011800 $3,375.30 DUPONT TY127M $163.94 $4,098.50 DUPONT TD127SWBMD0025
CM $97.62 $2,440.50 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC428M $2.55 $63.75 1050121 1050121 $104.43 $2,610.75 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA428-M $309.00 $7,725.00 TYVEK

81
White Disposable Protective Coveralls w/ Hoods 
(box of 25) Size Large TD127SWBLG0025CM 
Tyvek or equal

25 2 50 $160.00 $8,000.00 DUPONT TY127L $135.011800 $6,750.59 DUPONT TY127L $163.94 $8,197.00 DUPONT TD127SWBLG0025C
M $97.62 $4,881.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC428L $2.55 $127.50 1050122 1050122 $104.43 $5,221.50 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA428-L $309.00 $15,450.00 TYVEK

82
White Disposable Protective Coveralls w/ Hoods 
(box of 25) Size X-large TD127SWBXL0025CM 
Tyvek or equal

25 3 75 $160.00 $12,000.00 DUPONT TY127XL $135.011800 $10,125.89 DUPONT TY127XL $163.94 $12,295.50 DUPONT TD127SWBXL0025C
M $97.62 $7,321.50 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC428XL $2.55 $191.25 1050123 1050123 $104.43 $7,832.25 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA428-XL $309.00 $23,175.00 TYVEK

83
White Disposable Protective Coveralls w/ Hoods 
(box of 25) Size 2X-large TD127SWB2X0025CM 
Tyvek or equal

25 2 50 $172.00 $8,600.00 DUPONT TY1272XL $143.082400 $7,154.12 DUPONT TY1272XL $173.74 $8,687.00 DUPONT TD127SWB2X0025C
M $97.62 $4,881.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC428-2XL $2.71 $135.50 1050124 1050124 $104.43 $5,221.50 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA428-2XL $325.00 $16,250.00 TYVEK

84
White Disposable Protective Coveralls w/ Hoods 
(box of 25) Size 3X-large TD127SWB3X0025CM 
Tyvek or equal

25 1 25 $180.00 $4,500.00 DUPONT TY1272XL $151.694100 $3,792.35 DUPONT TY1272XL $184.20 $4,605.00 DUPONT TD127SWB3X0025C
M $97.62 $2,440.50 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC428-3XL $2.87 $71.75 1050125 1050125 $109.66 $2,741.50 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA428-3XL $375.00 $9,375.00 TYVEK

85
White Disposable Protective Coveralls w/ Hoods 
(box of 25) Size 4X-large TD127SWB4X0025CM 
Tyvek or equal

25 1 25 $197.00 $4,925.00 DUPONT TY1274XL $163.823500 $4,095.59 DUPONT TY1274XL $198.93 $4,973.25 DUPONT TD127SWB4X0025C
M $97.62 $2,440.50 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC428-4XL $3.10 $77.50 1050126 1050126 $115.15 $2,878.75 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA428-4XL $425.00 $10,625.00 TYVEK

86
White Disposable Protective Coveralls w/ Hoods 
(box of 25) Size 5X-large TY127SWH5X002500 
Tyvek or equal

25 1 25 $229.00 $5,725.00 DUPONT TY1275XL $190.058800 $4,751.47 DUPONT TY1275XL $230.79 $5,769.75 DUPONT TY350SWHMD00500
0 $97.62 $2,440.50 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC428-5XL $3.47 $86.75 PB127SWH5X002500 1047440 $120.89 $3,022.25 LAKELAND LAK-MNSA428-5XL

87
White Disposable Protective Pants (box of 50) 
Size Medium TY350SWHMD005000 Tyvek or 
equal

50 1 50 $170.00 $8,500.00 DUPONT TY35M $141.411800 $7,070.59 DUPONT TY35M $171.71 $8,585.50 DUPONT TY350SWHLG00500
0 $105.00 $5,250.00 PIP 3616M $3.67 $183.50 TY350SWHMD005000 1021526 $168.25 $8,412.50 LAKELAND LAK-CTL301-M $279.00 $13,950.00 TYVEK

88
White Disposable Protective Pants (box of 50) 
Size Large TY350SWHLG005000 Tyvek or equal 50 2 100 $170.00 $17,000.00 DUPONT TY35L $141.411800 $14,141.18 DUPONT TY35L $171.71 $17,171.00 DUPONT TY350SWHLXL0050

00 $105.00 $10,500.00 PIP 3616L $3.67 $367.00 TY350SWHMD005000 1021525 $168.25 $16,825.00 LAKELAND LAK-CTL301-L $279.00 $27,900.00 TYVEK

89
White Disposable Protective Pants (box of 50) 
Size X-large TY350SWHXL005000 Tyvek or equal 50 3 150 $170.00 $25,500.00 DUPONT TY352XL $141.411800 $21,211.77 DUPONT TY352XL $171.71 $25,756.50 DUPONT TY350SWH2XL0050

00 $105.00 $15,750.00 PIP 3616XL $3.67 $550.50 TY350SWHXL005000 1021527 $168.25 $25,237.50 LAKELAND LAK-CTL301-XL $279.00 $41,850.00 TYVEK

90
White Disposable Protective Pants (box of 50) 
Size 2X-large TY350SWH2X005000 Tyvek or 
equal

50 2 100 $180.00 $18,000.00 DUPONT TY3532XL $149.917600 $14,991.76 DUPONT TY3532XL $182.04 $18,204.00 DUPONT TY350SWH3X00500
0 $105.00 $10,500.00 PIP 3616-2X $3.89 $389.00 TY350SWH2X005000 1021523 $168.25 $16,825.00 LAKELAND LAK-CTL301-2XL $326.00 $32,600.00 TYVEK

91
White Disposable Protective Pants (box of 50) 
Size 3X-large TY350SWH3X005000 Tyvek or 
equal

50 1 50 $190.00 $9,500.00 DUPONT TY353XL $158.894100 $7,944.71 DUPONT TY353XL $192.94 $9,647.00 DUPONT TY350SWH4X00500
0 $105.00 $5,250.00 PIP 3616-3XL $4.20 $210.00 TY350SWH3X005000 1021524 $176.62 $8,831.00 LAKELAND LAK-CTL301-3XL $358.00 $17,900.00 TYVEK

92
White Disposable Protective Pants (box of 50) 
Size 4X-large TY350SWH4X005000 Tyvek or 
equal

50 1 50 $205.00 $10,250.00 DUPONT TY354XL $171.588200 $8,579.41 DUPONT TY354XL $208.36 $10,418.00 DUPONT TY350SWH4X00500
0 $105.00 $5,250.00 PIP 3616-4XL $4.54 $227.00 TY350SWH3X005000 1093791 $185.49 $9,274.50 LAKELAND LAK-CTL301-4XL $358.00 $17,900.00 TYVEK

93
White Disposable Protective Pants (box of 50) 
Size 5X-large TY350SWH5X005000 Tyvek or 
equal

50 1 50 $219.00 $10,950.00 DUPONT TY3535XL $181.882400 $9,094.12 DUPONT TY3535XL $220.86 $11,043.00 DUPONT TY350SWH5X00500
0 $203.70 $10,185.00 DUPONT/TYVEK S13494439-

TY3505SWH5X $4.81 $240.50 TY350SWH4X005000 99159715 $194.75 $9,737.50 LAKELAND LAK-CTL301-5XL $382.00 $19,100.00 TYVEK

94 White Disposable Bouffant Cap (box of 250) Size 
Dia 21.5- inches IC729SWH0002500B Tyvek or 
equal

250 2 500 $216.00 $108,000.00 DUPONT 12729 $179.411800 $89,705.90 DUPONT IC729SWH0002500B $217.86 $108,930.00 DUPONT IC729SWH0002500B $190.01 $95,005.00 DUPONT/TYVEK D14246919/IC729SWH $0.96 $480.00 IC29SWH0002500B 1090638 $259.37 $129,685.00 DUPONT IC729SWH0002500B $440.00 $220,000.00 TYVEK

95 White Disposable Shoe Covers Slip Resistant 
(box of 200) Size Universal TY450SWH00020000 
Tyvek or equal

250 4 800 $89.00 $71,200.00 DUPONT TY45 UNIVERSAL $75.317650 $60,254.12 DUPONT TY450S $91.46 $73,168.00 DUPONT TY450SWH00020000
0 $35.00 $28,000.00 SAF-T-GLOVE MPC0404XL $0.50 $400.00 TY450SWH00020000 1030622 $137.05 $109,640.00 LAKELAND LAK-CTL901P $775.00 $620,000.00 TYVEK

$1,238,260.00

5 - 30 Days
Fixed 3%

5 Days 0 Days

Fastenal.com Safety Supplies Category 25% Discount
Cordova 20% Discount                                                                                       

PIP Products 20% Discount                                                                                                  
Lake Land 20% Discount

Fixed 5% Fixed 12%

$2,148,626.53 $156,993.36 $1,318,687.22

Catalog Names and Dates: HARD HAT SAFETY AND GLOVE TOP SELLER 15% DISCOUNT WWW.R.S.HUGHES.COM 10% Discount

$1,327,425.29$559,788.75 $1,904,422.90

Section 3: Personal Protection Sub Total

Delivery: 10 Days Upon Award5 - 10 Days 3 Weeks
Annual Price Adjustment: Fixed 4.8% Fixed 7% Fixed Not to Exceed 7% Fixed 3%
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