Tulsa

A New Kind of Energy:
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor

Tulsa, OK 74103

1. Delivery:

TAC 1212A

Water Fittings

Water & Sewer Department
Bid Date: September 30, 2021

Buyer: Shelley Crayton
scrayton@cityoftulsa.org

Please contact if you have any questions

If your Bid is accepted and an agreement is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your agreement or canceling the Purchase Order, pursuing

collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing

Bidder must include a manufacturers part number and price for each item listed in each section of exhibit A. Quantities listed are provided based on historical data and not necessarily what

will be purchased in the future.

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

Water Fittings Ferguson Waterworks Utility Supply Company Core & Main LP Fortiline, Inc. dba Fortiline Waterworks
ttem (SsEe':vSIcpeE:l:::::ﬁS\lsvl:ttﬁ ;In:;“) Estimate Yearly Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name and Part
1 Coupling C to C 3/4" (Nibco #600) 35 $1.63 $57.05 NIBCO 0399233G9044 $1.42 $49.70 NIBCO 600 $0.95 $33.25 BMI 37005 $1.20 $42.00 NIBCO 600
2 Service coupling 3/4” (Ford C44-33) 300 $14.87 $4,461.00 MUELLER P15403250N $17.51 $5,253.00 FORD METER BOX C44-33-NL. $14.65 $4,395.00 FORD C44-33 NL $16.48 $4,944.00 AY MCDONALD 74758-22
3 Brass Corporation Plug 5/8" (Mueller H10033) 25 $13.24 $331.00 MUELLER U10633200N $12.21 $305.25 FORD METER BOX CSP-2-A-NL $11.84 $296.00 FORD CSP-2-A-NL $14.12 $353.00 AY MCDONALD 73206
4 Curb Stop 3/4" full port (Muller B20283-3) 1800 $42.38 $76,284.00 MUELLER 0202833250N $45.17 $81,306.00 FORD METER BOX B11-33W-NL $43.76 $78,768.00 FORD B11-333-WR-NL $43.27 $77,886.00 AY MCDONALD 76111
5 Service Clamp 2" X 5/8" (S/B 311-025605)- Saddle 20 $14.54 $290.80 SMITH-BLAIR 31100025605000 $13.36 $267.20 SMITH-BLAIR 311-00025605-000 $13.95 $279.00 SMITH-BLAIR 311-025605 $19.05 $381.00 AY MCDONALD 76111
6 Service Clamp 2" X 3/4” (Mueller DE1A0235CC075)-Saddle 125 $10.28 $1,285.00 MUELLER DR1A0235CC075 $13.36 $1,670.00 SMITH-BLAIR 311-00025607-000 $13.95 $1,743.75 SMITH-BLAIR 311-025607 $19.05 $2,381.25 SMITH-BLAIR 31100025605
7 b o hvond (ena Lonzay ™! 1900 $12.89 $24,491.00 MUELLER 010892215N $12.07 $22,933.00 FORD METER BOX L38-23-NL $11.48 $21,812.00 FORD L37-23NL $12.15 $23,085.00 SMITH-BLAIR 31100025607
8 Meter Yoke (7" rise) 5/8” X 3/4" (Mueller B24118 1200 $103.71 $124,452.00 MUELLER 234B241180000N $81.34 $97,608.00 FORD METER BOX VB42-7W-NL $102.65 $123,180.00 FORD VB42-7W-FP-NL $104.63 $125,556.00 AY MCDONALD 74621
9 Meter Yoke (12" rise) 5/8" X 3/4" (MuellerB24118) 300 $109.76 $32,928.00 MUELLER 2388241180000N $84.98 $25,494.00 FORD METER BOX VB42-12W-NL | $107.65 $32,295.00 FORD VB42-12W-FP-NL $113.40 $34,020.00 AY MCDONALD 718-212XJ
10 Quarter Bend Coupling 5/8°X 3/4° X 3/4"(Mueller H1400) 100 $28.80 $2,880.00 MUELLER 014200215N $16.85 $1,685.00 FORD METER BOX L32-23-NL $16.10 $1,610.00 FORD L32-32NL $15.16 $1,516.00 AY MCDONALD 747835
1 Angle Meter Curb Stop 5/8" X 3/4" X 3/4” (Mueller B24255) 600 $60.69 $36,414.00 MUELLER 02455215N $36.77 $22,062.00 FORD METER BOX BA23-232W- $59.15 $35,490.00 FORD BA-23-332WNL $62.79 $37,674.00 AY MCDONALD 746028
12 Corporation Stop 3/4" X 3/4" (Mueller H15000) 350 $24.81 $8,683.50 MUELLER 015000250N $25.65 $8,977.50 FORD METER BOX F600-3-NL $24.40 $8,540.00 FORD F600-3NL $25.82 $9,037.00 AY MCDONALD 74701
13 Corporation Stop 5/8" X 3/4" (Mueller H15000) 150 $28.02 $4,203.00 MUELLER 015000203N $24.57 $3,685.50 FORD METER BOX F600-23-NL. $23.36 $3,504.00 FORD F600-23NL. $26.32 $3,948.00 AY MCDONALD 74701
14 |Quarter Bend Coupling 3/4" (Mueller H15068) 90 degrees. 400 $21.75 $8,700.00 MUELLER 015068250N $16.72 $6,688.00 FORD METER BOX L02-33-NL $15.95 $6,380.00 FORD L02-33NL $17.92 $7,168.00 AY MCDONALD 74776
15 Two Branch Connection 3/4° X 1 (Mueller H15340) 10 $39.21 $392.10 MUELLER 015340254N $30.67 $306.70 FORD METER BOX Y22-243-NL $32.00 $320.00 FORD Y22-243NL $81.65 $816.50 AY MCDONALD 708Y2CC
16 Three Part Union 3/4" (Mueller H-15400) 250 $13.68 $3,420.00 MUELLER 015400250 $17.37 $4,342.50 FORD METER BOX C22-33-NL. $13.52 $3,380.00 FORD C22-33NL $15.22 $3,805.00 AY MCDONALD 74758
17 Straight Coupling 3/4 (Mueller H15425) 50 $11.46 $573.00 MUELLER 015425250N $11.24 $562.00 FORD METER BOX C28-33-NL $10.71 $535.50 FORD C28-33NL $12.16 $608.00 AY MCDONALD 74753
18 Quarter Bend Coupling 5/8 x 3/4 (Mueller H15490) 125 $18.05 $2,256.25 MUELLER 015490203N $17.61 $2,201.25 FORD METER BOX L102-23-NL $16.80 $2,100.00 FORD L102-23 NL $18.92 $2,365.00 AY MCDONALD 74777
19 Quarter Bend Coupling 3/4 x 3/4 (Mueller H15490) 40 $25.60 $1,024.00 MUELLER 015490250N $16.87 $674.80 FORD METER BOX L102-33-NL $16.08 $643.20 FORD L28-33 NL. $18.09 $723.60 AY MCDONALD 74777
20 Quarter Bend Coupling 3/4” (Mueller H15530) 125 $12.02 $1,502.50 MUELLER 015530250 $12.05 $1,506.25 FORD METER BOX L28-33-NL $11.46 $1,432.50 FORD L28-33NL $12.99 $1,623.75 AY MCDONLAD 74779M
21 Brass Street ELL Elbow 90-Deg. 3/4" (BMI) 1900 $4.91 $9,329.00 MATCO B-ST9004LF $4.70 $8,930.00 MIDLAND INDUSTRIAL 44164LF $5.20 $9,880.00 BRECCO 400-100-01050 $5.80 $11,020.00 MATCO NORCA B-ST9004LF
22 STR Meter Coupling W/ Hole 3/4 X 2" (McDonald 4620) 35 - NO BID $8.41 $294.35 FORD METER BOX C38-23-2-NL. $8.12 $284.20 FORD C38-23-2NL $8.98 $314.30 AY MCDONALD 74620
23 STR Meter Coupling W/ Hole 3/4" X 2-1/2" (McDonald 4620) 30 - NO BID $8.41 $252.30 FORD METER BOX €38-23-2:5- $8.12 $243.60 FORD C38-23-2NL $8.98 $269.40 AY MCDONALD 74620
24 STR Meter Coupling W/ Hole 3/4" X 1-1/2" (McDonald 4620H) 30 - NO BID $9.56 $286.80 FORD METER BOX €38-23-1-5- $9.15 $274.50 FORD C1R-INL $10.21 $306.30 AY MCDONALD 74620H
ftem (Fs”e:lg::c:':canon "Wfitting MB") Estimate Annual QTY
25 Service Coupling 1" (Ford C44-44) 40 $17.67 $706.80 MUELLER P15403330N $17.61 $704.40 FORD METER BOX C44-44-NL. $16.76 $670.40 FORD C44-44NL $19.27 $770.80 AY MCDONALD 74758-22
26 Corporation Stop 1 (Mueller H9971) 4 $33.91 $1,356.40 MUELLER 009971330N $35.98 $1,439.20 FORD METER BOX F200-4-NL $34.25 $1,370.00 FORD C44-44NL $40.07 $1,602.80 AY MCDONALD 73121
27 Brass Corporation Plug 1" (Mueller H10033) 3 $11.90 $35.70 MUELLER 010033330N $10.38 $31.14 FORD METER BOX CSP-4-A-NL $9.90 $29.70 FORD F200-4-NL $10.33 $30.99 AY MCDONALD 73206
28 Curb Stop 1" Full Port (Mueller B20283-3) 35 $66.55 $2,329.25 MUELLER 0202833330N $69.23 $2,423.05 FORD METER BOX B11-444W-NL $65.85 $2,304.75 FORD B11-444WNL $74.14 $2,594.90 AY MCDONALD 76111
29 Service Clamp 2" X 1" (Mueller DE2A0235CC100) 10 $14.03 $140.30 MUELLER DR2A0235CC100 $13.36 $133.60 SMITH-BLAIR 311-00025609-000 $13.95 $139.50 SMITH-BLAIR 11-025609 $19.05 $190.50 SMITH-BLAIR 31100025609-000
30 Quarter Bend Coupling 1" (Mueller H10892) 4 $17.70 $708.00 MUELLER 010892330N $17.22 $688.80 FORD METER BOX L38-44-NL $16.40 $656.00 FORD L38-44NL $18.45 $738.00 AY MCDONALD 74621
31 Meter Yoke (12” Rise) 1" (Mueller B24118) 35 $192.24 $6,728.40 MUELLER 390B241180000N $171.74 $6,010.90 FORD METER BOX VB44-12W-NL $187.00 $6,545.00 FORD VB44-12W-NL $213.87 $7,485.45 AY MCDONALD 718-412JX
32 Quarter Bend Coupling 1" (Mueller H14200) 15 $37.04 $555.60 MUELLER 014200330N $25.74 $386.10 FORD METER BOX L32-44-NL $24.47 $367.05 FORD L32-44-NL $27.56 $413.40 AY MCDONALD 747835
33 Angle Meter Curb Stop 1° (Mueller B24255) 115 $90.57 $10,415.55 MUELLER 024255330N $92.86 $10,678.90 FORD METER BOX BA23-444W- $88.25 $10,148.75 FORD RA LLW-NL $93.47 $10,749.05 AY MCDONLAD 746028
34 Three Part Union 1" (Mueller H15400) 4 $23.95 $958.00 MUELLER 015400330N $24.86 $994.40 FORD METER BOX C22-44-NL $23.70 $948.00 FORD C22-44NL $26.65 $1,066.00 AY MCDONALD 74758
35 Straight Coupling 17 X 34" (Mueller H15425) 10 $16.55 $165.50 MEULLER 015425333N $17.15 $171.50 FORD METER BOX C28-43-NL $16.34 $163.40 FORD C28-43NL $18.39 $183.90 AY MCDONALD 74753
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Water Fittings Ferguson Waterworks Utility Supply Company Core & Main LP Fortiline, Inc. dba Fortiline Waterworks

Item (Ssi':\lslﬁeEc?J: :::‘i(f‘sﬂzﬂﬁ“ :IM"B“) Estimate Yearly Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Ma"”f"’“”'ﬁ:fm'::'r"e and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost M"’““'“'“';:fm ':""e and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Ma"”f"’“”'ﬁ:fm'::'r"e and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost M"’““'“'“';:fm ':""e and Part

36 Straight Coupling 1" X 1" (Mueller H15425) 7 $15.46 $108.22 MUELLER 015425330N $16.06 $112.42 FORD METER BOX C28-44-NL. $15.30 $107.10 FORD C28-44NL. $17.25 $120.75 AY MCDONALD 74753

37 Straight Coupling 17 X 1 (Mueller H15450) 13 $16.38 $212.94 MUELLER 015450330N $16.97 $220.61 FORD METER BOX C21-44-NL $16.15 $209.95 FORD C12-44NL $18.22 $236.86 AY MCDONALD 74754

38 Straight Corp. Stop Coupling 1" (Mueller H15480) 5 $16.77 $83.85 MUELLER 015480330N $25.14 $125.70 FORD METER BOX C102-44-NL $23.95 $119.75 FORD C102-44NL $27.49 $137.45 AY MCDONALD 74742

39 Quarter Bend Coupling 1" (Mueller H15490) 2 $27.23 $680.75 MUELLER 015490330N $28.24 $706.00 FORD METER BOX L102-44-NL $26.85 $671.25 FORD L10244NL $30.90 $772.50 AY MCDONALD 74777

40 Quarter Bend Coupling 1" (Mueller H15530) 2 $18.35 $458.75 MUELLER 015530330N $19.99 $499.75 FORD METER BOX L28-44-NL $19.10 $477.50 FORD L28-44NL $21.86 $546.50 AY MCDONALD 74779M

#“ Brass Street ELL Elbow 90-DEG 1" (BMI) 50 $8.12 $406.00 MATCO B-ST005LF $7.77 $388.50 M'D"”:':JE:L“:TR'“ $9.15 $457.50 BRECCO 400-100-01051 $9.60 $480.00 MATCO NORCA BST00LF
ftem lFSI:I::eSc:ﬂl/:imn "Witting MB") Estimate Annual QTY

42 Coupling wistop C to C 1-1/2" (Nibco #600) 1 $7.48 $7.480 NICBO 039923301802 $6.52 $6.52 NIBCO 600 $4.80 $4.80 BMI 37008 $5.65 $5.65 NIBCO 600

43 Female Adaptor C to F.S.P.S. 1-1/2" (Nibco #603) 1 $25.30 $25.300 NIBCO 03992331802 $22.07 $22.07 NIBCO 603 $10.25 $10.25 BMI 37708 $19.95 $19.95 NIBCO 603

44 Male Adaptor C to M.S.P.S. 1-1/2" (Nibco #604) 1 $16.20 $16.20 NIBCO 039923303684 $14.12 $14.12 NIBCO 604 $8.30 $8.30 BMI 37808 $12.70 $12.70 NIBCO 604

a5 Elbow 45 degree C to C 1-1/2" (Nibco #606) 1 $13.79 $13.79 NIBCO 039923311344 $12.03 $12.03 NIBCO 606 $6.15 $6.15 BMI 37208 $10.10 $10.10 NIBCO 606

46 Elbow 90 degree C to C 1-1/2" (Nibco #607) 2 $13.63 $27.26 NICBCO 039923078711 $20.08 $40.16 NIBCO 607 $6.00 $12.00 BMI 37308 $10.35 $20.70 NIBCO 607

a7 Elbow 90 degree Street 1-1/2" (Nibco #607-2) 1 $17.45 $17.45 NIBCO 039923314208 $15.22 $15.22 NIBCO 607-2 $8.25 $8.25 BMI 37358 $13.75 $13.75 NIBCO 607-2

48 Elbow 90 degree C to F.S.P.S 1-1/2" (Nibco #707-3) 1 $39.92 $39.92 NIBCO 039923353283 $35.00 $35.00 NIBCO 707-3 $72.00 $72.00 BMI 353283 $49.00 $49.00 NIBCO 707-3

49 Elbow 90 degree C to M.S.P.S 1-1/2" (Nibco #707-4) 1 $42.64 $42.64 NIBCO 039923353863 $47.00 $47.00 NIBCO 7074 $76.00 $76.00 BMI 353863 $49.00 $49.00 NIBCO 7074

50 Service Coupling 1-1/2" (Ford C44-66) 20 $57.19 $1,143.80 MUELLER P15403500N $58.95 $1,179.00 FORD METER BOX C44-66-NL. $56.05 $1,121.00 FORD R44-66NL. $63.08 $1,261.60 AY MCDONALD 74758-22

51 Corporation Stop 1-1/2" (Mueller H10003) 15 $19.43 $291.45 MUELLER 010663500N $110.35 $1,655.25 FORD METER BOX FB800-6-NL $104.90 $1,573.50 FORD FB800-6NL. $118.14 $1,772.10 AY MCDONALD 731218

52 Brass Corporation Plug 1-1/2" (Mueller H10033) 2 $19.43 $38.86 MEULLER 010033500N $28.08 $56.16 FORD METER BOX CSP-6-A-NL $26.80 $53.60 FORD CSP-6-A-NL $23.15 $46.30 AY MCDONALD 73206

53 Quarter Bend Coupling 1-1/2" (Mueller H10096) 16 $66.14 $1,058.24 MUELLER 010096500N $74.24 $1,187.84 FORD METER BOX L18-76S-NL $149.00 $2,384.00 FORD L18-87S-NL. $54.54 $872.64 AY MCDONALD 74000

54 Service Clamp 4" X 1-1/2" (Mueller DR2A0500CC150) 2 $25.47 $50.94 MUELLER DR2A0447CC150 $37.10 $74.20 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00051413-000 $31.50 $63.00 SMITH-BLAIR 313-051413 $50.60 $101.20 SMITH-BLAIR 31300051413-000

55 Service Clamp 6" X 1-1/2" (Mueller DR2A0659CC150) 7 $29.50 $206.50 MUELLER DR2A0659CC150 $34.32 $240.24 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00069013-000 $29.50 $206.50 SMITH-BLAIR 313-066313 $59.10 $413.70 SMITH-BLAIR 31300076013-000

56 Service Clamp 8" X 1-1/2" (Mueller DR2A0854CC150) 5 $33.02 $165.10 MUELLER DR2A085CC150 $42.02 $210.10 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00090513-000 $34.00 $170.00 SMITH-BLAIR 313-090513 $65.35 $326.75 SMITH-BLAIR 31300101013-000

57 Service Clamp 10" X 1-1/2" (Mueller DR2A1064CC150) 1 $43.55 $43.55 MUELLER DR 2A1064CC150 $56.61 $56.61 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00121213-000 $59.50 $59.50 SMITH-BLAIR 313-121213 $86.30 $86.30 SMITH-BLAIR 31300121213-000

58 Service Clamp 12" X 1-1/2" (Mueller DR2A1262CC150) 3 $51.19 $153.57 MUELLER DR2A1262CC150 $66.53 $199.59 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00143213-000 $69.00 $207.00 JSMITH-BLAIR 313-143213 $101.20 $303.60 SMITH-BLAIR 31300143213-000

59 SERVICE CLAMP 16" X 1-1/2" (MUELLER DR2A1740CC150) 1 $86.89 $86.89 MUELLER DR2A1740CC150 $107.48 $107.48 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00178013-000 $112.00 $112.00 SMITH-BLAIR 1313-18881 $180.00 $180.00 SMITH-BLAIR 31300188813-000

60 Brass Coupling (Collar) 1-1/2" (Ford C4466) 4 $57.19 $228.76 MUELLER P15403500N $58.95 $235.80 FORD METER BOX C44-66-NL. $56.05 $224.20 URD C44-66NL $63.42 $253.68 AY MCDONALD 74758-22

61 Bronze Meter Flange, Female 1-1/2" (Ford #6) 2 $65.32 $130.64 MATCO 431T07PLF $37.45 $74.90 FORD METER BOX CF31-6-NL $35.60 $71.20 FORD CF31-66NL $39.99 $79.98 AY MCDONALD 7610F

62 Bronze Meter Flange, Male 1-1/2" (Ford #6M) 1 - NO BID $40.46 $40.46 FORD METER BOX CF38-66-NL $38.50 $38.50 FORD F-38-66-2-NL. $43.21 $43.21 AY MCDONALD 7610M
Item FITTINGS 2" (See Specification "Wiitting MB") Estimate Annual QTY

63 Nipple, Brass 2° X 1-1/2" CL NL 100 $7.80 $780.00 MATCO NBROSCL $9.55 $955.00 MIDLAND INDUSTRIES 40160 $8.95 $895.00 BMI 104900 $10.75 $1,075.00 MATCO NORCA NBROSCL.

64 Nipple, Brass 2" X 8" NL 100 $25.07 $2,507.00 MATCO NBRO088 $25.82 $2,582.00 MIDLAND INDUSTRIES 40170 $27.70 $2,770.00 BMI 04990 $34.50 $3,450.00 MATCO NORCA NMR088

65 Nipple, Brass 2" X 10" NL 100 $31.06 $3,106.00 MATCO NBRO0810 $31.98 $3,198.00 MIDLAND INDUSTRIES 40172 $35.00 $3,500.00 BMI 04992 $52.20 $5,220.00 MATCO NORCA NBR0810

66 Coupling with Stop C to C 2" (Nibco #600) 2 $12.48 $24.96 NIBCO 039923309167 $10.89 $21.78 NIBCO 600 $5.75 $11.50 BMI 37009 $9.75 $19.50 NIBCO 607

67 Male Adaptor C to M.S.P.S. 2" (Nibco #604) 1 $27.41 $27.410 NIBCO 039923303783 $23.91 $23.91 NIBCO 604 $11.15 $11.15 BMI 37809 $21.60 $21.60 NIBCO 604

68 Elbow, 45 degree C to C 2" (Nibco #606) 1 $23.02 $23.020 NIBCO 039923311405 $20.08 $20.08 NIBCO 606 $9.40 $9.40 BMI 37209 $15.50 $15.50 NIBCO 606

69 Elbow, Brass 90-degeree. No lead. 100 $19.00 $1,900.00 MATCO B-L9008LF $17.97 $1,797.00 MIDLAND INDUSTRIES 44108LF $18.75 $1,875.00 BMI 06309 $22.20 $2,220.00 MATCO NORCA B-L9008LF

70 Elbow, 90 degree C to C 2" (Nibco #607) 7 $24.83 $173.81 NIBCO 039923078704 $21.65 $151.55 NIBCO 607 $10.15 $71.05 BMI 37309 $16.50 $115.50 NIBCO 607

k£l Elbow, 90 degree C to M.S.P.S. 2" (Nibco #707-4) 1 $69.58 $69.58 NIBCO 0399723353900 $56.00 $56.00 NIBCO 7074 $124.00 $124.00 BMI 353900 $88.60 $88.60 NIBCO 707-4

72 Service Coupling 2" (Ford #C44-77) 9 $77.24 $695.16 MUELLER P15403550N $79.57 $716.13 FORD METER BOX C44-77-NL. $75.60 $680.40 FORD C44-77 NL. $85.16 $766.44 AY MCDONALD 74758-22

73 Corporation Stop 2" (Mueller H10003) 30 $178.71 $5,361.30 MUELLER 010003550N $188.19 $5,645.70 FORD METER BOX FB800-7-NL $178.80 $5,364.00 FORD FB800-7-NL. $201.43 $6,042.90 AY MCDONALD 731218

74 Brass Corporation Plug 2" (Mueller H10033) 2 $25.19 $50.38 MUELLER 010033550N $48.11 $96.22 FORD METER BOX CSP-7-A-NL $46.00 $92.00 FORD RSP-7-A-NL $30.03 $60.06 AY MCDONALD 73206

75 Brass Corporation Plug 2° (Mueller H10035) 2 $36.05 $72.10 MUELLER 010035550N $43.85 $87.70 FORD METER BOX CSP-7-NL $41.85 $83.70 FORD CSP-7-1-NL $30.03 $60.06 AY MCDONALD 73208

76 Brass Sq. HD Core Plug. 2" NL 100 $8.79 $879.00 MATCO B-PLOSLF $8.33 $833.00 MIDLAND INDUSTRIES 44418LF $8.40 $840.00 BMI 06609 $11.45 $1,145.00 MATCO NORCA B-OLOBLF
4 Quarter Bend Coupling 2" (Mueller H10096) 15 $67.78 $1,016.70 MUELLER 010096550 $144.11 $2,161.65 FORD METER BOX L18-87S-NL $149.00 $2,235.00 FORD L18-87S-BL. $80.75 $1,211.25 AY MCDONALD 74000

78 Service Clamp 4" X 2" (Mueller DR2A0500CC200) 1 $25.47 $25.47 MUELLER 002A0447CC200 $37.10 $37.10 SMITH-BLAIR 313-0051415-000 $31.50 $31.50 SMITH-BLAIR 1313 $50.55 $50.55 SMIT-BLAIR 31300051415-000
79 Service Clamp 6" X 2" (Mueller DR2A0659CC200) 5 $29.89 $149.45 MUELLER DR2A0659CC200 $34.32 $171.60 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00069015-000 $27.95 $139.75 SMITH-BLAIR 313-066315 $48.95 $244.75 SMITH-BLAIR 31300076015-000
80 Service Clamp 8" X 2" (Mueller DR2A0905CC200) 5 $33.02 $165.10 MUELLER DR2A0859CC200 $42.83 $214.15 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00090515-000 $32.50 $162.50 SMITH-BLAIR 313-090515 $61.20 $306.00 SMITH-BLAIR 31300101015-000
81 Service Clamp 10" X 2" (Mueller DR2A1064CC200) 1 $43.55 $43.550 MUELLER DRA1064CC200 $56.61 $56.61 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00121215-000 $56.50 $56.50 SMITH-BLAIR 1311-121215 $80.70 $80.70 SMITH-BLAIR 31300121215-000
82 Service Clamp 12" X 2" (Mueller DR2A1262CC200) 6 $52.22 $313.32 MUELLER DR2A1262CC200 $67.87 $407.22 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00143215-000 $68.00 $408.00 SMITH-BLAIR 313-143215 $94.85 $569.10 SMITH-BLAIR 31300143215-000
83 Service Clamp 16" X 2" (Mueller DR2A1740CC200) 2 $90.26 180.52 MUELLER DR2A1740CC200 $112.25 $224.50 SMITH-BLAIR 313-00178015-000 $115.00 $230.00 SMITH-BLAIR 313-178015 $169.10 $338.20 SMITH-BLAIR 31300188815-000
84 Brass Coupling (Collar) 2" (Ford C4477) 20 $16.72 334.40 MATCO B-RC0908LF $79.57 $1,591.40 FORD METER BOX C44-77-NL. $75.60 $1,512.00 FORD C44-77NL $85.16 $1,703.20 AY MCDONALD 74758-22
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Water Fittings Ferguson Waterworks Utility Supply Company Core & Main LP Fortiline, Inc. dba Fortiline Waterworks

item (ssi':\gﬁ:'c?l :::‘L?‘Sﬂzﬂﬁ“ :IM"B“) Estimate Yearly Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Ma"”’“‘”'ﬁ::ﬂ'::'r"e and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Ma““'“'“';:fm '::'"’ and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Ma"”’“‘”'ﬁ::ﬂ'::'r"e and Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Ma““'“'“';:fm '::'"’ and Part
8 Brass Reducer 2-1/2" X 2" (Bell Reducer) 20 $33.81 676.20 MATCO B-RCOS0BLF $31.31 $626.20 A $32.02 $640.40 BMI 06046 $38.70 $774.00 MATCO NORCA BRCOS08LF
86 Brass Bushing 2" X 1-1/2" NL 100 $10.16 1,016.00 MATCO B-BUOBO7LF $9.41 $941.00 MIDLAND INDUSTRIES 44531LF $9.75 $975.00 BMI 06140 $11.65 $1,165.00 MATCO NORCA B-BUOSO7LF
87 Brass Bushing 3" X 2* 100 $30.73 3,073.00 MATCO B-BU1008LF $28.47 $2,847.00 MIDLAND INDUSTRIES 44538LF $29.10 $2,910.00 BMI 1106152 $35.20 $3,520.00 MATCO NORCA B-BU1008LF
88 Brass Reducer 3" X 2" 100 $44.81 4,481.00 MATCO B-RC1008LF $41.51 $4,151.00 MIDLAND INDUSTRIES 4456LF $41.00 $4,100.00 BMI 06052 $51.30 $5,130.00 MATCO NORCA B-RC1008LF
89 Bronze Meter Flange Female 2° (Ford #7) 6 - NOBID $48.91 $293.46 FORD METER BOX CF31-77-NL $46.55 $279.30 FORD CF31-77-NL $52.22 $313.32 AY MCDONALD 7610F

90 Bronze Meter Flange Male 2" (Ford #7M) 1 - NO BID $53.98 $53.98 FORD METi’;:ﬁf CF38-77-2- $51.35 $51.35 FORD ROF38-77-2125-NL $57.61 $57.61 AY MCDONALD 7610M
om |G Specircaton witing M5 Estimate Annusl QY

o 20 dogreo SroatBend C 1o M -1 X 1112 » $27.62 $652.40 VIEGA 77067 NIA VIEGANG O SR CARRIES $26.10 $622.00 VIEGA 77067 $45.55 $911.00 VIEGA 77522

92 90 degree Street Bend C to M 2° X 2° (Only Viega #77527) 3 $36.25 1,450.00 VIEGA 77072 N/A VIEGANG Lo CARRIES $36.25 $1,450.00 VIEGA 77072 $62.00 $2,480.00 VIEGA 77527

93 45 degree Bend C to C 1-1/2" X 1-1/2" (Only Viega #77627) 20 $19.81 396.20 VIEGA 77068 $23.75 $475.00 VIEGA 77038 $21.10 $422.00 VIEGA 77038 $22.70 $454.00 VIEGA 77627

9 45 degree Bend C to C 2" X 2" (Only Viega #77632) 30 $29.84 895.20 VIEGA 77073 $32.93 $987.90 VIEGA 77043 $30.00 $900.00 VIEGA 77043 $31.45 $943.50 VIEGA 77632

95 90 degree Bend C to C 1-1/2" (Only Viega #77377) 50 $24.66 1,233.00 VIEGA 77032 $27.75 $1,387.50 VIEGA 77037 $24.65 $1,232.50 VIEGA 77037 $37.20 $1,860.00 VIEGA 77377

9% 90 degree Bend C to C 2° X 2" (Only Viega #77342) 60 $34.25 2,055.00 VIEGA 77042 $38.96 $2,337.60 VIEGA 77042 $35.00 $2,100.00 VIEGA 77072 $40.45 $2,427.00 VIEGA 77342

97 90 degree Bend C to F 1-1/2" X 1-1/2" (Only Viega #77562) 10 $24.66 246.60 VIEGA 77037 $47.53 $475.30 VIEGA 79565 $42.25 $422.50 VIEGA 79565 $37.20 $372.00 VIEGA 77562

% 90 degree Bend C to F 2 X 2" (Only Viega #77567) 5 $36.25 181.25 VIEGA 77037 $75.45 $377.25 VIEGA 79570 $67.40 $337.00 VIEGA 79570 $59.00 $295.00 VIEGA 77567

99 TEE C X C X C 1-1/2" (Only Viega #77457) 1 $31.88 31.880 VIEGA 77072 $36.26 $36.26 VIEGA 77457 $32.25 $32.25 VIEGA 77457 $34.65 $34.65 VIEGA 77457

100 TEE C X C X C 2" (Only Viega #77477) 1 $39.38 39.380 VIEGA 77457 $44.80 $44.80 VIEGA 77477 $39.85 $39.85 VIEGA 77477 $45.80 $45.80 VIEGA 77477

101 Reducer C X C 2" X 1-1/2" (Only Viega #78167) 10 $24.16 241.60 VIEGA 78167 $27.19 $271.90 VIEGA 78167 $33.00 $330.00 VIEGA 78167 $26.00 $260.00 VIEGA 78167

102 Male Adaptor C X M 1-1/2" X 1-1/2" (Only Viega #77872) 30 $23.35 700.50 VIEGA 79275 $46.03 $1,380.90 VIEGA 79415 $23.35 $700.50 VIEGA 79275 $26.30 $789.00 VIEGA 77872

103 Male Adaptor C X M 2° X 2" (Only Viega #77877) 75 $44.95 3,371.25 VIEGA 79290 $67.75 $5,081.25 VIEGA 79420 $44.97 $3,372.75 VIEGA 79290 $45.55 $3,416.25 VIEGA 77877

104 Coupling C X C wio Stop 1-1/2" (Only Viega #78192) 50 $17.53 876.50 VIEGA 78192 $19.73 $986.50 VIEGA 78192 $17.50 $875.00 VIEGA 78192 $20.15 $1,007.50 VIEGA 78192

105 Coupling C X C wio Stop 2" (Only Viega #78197) 100 $19.81 1,981.00 VIEGA 78197 $22.54 $2,254.00 VIEGA 78197 $20.05 $2,005.00 VIEGA 78197 $22.30 $2,230.00 VIEGA 78197

Item féﬁ?i;ﬁfé:ﬁ:ﬁm:""mg e Estimate Annual QTY

106 BRS Coupling wist C X C 3/4" (Only Tectite 200) 200 $7.62 1,524.00 10155454 BY ELKHART $10.66 $2,132.00 TECTITE 200 $6.50 $1,300.00 IECTITE 10155454 $8.10 $1,620.00 TECTITE 200

107 BRS Female Adaptor C X F 3/4" (Only Tectite 203) 300 $6.09 1,827.00 10155464 BY ELKHART $8.45 $2,535.00 TECTITE 203 $5.25 $1,575.00 TECTITE 10155464 $6.48 $1,944.00 TECTITE 203

108 BRS Male Adaptor C X M 3/4” (Only Tectite 204) 450 $6.09 2,740.50 10155470 BY ELKHART $8.45 $3,802.50 TECTITE 204 $5.25 $2,362.50 TECTITE 10155478 $6.48 $2,916.00 TECTITE 204

109 BRS 90 Degree Bend C X C 3/4” (Only Tectite 207) 375 $8.52 3,195.00 10155478 BY ELKHART $12.14 $4,552.50 TECTITE 207 $7.35 $2,756.25 TECTITE 10155488 $9.06 $3,397.50 TECTITE 207

110 BRS Tee C X C X C 3/4" (Only Tectite 211) 40 $10.93 437.20 10155488 BY ELKHART $16.18 $647.20 TECTITE 211 $10.02 $400.80 TECTITE 10155456 $12.30 $492.00 TECTITE 211

1 BRS Coupling wist C X C 1" (Only Tectite 200) 50 $17.07 853.50 10155456 BY ELKHART $19.85 $992.50 TECTITE 200 $16.00 $800.00 TECTITE 10155456 $19.20 $960.00 TECTITE 200

12 BRS Female Adaptor C X F 1 (Only Tectite 203) 45 $13.78 620.10 1015466 BY ELKHART $15.44 $694.80 TECTITE 203 $13.02 $585.90 TECTITE 101 $15.50 $697.50 TECTITE 203

13 BRS Male Adaptor C X M 1" (Only Tectite 204) 50 $13.78 689.00 10155472 BY ELKHART $16.91 $845.50 TECTITE 204 $13.02 $651.00 TECTITE 10155472 $15.50 $775.00 TECTITE 204

114 BRS 90 degree Bend C X C1” (Only Tectite 207) 60 $19.04 1,142.40 10155482 BY ELKHART $22.80 $1,368.00 TECTITE 207 $18.00 $1,080.00 TECTITE 10155482 $21.43 $1,285.80 TECTITE 207

115 BRS Tee C X C X C 1" (Only Tectite 211) 5 $25.93 129.65 10155496 BY ELKHART $32.04 $160.20 TECTOTE 211 $23.45 $117.25 TECTITE 1015510QH $29.18 $145.90 TECTITE 211

(A costs must b e o your Bid il b disquaiie) $428,350.09 $392,353.12 $425,715.40 $451,408.10
Delivery 60 - 90 DAYS Stock to 10 Weeks Stock to 15 Days Under Normal Market Conditions with the Uncertainty in 60 Days Depending on the Item

the Market Shipments May Be Delayed

Notes

Page3of3




	Sheet1

