ANew Kind of Energy.

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 1218A Buyer: Shelley Crayton
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Water Pipe scrayton@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Date: September 30, 2021
1. Delivery:
If your Bid is accepted and an agreement is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:
You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract o canceling the
Purchase Order, pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitiled in law or in equity.
2. Pricing

Bidder must include a manufacturers part number and price for each item listed in Exhibit A. Quantities listed are provided based on historical data and not
necessarily what will be purchased in the future.

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

Water Pipe Core & Main LP Ferguson Waterworks Utility Supply Company
item Coper Estimate Yearly Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name & Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name & Part Unit Cost Extended Cost Manufacturers Name & Part
(See Specification "Wpipe") Number Number Number
1 Copper Pipe, (Type K, Soft 60-foot roll) 3/4™ 25 $297.00 $7.425.00 JMF 6361512869802 $6.99 $174.75 MUELLER KSO05FTF60 $629.43 $15,735.75 MERFISH UNITED
2 Copper Pipe, (Type K, Soft 60-foot roll) 1" 20 $372.00 $7.440.00 JMF 6361516869802 $9.27 $185.40 MUELLER KSOFTG60 $834.86 $16,697.20 MERFISH UNITED
3 Copper Pipe, (Type K, Soft 20-foot joint) 1-1/2" 15 $310.00 $4,650.00 JMF 6361724799800 $17.60 $264.00 MUELLER KSOFTJ20 $1,651.19 $24,767.85 MERFISH UNITED
4 Copper Pipe, (Type K, Soft 20-foot joint) 2" 15 $480.00 $7,200.00 JMF 6361732799800 $27.36 $410.40 MUELLER KSOFTK20 $2,566.85 $38,502.75 MERFISH UNITED
PVC
Item (Sea Specification “Wpipe") Estimate Yearly Quantity
5 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 20x1/2" 50 $16.40 $820.00 PIPELIFE 0500580 $0.69 $34.50 e $59.81 $2,990.50 MERFISH UNITED
6 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 203/4" 50 $22.40 $1,120.00 PIPELIFE 0500780 $0.80 $40.00 e E $70.13 $3,506.50 MERFISH UNITED
7 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 201" 50 $33.00 $1,650.00 PIPELIFE 0501080P $1.26 $63.00 e $109.31 $5,465.50 MERFISH UNITED
8 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 201-1/4" 50 $47.40 $2,370.00 PIPELIFE 0501280P $1.62 $81.00 e e $145.91 $7,295.50 MERFISH UNITED
9 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 201-172" 40 $51.20 $2,048.00 PIPELIFE 0501580 $1.92 $76.80 e e $171.88 $6,875.20 MERFISH UNITED
10 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 20' X 2" SCH-80 40 $73.00 $2,920.00 PIPELIFE 0502080P $4.95 $198.00 CHARLOTTE PIPE P80BK $84.00 $3,360.00 KESSLER SALES
" PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 20' X 4" SCH-80 250 $210.20 $52,550.00 PIPELIFE 0504080P $6.75 $1,687.50 DIAMOND PIPE DR14BDP $241.80 $60,450.00 KESSLER SALES
12 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 20' X 6" SCH-80 400 $407.00 $162,800.00 PIPELIFE 0506080P $13.61 $5,444.00 DIAMOND PIPE DK14BPU $468.06 $187,224.00 KESSLER SALES
13 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 20' X 8" SCH-80 100 $576.80 $57,680.00 PIPELIFE 0508080P $23.44 $2,344.00 DIAMOND PIPE DR14BPX $563.96 $56,396.00 KESSLER SALES
14 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 20' X 10" SCH-80 5 $852.60 $4,263.00 PIPELIFE 0510080P $37.18 $185.90 DIAMOND PIPE DR14BP10 NO QUOTE
15 PVC Pipe (C900-Class 200) 20' X 12" SCH-80 5 $1,166.80 $5,834.00 PIPELIFE 0512080P $52.56 $262.80 DIAMOND PIPE DR14BP12 $1,100.00 $5,500.00 PIPELIFE JETSTREAM
Galvanized
Item (See Specification "Wpipe") Estimate Annual Quantity (FT)
T AND C = Threaded & Coupled
16 Galv. Pipe 21X %" (i ) (T AND C / Schedule 40) 2 $37.17 $920.25 MERFISH PIPE & SUPPLY $2.90 $72.50 WHERTLAND TuBELLC $201.73 $5,043.25 KESSLER SALES
o MERFISH PIPE & SUPPLY WHEATLAND TUBE LLC
17 Galv. Pipe 21' X 1" (in ft) (T AND C / Schedule 40) 25 $74.76 $1,869.00 170106 $4.31 $107.75 GGPJCASIG $316.30 $7,907.50 MERFISH UNITED
18 Galv. Pipe 21X 1-1/4" (i ) (T AND G / Schedule 40) 2 $11088 $2,772.00 MERFISH PiPe & SUPPLY $5.81 $145.25 oy ¢ $426.73 $10,668.25 MERFISH UNITED
) . MERFISH PIPE & SUPPLY WHEATLAND TUBE LLC
19 Galv. Pipe 21' X 1-1/2" (in ft) (T AND C / Schedule 40) 1,000 $126.00 $126,000.00 170156 $6.99 $6,990.00 GGTCAS3JC $512.81 $512,810.00 MERFISH UNITED
20 Galv. Pipe 21X 2" (in ) (T AND G / Schedule 40) 3,000 $106.26 $318,780.00 MERFISH PIPE & SUPPLY $9.39 $28,170.00 o ¢ $688.75 $2,066,250.00 MERFISH UNITED
2 (Galv. Pipe 21' X 3" (in f) (T AND C / Schedule 40) 2,500 $210.00 §525,000.00 MERF'S";'“ZE; SuPPLY $19.60 $49,000.00 A e ¢ $1,449.63 $3,624,075.00 MERFISH UNITED
DUCTILE IRON, CAST IRON, AND STEEL i
tem (See Specification "Wpipe") Estimate Yearly Quantlty
. US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FASTITE JOINT
2 Ductie Iron Pipe, Push On & 20 $24.90 $498.00 fbobes $23.12 $462.40 prindld $24.90 $499.80 Us PIPE
- US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN MJ JOINT
% Ductie fron Pipe, M.J. 4 20 $33.75 $675.00 foiolir $31.06 $621.20 PR, $33.78 $675.60 Us PIPE
! Ductie iron Pipe, Push On 6 1900 $19.25 $36,575.00 PR o $17.62 $33,858.00 AR - T $19.38 $36,622.00 US PIPE
- US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FLEX RING
2 Ductie Iron Pipe, Bell End & 1900 $19.25 $36,575.00 fSbobes $24.30 $46,170.00 P $19.38 $36,822.00 Us PIPE
- PIPE & AMERICAN MJ JOINT
2 Ductie tron Pipe, M.J. & 1900 $32.95 $62,605.00 FoUNDIToasM $30.33 $57,627.00 M $32.07 $62,643.00 Us PIPE
z Ductie iron Pipe, Push On & 1000 $27.50 $27,500.00 PR $25.40 $25,400.00 AR - T $27.60 $27,600.00 US PIPE
- US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN MJ JOINT
» Ductie Iron Pipe, M.J. & 1000 $45.75 $45,750.00 fboi $33.80 $33,800.00 b oLs $53.35 $53,350.00 Us PIPE
US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FASTITE JOINT
2 Ductie Iron Pipe, Push On 10 920 $33.00 $30,360.00 S $30.53 $28,087.60 prliondil $37.33 $34,343.60 Us PIPE
. US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN MJ JOINT
3 Ductie tron Pipe, M.J. 10 920 $57.50 $52,900.00 o $53.20 $48,944.00 PN $57.81 $53,185.20 Us PIPE
US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FASTITE JOINT
3t Ductie Iron Pipe, Push On 12 1750 $42.25 $73,937.50 b $38.91 $68,002.50 el $42.43 $74,252.50 Us PIPE
- US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN MJ JOINT
2 Ductie tron Pipe, M.J. 12 1750 $7250 $126,875.00 o $67.40 $117,950.00 PN $73.24 $128,170.00 Us PIPE
US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FASTITE JOINT
3 Ductie Iron Pipe, Push On 16 75 $61.50 $4,612.50 b $104.74 $7,855.50 e $62.22 $4,666.50 Us PIPE
- US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN MJ JOMT
4 Ductie iron Pipe, M.J. 16 75 $105.00 $7875.00 o $141.70 $10,627.50 AR $106.44 $7,083.00 Us PIPE
US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FASTITE JOINT
3 Ductie Iron Pipe, Push On 20 50 $81.00 $4,050.00 b $118.54 $5,027.00 prliondll $81.02 $4,006.00 Us PIPE
3 Ductie Iron Pipe, Push On 24 75 $102.00 $7,650.00 US PIPE & FOUNDRY 12450T] $136.96 $10,422.00 AR e " $103.62 $7.771.50 US PIPE
B Ductie Iron Pipe:Class 53 (F-S) 24" x 2 (Nipple) 75 $2,205.00 $165,375.00 S oy 571888 $53,916.00 CUSTOM PIPE & FAB SP-24- $1,316.00 $98,700.00 US PIPE
3 Ducile Iron Pipe-Class 53 (FIg-PE) 24° x2 (Nipple) 30 $1,405.00 $42,150.00 US PP & FOUNDRY $1,533.33 $45,999.90 CUSTOM PIPE & FAB SP-24 $1,316.00 $39,480.00 US PIPE
25124FP0200 FP2
y US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FASTITE JOINT
3 Ductie Iron Pipe 30 50 $218.00 $10,900.00 fbolbes $175.42 $8,771.00 prdiondil $142.40 $7,120.00 Us PIPE
" .1 pipe 30" 50 $218.00 $10,900.00 PR o No Bid NoBID NO QUOTE
@ Steel Pipe 30° 50 $185.00 $9,250.00 CIERRA PIPE 163005C250 No Bid NOBID NO QUOTE
“ US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FASTITE JOINT
« Ductie Iron Pipe, Push On 36 50 $292.00 $14,600.00 ol $218.46 $10,923.00 PRl $188.20 $9,410.00 Us PIPE
@ .1 Pipe 30" 50 $360.00 $18,000.00 PR o No Bid NoBID NO QUOTE
“ Steel Pipe 41" 50 $235.00 $11,750.00 CIERRA PIPE 164105C250 No Bid NOBID NO QUOTE
s .1 Pipe 42° 60 $318.00 $19,080.00 PR g No Bid NoBID NO QUOTE
- US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FLEX RING
% TR Flex Pipe, 6 125 $26.40 $3,300.00 i $24.30 $3,037.50 P $26.42 $3,302.50 Us PIPE
- US PIPE & FOUNDRY AMERICAN FLEX RING
o TR Flex Pipe, & 150 $36.50 $5,475.00 i $33.80 $5,070.00 pea $36.72 $5,508.00 Us PIPE
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Water Pipe Core & Main LP Ferguson Waterworks Utility Supply Company
s TR Flox Pipe, 10°. 100 $44.25 $4,425.00 S PIPE 8 o ORY $40.86 $4,086.00 AMERICAN rLEX RING $44.42 $4,442.00 US PIPE
4 TR Flox Pipe, 12°. 120 $57.00 $6,840.00 P o DRY $52.51 $6,301.20 AMERICAN FLEX RING $57.04 $6,844.80 US PIPE
50 TR Flox Pipe, 16", 100 $88.00 $8,800.00 S PR & o ORY $124.60 $12,460.00 AMERICAN rLeX RING $88.36 $8,836.00 US PIPE
5t TR Flox Pipe, 16", 100 $105.00 $10,500.00 S PIPE 8 o ORY $143.12 $14,312.00 AMERICAN FLEX RING $108.00 $10,800.00 US PIPE
52 TR Flox Pipe, 24°. 100 $149.00 $14,900.00 USRI PR $186.30 $18,639.00 AU T RING $154.20 $15,420.00 US PIPE
TOTAL EXTENDE.D COST NOT TO.EXCEEDZ. $2 170 803 25 $775 297 85 $7 404 273 75
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) ’ H) . ’ d ) y .
Delivew Stock to 15 Days Unt:ﬁea!r::‘"sn:ilp’:l“:!::: g:::ldd b(;nnsevlg;:;he uncertainty in the 90 Days
Notes Items that are highlighter have extended cost corrected
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