
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department IFB 21-942 Senior Buyer: Donnie Tiemann

175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org

Tulsa, OK 74103 Streets & Stormwater Department Please contact if You have any questions

Bid Date: May 20, 2021

2. Pricing

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

1
PET WASTE BAG DISPENSER -BONE SHAPED BAG DISPENSER 
WITH CARABINER FOR LEASH (BLUE & WHITE) -PER TECH 
SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $1.04 $1,040.00 $1.125 $1,125.00 $1.20 $1,200.00 $0.00 $0.76 $760.00 $1.45 $1,450.00

2
SPRINKLER RAIN GAUGE -- SPRINKLER STYLE GAUGE, STYLE IS 
FUNCTIONAL AND STORES EASIER- PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

1500 or more $4.27 $6,405.00 Not Available $0.00 $2.50 $3,750.00 $0.00 $2.68 $4,020.00 $3.51 $5,265.00

3
TOTE BAG -- REINFORCED RECYCLED TOTE BAG (ROYAL BLUE) 
PER TECH SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $2.09 $2,090.00 $0.891 $891.00 $1.05 $1,050.00 $0.00 $1.37 $1,370.00 $1.80 $1,800.00

4
FISHING BOBBERS -- STANDARD BOBBER (BLUE/WHITE) - PER 
TECH SPECIFICATIONS

2000 or more $0.77 $1,540.00 $1.148 $2,296.00 $1.00 $2,000.00 $0.00 $0.83 $1,660.00 $1.14 $2,280.00

5
XERISCAPE GARDEN SEED MIX -- CUSTOM PACKAGE SEEDS MIX 
FROM PRAIRIE MOON NURSERY- PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $0.45 $450.00 Not Available $0.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $0.00 $0.48 $480.00 $1.54 $1,540.00

6
FRIDGE MAGNETS -- BUSINESS CARD SIZE ADVERTISING 
MAGNETS- PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

3000 or more $0.10 $300.00 $0.151 $453.00 $0.20 $600.00 $0.00 $0.14 $420.00 $0.25 $750.00

7a
 T-SHIRTS - 50/50 BLEND T-SHIRT (KIDS SIZE S L) - BLUE, RED, 

WHITE & BLACK - PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS
200 or more $6.73 $1,346.00 $5.715 $1,143.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $6.48 $1,296.00 $10.89 $2,178.00

7b
T-SHIRTS -- 50/50 BLEND T-SHIRT (ADULT SIZES S TO XL) - BLUE, 
RED, WHITE & BLACK - PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

200 or more $7.48 $1,496.00 $6.290 $1,258.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $6.74 $1,348.00 $11.27 $2,254.00

7c
T-SHIRTS -- 50/50 BLEND T-SHIRT (ADULT SIZES (2XL TO 3XL) - 
BLUE, RED, WHITE & BLACK - PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

100 or more $10.71 $1,071.00 $7.180 $718.00 $9.00 $900.00 $0.00 $9.52 $952.00 $12.27 $1,227.00

8
HATS -FITTED FLEX-FIT HAT (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

200 or more $8.87 $1,774.00 $6.545 $1,309.00 $4.00 $800.00 $0.00 $5.46 $1,092.00 $14.74 $2,948.00

9
TUMBLER - 20OZ VACUUM INSULATED TUMBLER (BLUE & 
WHITE) PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

200 or more $13.00 $2,600.00 $5.010 $1,002.00 $8.00 $1,600.00 $0.00 $13.08 $2,616.00 $8.39 $1,678.00

10
PENCILS -- BASIC SCHOOL PENCIL (BLUE & WHITE) - PER 
TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $0.15 $150.00 $0.190 $190.00 $0.20 $200.00 $0.00 $0.23 $230.00 $0.14 $140.00

11
 CAR PHONE CHARGER (BASE ONLY) - ON-THE GO PHONE 

CHARGER FOR CAR (BLUE & WHITE)- PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $5.70 $1,425.00 $1.252 $313.00 $2.50 $625.00 $0.00 $1.79 $447.50 $1.63 $407.50

12
FRISBEE -- RECREATIONAL FRISBEE FOR OUTDOOR USE (BLUE & 
WHITE) PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $0.75 $750.00 $1.002 $1,002.00 $1.25 $1,250.00 $0.00 $2.16 $2,160.00 $0.97 $970.00

13
SUNGLASSES -- BASIC SUNGLASSES (BLUE & WHITE) - PER 
TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $0.80 $800.00 $1.071 $1,071.00 $0.90 $900.00 $0.00 $0.84 $840.00 $1.80 $1,800.00

14
POP CAN COOLER -- NON-WOVEN INSULATED COOLER (BLUE & 
WHITE) PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

100 or more $2.15 $215.00 $9.720 $972.00 $2.25 $225.00 $0.00 $1.66 $166.00 $2.17 $217.00

15
MAGNETIC CLIP -- JUMBO MAGNETIC MEMO CLIP (BLUE & 
WHITE) PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $0.65 $650.00 $1.151 $1,151.00 $0.80 $800.00 $0.00 $0.75 $750.00 $0.97 $970.00

16a
2 GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $4.15 $1,037.50 $2.796 $699.00 $3.95 $987.50 $0.00 $2.16 $540.00 $7.68 $1,920.00

16b
4 GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $4.25 $1,062.50 $2.904 $726.00 $4.95 $1,237.50 $0.00 $2.22 $555.00 $7.93 $1,982.50

16c
8 GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $4.35 $1,087.50 $3.396 $849.00 $5.95 $1,487.50 $0.00 $2.63 $657.50 $12.50 $3,125.00

16d
 16GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $6.05 $1,512.50 $3.732 $933.00 $6.95 $1,737.50 $0.00 $2.84 $710.00 $12.62 $3,155.00

16e
32 GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $7.65 $1,912.50 $4.788 $1,197.00 $7.95 $1,987.50 $0.00 $3.65 $912.50 $12.68 $3,170.00

17
BACKPACKS -- RECYCLED DRAWSTRING BACKPACKS (BLUE & 
WHITE) -PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $1.60 $1,600.00 $1.167 $1,167.00 $1.40 $1,400.00 $0.00 $1.40 $1,400.00 $2.99 $2,990.00

18
TATTOO'S PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS ASSORTED- 125 PER 
LOGO

500 or more $0.25 $125.00 $0.808 $404.00 $0.20 $100.00 $0.00 $0.21 $105.00 $0.63 $315.00

TOTAL COST  NOT TO EXCEED:                                                                                                     (All 
costs must be included or Your bid will be disqualified)

Promotional Items

International Promotional 
Ideas Inc.

1. Delivery:  If Your bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days You need to deliver the Goods and /or to 
begin providing services:

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

4imprint, Inc.

You must be able to deliver the Goods and /or Services as specified in Your Bid.  Failure to do so may result in City terminating Your contract or canceling the Purchase Order, pursuing collection under any 
performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

$32,439.50 $28,237.50

Everything Branded USA, 
Inc.

$20,869.00
Varies per item. Production time is 
listed on specification sheet included 
with bid

Delivery:

Notes: 10% Discount using code TUL21 20% Discount - website

15 Business Days
15 - 20 Days ARO & Arwork Approval 
or Sooner.

Catalog Nontact Finger Gloves - 
Spreei-WH-IC 63% Discount

5% Discount

Zencap, Inc. Exhibit Arts, LLC Positive Promotions Inc

additional $2.20 per shirt for 3X / 
Products 20% off

$25,487.50 $44,532.00

10 - 15 Working Days for Delivery



If you’d like the City of Tulsa to be able to purchase items other than those listed specifically here, provide a priced catalog and complete the table below.

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost

1
PET WASTE BAG DISPENSER -BONE SHAPED BAG DISPENSER 
WITH CARABINER FOR LEASH (BLUE & WHITE) -PER TECH 
SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $1.390 $1,390.00 $1.060 $1,060.00 $0.6063 $606.30 $1.10 $1,100.00 $1.30 $1,300.00 $1.25 $1,250.00

2
SPRINKLER RAIN GAUGE -- SPRINKLER STYLE GAUGE, STYLE IS 
FUNCTIONAL AND STORES EASIER- PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

1500 or more $3.244 $4,866.00 $2.140 $3,210.00 $3.0459 $4,568.85 $2.99 $4,485.00 $1.89 $2,835.00 $1.99 $2,985.00

3
TOTE BAG -- REINFORCED RECYCLED TOTE BAG (ROYAL BLUE) 
PER TECH SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $1.665 $1,665.00 $0.980 $980.00 $0.7225 $722.50 $1.52 $1,520.00 $0.99 $990.00 $0.69 $690.00

4
FISHING BOBBERS -- STANDARD BOBBER (BLUE/WHITE) - PER 
TECH SPECIFICATIONS

2000 or more $0.821 $1,642.00 $0.840 $1,680.00 $0.9636 $1,927.20 $0.87 $1,740.00 $0.74 $1,480.00 $0.59 $1,180.00

5
XERISCAPE GARDEN SEED MIX -- CUSTOM PACKAGE SEEDS MIX 
FROM PRAIRIE MOON NURSERY- PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $2.367 $2,367.00 No Bid No Bid N/A $1.73 $1,730.00 $0.69 $690.00

6
FRIDGE MAGNETS -- BUSINESS CARD SIZE ADVERTISING 
MAGNETS- PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

3000 or more $0.190 $570.00 $0.08 $240.00 $0.2485 $745.50 $0.16 $480.00 $0.12 $360.00 $0.15 $450.00

7a
 T-SHIRTS - 50/50 BLEND T-SHIRT (KIDS SIZE S L) - BLUE, RED, 

WHITE & BLACK - PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS
200 or more $3.580 $716.00 $4.97 $994.00 No Bid $4.30 $860.00 $5.80 $1,160.00 $5.49 $1,098.00

7b
T-SHIRTS -- 50/50 BLEND T-SHIRT (ADULT SIZES S TO XL) - BLUE, 
RED, WHITE & BLACK - PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

200 or more $3.580 $716.00 $5.08 $1,016.00 No Bid $3.99 $798.00 $5.50 $1,100.00 $4.99 $998.00

7c
T-SHIRTS -- 50/50 BLEND T-SHIRT (ADULT SIZES (2XL TO 3XL) - 
BLUE, RED, WHITE & BLACK - PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

100 or more $5.980 $598.00 $10.21 $1,021.00 No Bid $8.99 $899.00 $12.84 $1,284.00 $4.99 $499.00

8
HATS -FITTED FLEX-FIT HAT (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

200 or more $10.970 $2,194.00 $9.12 $1,824.00 $3.9219 $784.38 $8.99 $1,798.00 $10.77 $2,154.00 $9.49 $1,898.00

9
TUMBLER - 20OZ VACUUM INSULATED TUMBLER (BLUE & 
WHITE) PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

200 or more $7.330 $1,466.00 $7.22 $1,444.00 $5.3410 $1,068.20 $8.99 $1,798.00 $8.50 $1,700.00 $4.99 $998.00

10
PENCILS -- BASIC SCHOOL PENCIL (BLUE & WHITE) - PER 
TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $0.181 $181.00 $0.16 $164.00 $0.1959 $195.90 N/A $0.35 $350.00 $0.21 $210.00

11
 CAR PHONE CHARGER (BASE ONLY) - ON-THE GO PHONE 

CHARGER FOR CAR (BLUE & WHITE)- PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $1.660 $415.00 $0.60 $150.00 $0.9934 $248.35 $1.71 $427.50 $2.03 $507.50 $1.59 $397.50

12
FRISBEE -- RECREATIONAL FRISBEE FOR OUTDOOR USE (BLUE & 
WHITE) PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $1.190 $1,190.00 $0.56 $560.00 $0.5031 $503.10 $0.86 $860.00 $0.93 $930.00 $0.65 $650.00

13
SUNGLASSES -- BASIC SUNGLASSES (BLUE & WHITE) - PER 
TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $1.290 $1,290.00 $0.809 $809.00 $1.0837 $1,083.70 $2.17 $2,170.00 $1.77 $1,770.00 $0.99 $990.00

14
POP CAN COOLER -- NON-WOVEN INSULATED COOLER (BLUE & 
WHITE) PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

100 or more $1.290 $129.00 $2.55 $255.00 No Bid $0.46 $46.00 $1.01 $101.00 $2.99 $299.00

15
MAGNETIC CLIP -- JUMBO MAGNETIC MEMO CLIP (BLUE & 
WHITE) PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $1.000 $1,000.00 $0.55 $550.00 $1.1342 $1,134.20 $0.86 $860.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $0.75 $750.00

16a
2 GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $3.850 $962.50 $2.76 $690.00 $2.2190 $554.75 $4.12 $1,030.00 $4.15 $1,037.50 $3.99 $997.50

16b
4 GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $3.940 $985.00 $2.82 $705.00 $2.2706 $567.65 $4.28 $1,070.00 $4.28 $1,070.00 $4.15 $1,037.50

16c
8 GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $4.650 $1,162.50 $3.17 $792.50 $2.6705 $667.63 $4.81 $1,202.50 $4.54 $1,135.00 $4.99 $1,247.50

16d
 16GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $5.050 $1,262.50 $3.37 $842.50 $2.9930 $748.25 $3.60 $900.00 $4.66 $1,165.00 $5.25 $1,312.50

16e
32 GB USB -- USABLE TECH (BLUE & WHITE) - PER TECHNICAL 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 or more $6.370 $1,592.50 $3.68 $920.00 $3.6510 $912.75 $4.80 $1,200.00 $5.10 $1,275.00 $5.99 $1,497.50

17
BACKPACKS -- RECYCLED DRAWSTRING BACKPACKS (BLUE & 
WHITE) -PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS

1000 or more $1.700 $1,700.00 $1.086 $1,086.00 $0.6321 $632.10 $1.29 $1,290.00 $0.96 $960.00 $1.09 $1,090.00

18
TATTOO'S PER TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS ASSORTED- 125 PER 
LOGO

500 or more $0.570 $285.00 $0.18 $88.00 $0.1700 $85.00 $0.53 $265.00 $0.24 $120.00 $0.25 $125.00

Destroyer Promotional 
Products, LLC

Blink Marketing Inc dba Blink 
Swag

Award Company of America, 
LLC

American Filing Solutions Inc
Think Ability Inc. dba Power 

Print

TOTAL COST  NOT TO EXCEED:                                                                                                     (All 
costs must be included or Your bid will be disqualified) $30,345.00 $21,081.00

Delivery: 7 - 21 Days
Varies by product - All items can be 

delivered within 30 days of art 
approval

Notes: *Item #9 used quantity of 216 visit www.brandinphawk.com 20% Discount

$17,756.31 $26,799.00 $27,514.00

vist www.promoplace.com/power-
print

$23,340.00

Bay Promo LLC

22 to 55 Days 28 Days 1 - 4 Weeks


