
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 1194A Buyer: Donny Tiemann
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor High Density Polyethylene Pipe Fittings dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org
Tulsa, OK 74103 Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Date: April 1, 2021

1. Delivery: 

If your Bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

2. Pricing

Item Description Quantity
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost

Extended 

Cost

MFR Name & 

Part #
Unit Cost

Extended 

Cost

MFR Name 

& Part #
Unit Cost

Extended 

Cost

MFR Name 

& Part #
Unit Cost

Extended 

Cost

MFR Name & 

Part #
Unit Cost

Extended 

Cost

MFR Name & 

Part #
Unit Cost

Extended 

Cost

MFR Name 

& Part #

1
8” IPS Electrofusion Coupling, Black  HDPE, Georg Fisher # 

360000945 or Acceptable Equivalent
20 or more Each $66.00 $1,320.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000944
$81.16 $1,623.20

Georg Fisher # 

360000944
$92.00 $1,840.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000945
$75.50 $1,510.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000944
$90.00 $1,800.00

Electrofusion 

Coupling 8" IPS 

230 PSI

$90.00 $1,800.00
Electrofusion 

Coupling 8" IPS 

230 PSI

2
Central Plastics Electrofusion Mult-Base x 4 IPS Outlet (SCH40) 

Gasketed PE3408 TLC Non Pressure 2 Pin TLC Georg Fischer# 

360000985 or  Acceptable Equivalent

288 or more Each $93.54 $26,939.52
Georg Fisher # 

360000985
$111.96 $32,244.48

Georg Fisher # 

360000985
$98.50 $28,368.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000985
$100.75 $29,016.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000985
$0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

3
8” x 6” Electrofusion Branch Saddle, HDPE, Georg Fisher # 

360000980 Or Acceptable Equivalent
96 or more Each $173.34 $16,640.64

Georg Fisher # 

360000980
$205.08 $19,687.68

Georg Fisher # 

360000788
$182.00 $17,472.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000980
$178.68 $17,153.28

Georg Fisher # 

360000980
$380.00 $36,480.00

8" IPS x 6"IPS 

Electrofucion 

Branch Saddle

$380.00 $36,480.00
8" IPS x 6"IPS 

Electrofucion 

Branch Saddle

4
8” DR 11 IPS Molded 90 Degree Bend HDPE, Georg Fischer # 

360000043 Or Acceptable Equivalent
12 or more Each $75.16 $901.92

Georg Fisher # 

360000044
$90.82 $1,089.84

Georg Fisher # 

360000044
$79.50 $954.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000043
$85.00 $1,020.00

Agru / Integrty 

or Georg Fisher 
$319.00 $3,828.00

8" IPS 

Electrofusion 90 

Deg Elbow

$145.00 $1,740.00
8" Butt Fusion 

90 Deg Elbow 

IPS DR11

5
8” DR 11 IPS Molded Tee HDPE, Georg Fischer # 360000535 Or 

Acceptable Equivalent
12 or more Each $108.43 $1,301.16

Georg Fisher # 

360000551
$131.03 $1,572.36

Georg Fisher # 

360000551
$114.00 $1,368.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000535
$103.00 $1,236.00

Agru / Integrty 

or Georg Fisher 
$450.00 $5,400.00

8" IPS 

Electrofusion 

Tee

$180.00 $2,160.00
8" Butt Fusion 

Tee IPS, DR11

6 7.125” Fabricated 90 Degree Bend Debeaded HDPE -Fabricated 

Per Attached Drawing
12 or more Each $275.00 $3,300.00

Harco Fittings - 

No Part #
$532.91 $6,394.92

Secor - No Part 

#
$295.00 $3,540.00

Fabricated- No 

Part #
$181.68 $2,180.16

Fabricated- No 

Part #
$0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

7 7.125” Fabricated Tee Debeaded HDPE -Fabricated Per Attached 

Drawing
12 or more Each $340.00 $4,080.00

Harco Fittings - 

No Part #
$572.76 $6,873.12

Secor - No Part 

#
$395.00 $4,740.00

Fabricated- No 

Part #
$180.40 $2,164.80

Fabricated- No 

Part #
$0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

8
7.125” Electrofusion Coupling, Black HDPE, Georg Fisher # 

360000944 or Acceptable Equivalent
20 or more Each $70.36 $1,407.20

Georg Fisher # 

360000942
$88.23 $1,764.60

Georg Fisher # 

360000942
$78.50 $1,570.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000944
$80.00 $1,600.00

Georg Fisher # 

360000942
$0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

 You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract or canceling the Purchase Order, pursuing collection under any 

performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED:                                                                                                                                   

(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified)

UTILITY SUPPLY CO.

The City of Tulsa does not guarantee any specific quantity or number of purchases that will be made during the agreement period.  If the Seller(s) prices cannot stay competitive with the outside 

market, the Cityreserves the right to purchase from outside sources or low bidder(s).

4a & 5a from Bid

$55,890.44

CORE & MAIN LP

$59,852.00$71,250.20

RAINMAKER SALES, INC.
GHI INTERNATIONAL SALES, INC.   

(Option b)

$42,180.00

4b & 5b From Bid

Delivery                 Stock to 30 Days       7-28 Days ARO 10-20 Days
Some In Stock, Full Quantities Quoted     10-

12 weeks

Annual Price Adjustment

MPS ENTERPRISES, INC.,  dba 

MILFORD 

$55,880.24

As Corrected

GHI INTERNATIONAL SALES, INC.   

(Option a)

$47,508.00

mailto:dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org

