@ Tulsa

City of Tulsa Purchasing Department
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor

Tulsa, OK 74103

1. Delivery:

TAC 181G

Fire Extinguisher & Fire Suppression Systems Maintenance and

Repair
Asset Management Department
Bid Date: March 4, 2021

of deliver

Buyer: Donny Tiemann
dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org

Ploase contact if you have any questions

damages to which it may be entited inaw or in equty.

canceing

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

Systame, Incorporated | APS Fire ColLLC
em o sy Subsections o e size Description Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost (i Gosty
1  secTioN £ WSPECTIONS.  Fme ExTINGUISHERS 1300 0-30ms  Storsd Pressurs Unis. No Bid $6.00 $7,800.00
2  secTioN £ WSPECTIONS.  Fme ExTINGUISHERS 5 50-125 .  Stored Pressu No Bid $15.00 $75.00
3 |secnontmspecrions e extivcuisuers » - Sors e No Bid $6.00 $120.00
4 |secnontmspecrions e extivcuisuers m - o e No Bid $1.15 $138.00
5 secrion & mspecTIoNs e exTivauisHers. w 0-30ms Camidge unts No Bid $12.00 $480.00
6 secrion & mspecTIoNs e exTivauisHers. B 50-125 . Camidge unts No Bid $28.00 $140.00
7 secrion & mspecTIoNs e exTivauisHers. B 1s0ms. Camidge unts No Bid $75.00 $375.00
8 secrion & mspecTIoNs e exTivauisHers. B s0ms, Camidge unts No Bid $75.00 $375.00
9 [secmontmsrecnons e = - Aottt . No Bid $75.00 $2,850.00
10 [sscront wsrecnons s = - et NoBid $7.00 $357.00
11 |secnons wspecrions Krcnen e oo . - st vpecaon No Bid $75.00 $2,250.00
12 [secrontmseecrions eetuoms v metm s A cusrany pcion $115.00 $575.00 $100.00 $500.00
13 |secnon mspecrions nacn svsteus  orY s - [— $225.00 $1,125.00 $150.00 $750.00
14 :::m‘g;g:i‘g; ORY 5 Na  Cuartery nspection $115.00 $575.00 $100.00 $500.00
15 |secnon mspecrions nacn srstes oy s - [— $225.00 $1,125.00 $150.00 $750.00
16 | SECTION & WSPECTIONS ;5:::‘“ COST FORANY. 108 MORE. A $75.00 $75.00 $85.00 $85.00
17 | SECTION & WSPECTIONS sTanoeipe sysTEmS o na [rp— $115.00 $1,150.00 $85.00 $850.00
18 | SECTION & WSPECTIONS sTanoeipe sysTEmS o na [p— $225.00 $2,250.00 $95.00 $950.00
19 |secriont mspections s RIAL ORY GHEMCAL . N EN— No Bid $60.00 $360.00
20 | SECTION & WSPECTIONS ;‘;‘:g;“"“"‘"‘“‘ . A [p— No Bid $60.00 $360.00
21 |secriont mspecTions e S et e 1 N EN— No Bid $180.00 $180.00
22 [secrontmseecrions e S et e ' na [r— No Bid $180.00 $180.00
23  secTion £ WSPECTIONS ::‘E‘;‘E'f,;;::;f.'jw 108 MORE. A  Annual rspsction $75.00 $75.00 $65.00 $65.00
24 |secron: mspecrions rreue sackriow 10r wore - o o $125.00 $125.00 $130.00 $130.00
25  SECTION & WSPECTIONS e pup mspECTION 108 MORE. na [p— $400.00 $400.00 $750.00 $750.00
26  SECTION & WSPECTIONS oeLuce Fme sysTem. 108 MORE. na [p— $175.00 $175.00 $300.00 $300.00
27  SECTION & WSPECTIONS FRe ALARM PANELS 108 MORE. na [p— $460.00 $460.00 $250.00 $250.00
28 |secrion s anenaxce seRrvice [pressurzen ory chemcaL “ 2um. Asco Rectorge. No Bid $12.00 $480.00
29 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE. | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL @ s, | ABCIPK Rectarge. No $15.00 $900.00
30 | SECTION &: MANTENANCEISERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL B3 om. | ABCIPK Rectarge. No Bid $24.00 $720.00
31 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL 3 ETS | ABCIPK Rectarge. No Bid $25.00 $75.00
32 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL l 0m. [ ABCIK Rectarge. No Bid $30.00 $30.00
33 1 [ ABCIK Rectarge. No Bid $100.00 $100.00
34 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL 2 | ABCIPK 6 y Msiterance No Bid $6.00 $12.00
35 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL 3 s, | ABCIPK 6 y Msinterance. No Bid $6.00 $18.00
36 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE. | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL 3 0m. | ABCIPK 6 y Msinterance. No Bid $6.00 $18.00
37 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL 2 20, | ABCIPK 6 y Msiternce No Bid $6.00 $12.00

38 |secrion s mamenaxce service pressurzen ory chemcaL 1 0om 8ok 6 e Msiermnce No Bid $8.00 $8.00
39 |secrion s mamenaxce service [pressurzen ory chemcaL 1 125450 s, 8ok 6 e Miermnce No Bid $14.00 $14.00
40 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE. | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL 3 2%m. ABCIK Hyaroest No Bid $8.00 $160.00
" | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE. | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL B3 s, ABCIK Hyaroest No Bid $12.00 $360.00
42 [secriow s wanTenance service: [pressurzen ory chemcaL » 0., Acio Hyotest No Bid $12.00 $240.00
43 | SECTION I: MAINTENANCE [SERVICE. | PRESSURZED DRY CHENMICAL 3 125-150 Ibs. ABCIPK Hydrotest $12.00 $120.00
44 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL ] 5lb. ABCK Hydrotest No Bid $12.00 $12.00
45 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL ] 50 Ib. ABCK Hydrotest No Bid $12.00 $12.00
4% | SECTION &: MANTENANCE /SERVICE. | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL ] 125-150 Ibs. BC Recharge. No Bid $6.00 $6.00
a7 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL 1 501b BC Recharge. No Bid $30.00 $30.00
48 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE. | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL l 8¢ Recharge. No Bid $60.00 $60.00
49 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL ] 5lb. [BC 6 yr Mairtenance. No Bid $6.00 $6.00
50  |secrion s mamenaxce service [pressurzen ory chemcaL 1 CrT— No Bid $6.00 $6.00
51 |secrion s anenance service [pressurzen ory chemcaL 1 CErT— No Bid $14.00 $14.00
52 | SECTION &: MAINTENANCE /SERVICE | PRESSURZED DRY CHEMICAL Il C pysroest No Bid $10.00 $10.00
53 | SECTION B: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER 37 agc (i 1-3) No Bid $30.00 $1,110.00
54 | SECTION B: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER 28 s, agc (i 1-3) No Bid $40.00 $1,120.00
55 | SECTION B: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER 37 0m. agc (i 1-3) No Bid $70.00 $2,590.00
56 | SECTION B: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER 2 2., agc (i 1-3) No Bid $100.00 $200.00
57 | SECTION B: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER 1 s, 85 0y 13) No Bi $36.00 $36.00
58 [secrionm newrme exTncuisHer 1 e Bsiay1) No Bid $985.00 $985.00
59 | SECTION : NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER 1 125 - 150 Ibs. BS (1) No Bid $1,480.00 $1,480.00
() | SECTION B: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER 1 s coz fay1-3) No Bid $125.00 $125.00
61 | SECTION I: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER 1 1018 coz iy 1-3) No Bid $190.00 $190.00
62 1 158 ooz 1.3 No Bid $190.00 $190.00
63 | SECTION B: NEW FIRE EXTINGUISHER 1 I cozian1-3) No Bid $265.00 $265.00
64 | secTion v: SUPRESSION  Kepair Rate for Pre-Engincered 20  Labor repsic ate per hour No Bid $75.00 $1,500.00
65 | SECTION Iv: SUPRESSION :"‘;’“"‘ o Skler o Weter 20 Labor repair rate per hour $115.00 $2,300.00 $85.00 $1,700.00
66 | secTion v: SUPRESSION [ Repair Rate for Specls s 20  Labor repair rate per hour No Bid $95.00 $1,900.00

(0 s st o ncladet o your b il be iscualfie) $10,410.00 $38,734.00
Delivery: 15 Calendar Days Immediate
Annual Price Adjustment: Fixed 6% CPI-U
T e e
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