
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department TAC 1219 Buyer: Donny Tiemann

175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor Water Castings, Manholes, Sealing Materials & Anodes dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org

Tulsa, OK 74103 Water & Sewer Department Please contact if you have any questions

Bid Date: October 1, 2020

1. Delivery: 

If your Bid is accepted and a contract is executed, state the number of days you need to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services:

2. Pricing

Section 1: Water Castings, Manholes, Sealing Materials & Anodes

Meter Can Lids

(See Specification “WMetercan”)

1 Meter Can lid for 3/4" and 1” Service $13.01 $8,300.38 SIGMA MB 1611TT-35 $26.50 SIGMA MB 1611TT-35 $40.61
EJ 32197099A01       

EJ32196998

2 Meter Can w/rim for 3/4" Service $65.01 $169,026.00 SIGMA MB61BT $56.95 SIGMA MB61BT $54.46 EJ 32234000A01

3 Meter Can w/rim for 1" Service $85.01 $13,176.55 SIGMA MB63BT $89.00 SIGMA MB64BT $195.75 EJ 32259000A02

4 Meter Can: Lid for 1-1/2” Service $112.97 $28,242.50 SIGMA MB147TT-35 $305.00 SIGMA MB65LID $173.40 EJ 32243000A02

5
Meter Can Lid for 2" Service (Remote Read) 36”x36” (No 

28”x36”)
$112.97 $39,426.53 SIGMA MB147TT-35 $315.00 SIGM MB65LID $25.96 EJ 32197040

6 Meter Can w/rim for 2" Service $315.01 $4,725.15 SIGMA MB65ET $395.00 SIGMA MB6SET $90.37 EJ 00842842

7 Meter Can Center Ring for 2" Service $410.01 $6,150.15 SIGMA MB65GT $250.00 SIGMA MB65CRING $354.58 EJ 00842800

Manholes

(See Specification “WManhole6000”)

1 Manhole Frame and Lid 24” x 24” (Neenah R6660-KH) NO BID $1,250.00 EJ  8247A1 $634.90 EJ 00824709

2 Manhole Frame and Lid 30” x 48” (Neenah R6663-NH) NO BID $2,850.00 EJ  8233A1 $1,742.82 EJ 00823327A01

3 Rim, HD Reversable 4” for Valve Vaults NO BID $950.00 EJ  8233ZRING $99.19 EJ 00213215

4 Lid, HD for Valve Vault Reversable Rim NO BID $950.00 EJ  8233ZLID $89.75 EJ 00213243

Valve  Boxes

(See Specification “WValveBox”)

Valve Box Riser 2-1/4”

(Tyler for Series 6850)

Valve Box Extension 18”

(Tyler #59)

Valve Box Drop Lid

(Tyler #685055)

Valve Box Top Section

(Tyler Series 6850/562-S)

Valve Box Bottom Section

(Tyler Ser. 6850/562-S)

Sealing Materials

(See Specification “Wpacking”)

* $ 269,047.26

NO BID

$12,824.00

$256,930.72

 

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

 

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

 

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

 

$2,701.50

$1,725.15

$2,872.05

You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating your contract or 

canceling the Purchase Order, pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other damages to which it may be 

entitled in law or in equity.

Bidder must include a manufacturers part number and price for each item listed in Exhibit A. Quantities listed are provided based on historical 

data and not necessarily what will be purchased in the future.

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

 

Core & Main LPUTILITY SUPPLY COMPANY

$3,421.80

638

2,600

Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

$16,907.00

$148,070.00

Item # Unit Cost

15 $3,750.00

Section 2: Manholes

15

349

Extended Cost, Section 1 Total

155

250

3 $11.95

4 $38.00

1 $14.50

2 $48.00

Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

350 $6.01 $2,103.50 SIGMA VB2602

150 $18.01

Item #

SIGMA VB2621

5 $48.00

Extended Cost, Section 3 Total

180 $19.01 SIGMA VB2622 $8,640.00

Section 4: Sealing Materials

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

2

Extended Cost

Section 8: Valve Boxes

Extended Cost, Section 2 Total

2

2

2

Item # Unit CostEstimate Annual Quantity

Unit Cost

SIGMA VB2659

265 $6.51 SIGMA VB2600W

205 $14.01

Item # Unit CostEstimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

$31,871.75

DP SUPPLY COMPANY

$25,909.18

$141,596.00

$30,341.25

$43,350.00

$9,060.04

$1,355.55

$5,318.70

Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

$13,795.00

$76,250.00

$109,935.00

$5,925.00

$12,000.00

$374,632.00

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

EJ 85507016

$51.90 $9,342.00 EJ 85506024

Mfr. Name and Part #

$2,500.00

$5,700.00

$1,900.00

$1,900.00

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

$1,269.80

$3,485.64

$198.38

$179.50

$5,133.32

$41,302.85

Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

$5,075.00 STAR VBR2.5

$7,200.00 STAR VBEX18SCL35

$3,166.75 STAR VBLIDW

$7,790.00 STAR VBT16S

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

STAR VBB24S

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

$29.33 $10,265.50 EJ 85008020

$55.60 $8,340.00 EJ 85606024

$16.94 $4,489.10 EJ 06800001

$43.25 $8,866.25

Mfr. Name and Part #Extended Cost

mailto:dtiemann@cityoftulsa.org


1
Cross Braided Packing 1/4" (Square interlocking) Teadit 

2138
NO BID $35.00 TREADIT 2138 $0.00 NO BID

2
Cross Braided Packing 5/16" (Square interlocking) Teadit 

2138
NO BID $35.00 TREADIT 2138 $0.00 NO BID

3
Cross Braided Packing 3/8" (Square interlocking) Teadit 

2138
NO BID $35.00 TREADIT 2138 $0.00 NO BID

4
Cross Braided Packing 7/16" (Square interlocking) Teadit 

2138
NO BID $35.00 TREADIT 2138 $0.00 NO BID

5
Cross Braided Packing 1/2" (Square interlocking) Teadit 

2138
NO BID $35.00 TREADIT 2138 $0.00 NO BID

6 Fluorocarbon Joint Sealant 3/8"X25' (Gore-Tex PTFE) NO BID $95.00 GRAINGER 38PTFE25 $0.00 NO BID

7 Teflon Tape 1/2"W X 320” L $0.50 $375.00 CHRISSY'S 513526 $1.40 BMI 031393 $0.00 NO BID

8 Meter Gasket 3/4"ID X 1-3/16” OD X 1/8” Thick Neoprene $0.08 $28.00 EGW 19481 $0.30 FORD GT-114 $0.00 NO BID

9 Meter Gasket 1"ID X 1-1/2” OD X 1/8” Thick Neoprene $0.13 $4.55 EGW 19484 $0.40 FORD GT-120 $0.00 NO BID

10 TR Flex Seal kit, 6”. $34.85 $1,742.50 US PIPE $35.00
UP PIPE & FOUNDRY 

TRFSK6
$0.00 NO BID

11 TR Flex Seal kit, 8”. $46.36 $4,636.00 US PIPE $45.00
US PIPE & FOUNDRY 

TRFSK8
$0.00 NO BID

12 TR Flex Seal kit, 10”. $57.98 $5,798.00 US PIPE $55.00
US PIPE & FOUNDRY 

TRFSK10
$0.00 NO BID

13 TR Flex Seal kit, 12”. $89.70 $4,485.00 US PIPE $90.00
US PIPE & FOUNDRY 

TRFSK12
$0.00 NO BID

14 TR Flex Seal kit, 16”. $138.18 $6,909.00 US PIPE $140.00
US PIPE & FOUNDRY 

TRFSK16
$0.00 NO BID

15 TR Flex Seal kit, 18”. $161.82 $8,091.00 US PIPE $160.00
US PIPE & FOUNDRY 

TRFSK18
$0.00 NO BID

16 TR Flex Seal kit, 24”. $332.93 $16,646.50 US PIPE $340.00
US PIPE & FOUNDRY 

TRFSK24
$0.00 NO BID

Anodes

(See Specification “Wanodes”)

1 Anode, Magnesium (#32D5) W/10’ #12 T.W. Leads NO QUOTE $140.00 MESA PRODUCTS 32D5 $0.00 NO BID

2
Anode, Magnesium (#H-1) W/15’ #6 AWG HMWPE 

Leads
NO QUOTE $150.00 MESA PRODUCTS H-1 $0.00 NO BID

$48,715.55

NO QUOTE NO BID

 

Unit Cost Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

 

8

 

1

Section 5: Anodes

Item # Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

4

4

750

8

5

Extended Cost, Section 5 Total

Extended Cost Mfr. Name and Part #

$280.00

$150.00

$430.00

2

2

Unit Cost

Extended Cost, Section 4 Total

50

100

100

50

350

35

50

50

50

Estimate Annual Quantity Unit Cost

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$14.00

$1,750.00

$4,500.00

$5,500.00

$4,500.00

$7,000.00

$8,000.00

$17,000.00

$280.00

$280.00

$175.00

$70.00

$140.00

$380.00

$1,050.00

$105.00

$0.00

Unit Cost Extended Cost

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$50,744.00 NO BID

Mfr. Name and Part #

$0.00

$0.00

TOTAL COST: SECTIONS 1 - 5                                                                                                      
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified)

* $ 330,586.81 $469,677.75 $303,366.89

Notes 12 ITEMS - NO BID   18 ITEMS - NO BID

Delivery STOCK - 30 DAYS STOCK - 15 Days 5 DAYS - 5 WEEKS

 

 

Notes * Total reflects corrected price based on bid pricing  * Total reflects corrected price based on bid pricing  


