) Tulsa

A New Kind of Energy.
City of Tulsa Purchasing Department
175 E. 2nd Street 15th Floor

Tulsa, OK 74103

Senior Buyer: Ashleigh McCarn
amccarn@cityoftulsa.org

Please contact if you have any questions

TAC 239G

Granular Activated Carbon & Removal/Disposal
Water & Sewer Department

Bid Date: January 24, 2019

1. Delivery:
If your Bid is accepted and an agreement is executed, state the number of days you will neeed to deliver the Goods and/or to begin providing Services

You must be able to deliver the Goods and/or Services as specified in your Bid. Failure to do so may result in City terminating

your contract or canceling the Purchase Order, pursuing collection under any performance bond, as well as seeking any other
damages to which it may be entitled in law or in equity.

2. Pricing

(ESTIMATED QUANTITIES FOR EVALUATION PURPOSES ONLY)

Cost of virgin Granular Activated Carbon (GAC) which includes the removal and disposal of spent carbon and slection, delivery, and placement of new GAC in filters.

Cabot Corporation dba Cabot Norit Anericas Univar USA Inc. (No Bid)

Section 1:

. . Volume per . 3 . Product . 3 Cost Per
Item Description Location filter (fﬁ) Product Name/# Unit Cost ($/ft”) Cost Per Filter Name/# Unit Cost ($/ft”) Filter
1 Virgin GAC Bituminous 8 x 20 A.B. Jewell 5,280 Norit GAC 820 $50.17 *$264,897.60
2 Virgin GAC Bituminous 8 x 20 Mohawk 5,320 Norit GAC 820 $50.17 *$266,904.40

SECTION 1 SUB-TOTAL:

*$531,802.00

No Bid

Section 2:

Cabot Corporation dba Cabot Norit Anericas

Univar USA Inc. (No Bid)

- . Volume per . 3 . Product . 3 Cost Per
Item Description Location filter (ft%) Product Name - # Unit Cost ($/ft”) Cost Per Filter Name - # Unit Cost ($/ft”) Filter
1 Virgin GAC Lignite 8 x 20 A.B. Jewell 5,280 Hydrodarco 820 $38.41 *$202,804.80
2 Virgin GAC Lignite 8 x 20 Mohawk 5,320 Hydrodarco 820 $38.41 *$204,311.20
3 Virgin GAC Lignite 8 x 20 Spavinaw 50 Hydrodarco 820 $138.00 *$6,900.00

SECTION 2 SUB-TOTAL: No Bid

*$414,046.00

Cabot Corporation dba Cabot Norit Anericas Univar USA Inc. (No Bid)

Section 3:

Item Description Location Quantity Product Name - # Unit Cost ($/ft%) Cost Per Filter ’S’;'&‘).‘.deu_c; Unit Cost ($/ft%) szltt:rer

1 Super-sack Delivery A.B. Jewell 1 or more Norit GAC 820 1,000 $1,730.00 $1,730.00

2 Super-sack Delivery Mohawk 1 or more Hydrodarco 820 1,102 $1,840.34 $1,840.34

3 Super-sack Delivery Spavinaw 1 or more Hydrodarco 820 1,102 $1,840.34 $1,840.34

SECTION 3 SUB-TOTAL: $5,410.68
TOTAL COST NOT TO EXCEED: * f
(All costs must be included or your Bid will be disqualified) $951125868 No Bid
Annual Price Adjustment: Fixed 5%

Delivery: 7 Days ARO with Forecasting

Notes: * Cost corrected based on unit price
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