
Ordinance
YerCon 3.2 oleesed on VJ/"21

Use for all Odinances including: TRO, Budget, Zoning,
Declalations, Irust lndenturcs, etc.

C:ITYCqIELTISEOLY
ffiefueived:

Drpertnrnt
FirE

Stfircl (Drrcrlpdon)
Title 14 Building Gode Ordinance

TractiB * CITY CLR( T.TiEOiLI
Conrnltee: He:

Oormittee He: Fharirg Be:
i!t Agenda &b: zrd Agenda He:

All dqartnorrt rtE ns rqulrlng Councll apprcval musl be anbmltM htough the l{ayors Ofllco.
PrlmaryDetalls
t).pa. rtcklng llo. Borrd Apprwal Olh.r Bo.rd ltlm. Clty Cootrll Approvll

g Yer O f.to

trScsrpa
trrosuo

Emrll
Ateete@cityoft ulsa. orh

Ordlnrnce Ilpr
Amending Tulsa Re{sed Ordinances

a\d

ffi|lrmo
Andy Teeter

lam

Phom
9't8-s9S17S0

Sectqr Errmhip Rengc Lot

Hock Addrr3r BA / CTNumbor

Am.rrdng Ord. lro. IROIT Xo.

14
IRO Subtto Proprrtyf[on+roprty

Councll DlsHct

e.g. 13

Zonlng llo.

o.g.G

PUD Ho. Plrnnlng [X.tlct

Budget
Fuxlng Sourc{r)

TOTAL:
Ent rthefumllngrru,r,F)udtrythcepgqiotelUnistunctllnlgfoont:Otg(AlloatlonCodc){DlhdArrount(1001211:531101$10.N)orP,DtsdStnrg{rDunt
0 4t A Abfinile$1 I 31 02.6N1 -|10131 22-U1 t 02$3A,000.01 )

Approvals
Oepertnont:

Legal:
Board:
tayon
Odrcn

"4
Date:
Dab:
Dab:
Dab:
Date:

PollcyStatermnt
Beckgrord lnbrmedon

Ppvlde ba,fiound lnlomadon on the oqued,ed adon.

Srnma0on otOr &$rrrId Acton
Amending Title 14, TRO adopting the 2018 editlon of the lntematlonal Fire Code.
Surrr7Ea'ra the pattinenl details of the 'EquerIed edion.

Emorgoncy Glaure?
O Yes
ONo

Re!3on br Emorgercy Cleurr
Public Sabty related
Exploln vhy you aa nqueding t ra, the City C.auncil a,Elot[ this adion with an enDtgonc! deug.



Processing lnformtion for CityClerk's Office
Poot Execudon Proceesing
O Mail wndor copy (addtl signature copies attached)
O Must be filed with other go\€mmental entity
O Addtl go\pmrnental entity approral(s) required

Addilim.l Routing and Procearing lletallr



TULSA FIRE DEPARTMENT
RFA SUPPLEMENTAL FORM

To: Mayor G.T. Bynum

General Explanation:

4113122 Contains amendments to Title 14, TRO adopting the 2018 edition of the
lntemational Fire Code. This is being submitted in concert with the adoption of the 2018
lntemational Building Code and partner documents by Development Services.

Impact If Not Approved:

Significant Impact

Medium Impact

No Impact

Explain:

Adopts 2018 lntemational Fire Code.
lncorporates Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission Changes.
Makes other safety related changes to Title 14.

Cost:

N/A

New or Recurring ltem:

New

Timeline:

Requesting emergency clause due to public safety impact.

Expected Challenges:

None

Tulsa Fire Department
1750 Newblock Park Drive, Tulsa, Ok74L27

918.595.9444
Protecting Life, Heolth, Property and the Environment by Delivering Quolity Life ond Sofety Services

{



Published in the T'ulsu ltrlrld

. 20tl

ORDINANCE NO

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING AND UPDATING TITLE I4 TULSA REVISED
ORDINANCES (TRO). "FIRE PREVENTION CODE": AMENDING CHAPTER
I. ''I.C.C. INTERNA'|IONAL FIRE CODE. 20I8 EDITION. ADOPTED":
PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY: REPEALING ALL ORDINANCES IN
CONFLICT HEREWITH: AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY.

BE IT ORDAINED BY ]-I-IE CITY OF TULSA:

Section l. Thut Title 11, Tulsa Revi.secl Ordinance.s, "Fire Prevention Cocle" he umendecl

h1t the uddition of'u nev; section. Sec'tion 105.6.19. to reud us .fbllows:

..TITLE I4. FIRE PREVENTION CODE

CHAPTER 1. - ICC INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE.20I8 EDITION" ADOPTED

Section 100. - Adoption of the ICC International Fire Code. 201 8 Edition.

A certain document. three (3)copies of which are on tlle in the otlice of the City Clerk of the
City of Tulsa. Oklahoma. being marked and designated as the /('(' lnternutionul Fire ('ode.2018
Edition. as published by the International Code Council. Inc.. hereinafter the "Fire Code" or the
"Fire Prevention Code" is hereby'adopted fbr the purpose of satbguarding litb and property tiom
fire and explosion hazards by'regulating the storage. handling and use of hazardous substances.
materials and devices and conditions related to the occupancy of buildings and premises in the
City of Tulsa. as herein provided. Each and all of the regulations. prol'isions. penalties. terms and
conditions of the [C(' Internutionul Fire ('ode.2018 Edition. are hereby'ref'erred to" adopted and
made a part hereof as if fully, set out in this chapter w'ith the amendments thereto. prescribed in
Section l0l of this chapter.

Section 101. - Amendments to the ICC lnternational Fire Code.20l8

The fbllorving sections of the l('(' Internutiorutl Fire ('ode.?018 Edition are hereby'added.
deleted or amended to read as fbllow's:

l0l.l Title-Amendatory. These regulations shall be known and may' be cited as the "Fire
Prer,'ention Code of the City'of Tulsa." hereinafter retbrred to as the "Fire Code" the "Fire
Prevention Code" or "this code."

102.13 Buildings Owned by the City of Tulsa-Added. Buildings and structures owned by'

the City of T'ulsa which are located inside oroutside the corporate limits of the City" shall
comply with the requirements of this code.

d l-l- I

0-1/ I l,'2012

1

N'll)Si1an



103.1 Enforcement Agency-Amendatorl'. The term "department of tire prelention." as

used within the 1C'(' Internutionul Fire ('r.r& shall mean the Ottlce of the Fire Marshal of
the Fire Departmentof the City'of Tulsa. The "fire code otficial" as used in this code shall
be the Fire Marshal. It shall be the dut-v- and responsibilit.v of the Fire Marshal to implement.
administer and enforce the prol'isions of this code.

103.2 Appointment-Amendatory. The Office of the Fire Marshal shall be appointed in the
manner specitied in Article XI of the Charter of the City of Tulsa.

103.2.1 Peace Officer-Added. 'fhe t'ire code otflcial and the ofllcial's designated assistants
may' be deemed peace otflcers with tull power to execute legal process. administer oaths.
subpoena w'itnesses. and make arrests within the City of Tulsa. to the same extent that police
ofllcers of the City of Tulsa are authorized to do so under the ordinances olthe Citr- and the
laws of the state of Oklahoma.

l0-t.12 Fires and Explosions, Entering Premises-Added. The flre code offlcial shall have

the authoritl'. when necessan'. in the perfbrmance of duties imposed b1'this code. to enter
any building. or any connected premises" rvhere any' fire or explosion has recentll' occurred.
to examine it. The f-rre code otllcial may also enter other buildings and premises ad.loining or
in close proximity. to investigate any such flre or explosion. pro,r'ided that all entries shall be

conducted consistent with the constitution and laws of the state of Oklahoma and the United
States.

l0{.13 Suspicious Fires or Explosions-Added. The fire code official. in the course of an,,"

investigation ola flre or explosion. ma)'cause to be taken the sw'orn testimon) of any person

cognizant of any relel'ant tacts and have it reduced to writing. If the fire code offlcial shall
determine that there is probable cause to charge an) person with the crime olarson.
attempted arson" orof causing orattempting t<l cause an1 unlaw'tul f-rre. or should the fire
code oficial hale probable cause to beliele that any person has committed a criminal
offbnse in connection with any' tire. then it shall be the flre code otflcial's dut;- to cause such
person to be arrested and charged with any such of'fenses. The tire code ofllcial shall turnish
to the prosecuting authority all evidence. t'acts. and circumstances. together with the identity
of all material witnesses and any sworn testimony'. which was discovered during the
investigation.

105.1.6 Annual Permit-Amendatory. An annual permit is a yearh' pemrit which represents
a group of individual permits ftrr each alteration to an alreadl' approved electrical. gas.

mechanical or plumbing installation. The building ofl'icial is authorized to issue an annual
permit upon application theretbr to an) person. flrm or corporation regularly emplo."'ing one
or more qualitied tradespersons in the building. structure or on the premises owned or
operated by the applicant tbr the permit.

105.1.6.t Annual permit records-Amendatory". The person to whom an annual permit is
issued shall keep a detailed record of alterations made under such annual permit. The
building oflicial shall have access to such detailed records of alterations at all times. At the
completion of the entity's annual permit term" the applicant shall file such detailed records ol
alterations with the building otflcial. Pursuant to the authority of 59 O.S. rs 1000.25" the

2
cl-l-l

ll-+, I I l(,ll
\lt)S,'1un



building oltlcial shall collect t'ees tbr each individual permit w'hich is part of the annual
permit once the detailed records are submitted and remit such fees to the OL.IBCC.

105.2.5 Payment of Permit Fees-Added. Upon acceptance of application fbr a permit. an

application tbe shall be paid. Lipon approval- the applicant shalI be notihed the permit is
read,v and advised of what remaining f'ees are due. In order tbr the permit to be valid. all tbes

shall have been paid in full and the permit posted at the.iob site prior to beginning
construction. Pay'ments fbr permits are due upon notiflcation to the applicant that the permit
is approved and is ready tbr issuance. Any permit not paid tbr within thirty (-30) days afier
notification may be deemed void by the code ofllcial and the application t'ee shall then be

tbrfbited.

105.2.6 Alarm lndustry Act Adopted and Incorporated by Reference-Added. The
Alarm Industn Act. Title 59 O.S. s\ 1800.1 et sec1. as amended is herebl adopted b-v"

refbrence and incorporated into this code as if set out at-length here. sal'e and except an)'
portions r,vhich may' be added. deleted" or amended in this title.

105.2.6.1 Fire Extinguisher IndustrT Act Adopted and Incorporated by Reference-
Added. The Fire Extinguisher Industry Act. Title 59 O.S. Supp.2007.:\ 1820.1 et seq. as

amended is hereby adopted b,"- ret'erence and incorporated into this code as if set out at-
length here. save and except an,v- portions r.vhich may be added. deleted" or amended in this
title.

105.2.6.2 Fire Sprinkler Permit-Added. The code otllcial shall not issue a permit tbr the
installation. alteration. or repair of tlre sprinkler systems. and related equipment, including
standpipes. and hose connections to fire sprinkler sy'stems. air line s-vstems used in
connection with fire sprinkler s)'stems" and connectcd tanks and pumps. until the person.
tirm. corporation. or limited liability compan!' installing the same shall have on tile w'ith the
City'of 'I'ulsa 

a suret) bond in the amount of $2-500.00. Such bond shall be on a tbrm
satisf'actorl to the City . guaranteeing pa)'ment of all obligations and -{uaranteeing the work
to be installed in accordance with the provisions of this code. No person. firm. corporation.
or limited liability company shall install automatic tire sprinkler systems unless licensed as

provided in T"itle 59 O.S. $ 1800.1 et sct1.. as amended. and related rules. and regulations.

105.2.6.3 Licensing-Added. All tire alarm and frre sprinkler sy'stems governed b,v" this code
shall be installed. inspected and repaired by' licensed flrms and technicians in compliance
w'ith occupational licensing law's and regulations promulgated b1'the Oklahoma Department
of Labor. and published in the Oklahoma Administrative Code (OAC). s\ 380:75. All flre
extinguisher s)stems governed by this code shall be installed. inspected and repaired by
licensed tlrms and technicians in compliance with occupational licensing laws and

regulations pronrulgated by'the Oklahoma State Fire Marshal Commission. and published in
the Oklahoma Administrative Code (OAC). $ 265:50.

105.2.6.{ Fire Protection Sy'stem Design Requirements-Added. All flre suppression and
tlre alarm s\stem designs submitted to the t-rre code ofl-icial fbr approval. shall be designed
and/or reviewed by indil'iduals who har,'e achiev'ed National Institute tbr Certification in
Engineering Technologies (NICE'[). Level III or lV certiflcation orare a prolbssional
engineer. The sy'stem designer or reviewer shall include their name. NICIET [.evel.

3
4l-l-I

0-1,'l I 'lr)ll
n-ll)54am



certification number. or prot'essional engineer seal and signature on all drawings submitted
to the fire code otllcial fbr review.

105.6 Required Operational Permits-Amendatory. The fire code official is authorized to
issue operational permits tbrthe operations set fbrth in Sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.56 of
this code. For each operational permit issued pursuant to Sections 105.6.1 through 105.6.56
of this code. the permit f-ee(s) shall be as provided in Title.l9. Tulsa Revised Ordinances.
Chapter 14.

105.6.16.1 Flammable and Combustible Liquids Storage Tank Removal or Closure-
Added. An operational permit shall be required for the removal or closure of any flammable
or combustible liquid. abol'e or below -{round storage tank.

105.6.32 Open Burning-Amendatory. lt shall be unlawtul and a misdemeanor of'fense fbr
anv person to kindle or maintain an open tire or a t-rre on ani public street. alle,,'. road. or
other public or private ground r,r,ithin the corporate limits of the City of Tulsa. without flrst
having procured an operational permit tiom the fire code otficial. Instructions and

stipulations prescribed in the permit shall be strictly adhered to.

Exception: Recreational tires and portable outdoor tireplaces in use on pril'ately-
ow'ned propert)" w'hich do not require an operational permit. Recreational fires and
portable outdoor fireplaces on an!' public street. alley'" road" park. or right-of'-way or
an! other public land are considered to be open burning and a v'iolation of this
subsection and shall require an operational permit.

105.6.37.1 Places of Assembly-Amendatory. An operational permit shall be required to
operate a building. which is otherwise permitted as a place of assembly'. in a manner which
it was not designed. This includes but is not limited to: operating as a temporary special
assembly. a temporary special amusement including seasonal decorations exceeding the
allow'ances in the International Fire Code. andior temporarily exceeding the number of
occupants fbr w'hich the building was designed.

105.6.{9-Decoratil'e Hy'drant Permit. An operational permit is required to alter the color.
decorate. or otherw'ise moditl'the appearance or view of a tire hydrant. Decoratil'e hydrant
permits are limited to specifically apprclved h-vdrants w'ithin areas appror,'ed by' the Tulsa
City Council. Within a zone. a group or block of hydrants maybe approved under one permit
if they w'ill all be of the same decorative specifications.

105.6.51 EnerEr Storage Systems-Added. An operational permit is required fbr stationan
and mobile energ) storage svstems regulated b1 Section 1206.

105.6.52 Security Gates-Added. An operational permit shall be required fbrall security'
gates installed across a tire apparatus access road and regulated by Section 503.6 of this
code.

105.6.53 Key Boxes Where Immediate Access Necessary-Added. An operational permit
shall be required fbr each key' box required and regulated b,"* Section 506 and Section 607 of
this code.

4
4 t-t_I

0.1/ I l/2012
N1[)Sr.jam



105.6.5{ Fire Protection System Installation Licenses-Added. For each tlrm or individual
fire protection sy'stem license applied tirr pursuant to Section 105.2.6.3 of this code. the
applicant shall pay'all required f'ees provided in Title.l9. Tulsa Revised Ordinances. Chapter
14.

105.6.55 State or Federal License Inspection-Added. Any' inspection pertbrmed by the
t.ire code otlcial pursuant to state or tbderal licensing requirements shall be subject to the
payment of all applicable t'ees provided in Title 49. Tulsa Revised Ordinances. Chapter 14.

105.6.56 Training for Employees in Private Enterprises-Added. All trre saf-et,,- and f-rre

protection training provided b1' the Tulsa Fire Department to employ'ees working fbr a
private business entit.v shall be subject to a t-ee assessed as provided in Title 49" 

-fulsa

Rev'ised Ordinances. Chapter 14.

105.7 Required Construction Permits-Amendatory. The tlre code otficial is authorized to
issue construction permits tbr w'ork as set tbrth in Sections 105.7.1 through 105.7.25 of this
code. For each construction permit issued pursuant to Sections 105.7.1 through 105.7.15 ol
this code. the permit fbe(s) shall be as prorided in Title 49. Tulsa Revised Ordinances.
Chapter l-1.

105.7.1 Automatic Fire-extinguishing Systems-Amendatory. A construction permit is
required fbr installation olor modification to an automatic fire-extinguishing system.
Maintenance pertbrmed in accordance with this code is not considered a moditication and

does not require a permit.

Exception: Maintenance requiring the replacement olor,'er l0 heads will require a

constructic-rn permit.

105.7.2 Energv Storage Systems-Amendatory. A construction permit is required to install
energ) storage s!stem regulated by' Section 1206.

105.7.3 Capacitor Energy Storage S.v-stems-Deleted. This section has been stricken fiom
the code per OUBCC rules section 748:10-4-6 (7).

105.7.7 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems and Related Equipment-AmendatoIy. A
construction permit shall be required tbr the installation of or modif.ication to fire alarm and

detection svstems and related equipment. Maintenance pertbrmed in accordance w'ith this
code shall not be considered a moditlcation and shall not require a permit.

Exception: Maintenance requiring the replacement olover f0 tlre alarm devices. or the
replacement of the flre alarm panel shall require a construction permit.

108.6 Overcrowding Llnlawful and an Offense-Amendatory.

l. It shall be unlau'ful and a misdemeanor ot-fense tbr any o\\'ner. occupant. or the ow'ner or
occupant's managing agent or employ'ec to allow the overcrowding or admittance of an;-

person beyond the approved occupant capacity of a building or a portion thereof. The tlre
code ofllcial. upon trnding an) overcrowding conditions or obstructions in aisles.
passageways or other means olegress. or upon tinding any'condition. which constitutes

5
d ll-t

04/ I I /2012
\ ll )\' ;au



a lifb sat'ety hazard. shall be authorized to cause the event or occupanc!' to cease and
desist until such condition or obstruction is corrected.

2. Any person. firm. corporation. or limited liability company convicted of a violation of
this code shall be guilty of a misdcmeanor otl'ense and shall be punished b""" a fine of not
more than One Thousand Two Hundred Dollars ($1.200.00). excluding costs. f'ees. and
assessments. or by' imprisonment fbr a period not exceeding six (6) months. or b1' both
such flne and imprisonment. Each person present in the building or a portion thereof in
excess of the posted or genuine calculated maximum occupant load shall be deemed a
separate ot'tense.

109.1 Appeals to the Board of Appeals-Amendatory. In order to hear and decide appeals
of orders. decisions or determinations made by the fire code ofl-rcial relative to the
application and interpretation of this code. there shall be a Board of Appeals as created and

regulated in the Building Code of the City of Tulsa. Title 51. Chapter I " Tulsa Revised
Ordinances. The fire code otficial shall be an e-r o/./icio member of the Board but shall have
no vote on an)' matter befbre it.

109.3 Qualifications-Deleted. Section 108.3 of the [L'(' lnternutiorutl Fire Code is
intentionally' deleted fiom this code.

109.;l Appeals to the Board of Appeals-Added. The Board of Appeals as established by

Title 51. Chapter l. Tulsa Revised Ordinances. shall hear all appeals tiom decisions of the
fire cc'rde oflcial and shall interpret the provisions of this code whenel'er a dispute arises as

to the meaning or intent of any'pro'uision. Appeals to the Board shall be gol'emed b;" Title
51. Chapter l. T'ulsa Revised Ordinances. provided that tbr an,v- appeal tlled re,uarding the
application or interpretation of this code. wherever the term "code oltlcial" is used. it shall
mean the "flre code offlcial" as used in this code.

I 10.2.1 Transfer of Ownership-Added. It shall be unlawtirl tbr the owner of any' dwelling
unit or structure who has received a compliance c'rrder or Llpon w'hom a notice of violation
has been served to sell. transf-er. mortgage. lease or otherwise dispose of such dwelling
unit or structure to another until the provisions of the compliance order or notice ol
violation have been complied with. or until such ow'ner or the o$'ner's authorized agent
shall flrst turnish the grantee. transt'eree. mortgagee or lessee a true cop,r- of any

compliance order or notice of l'iolation issued b.v.- the Code oftlcial and shall furnish to the
Code otficial a signed and notarized statement tiom the grantee. transf-eree. mortgagee or
lessee. acknowledging the receipt of such compliance order or notice of violation and tully
accepting the responsibility without condition tbr making the corrections or repairs
required by' such compliance order or notice of violation.

I10.3.2.1 Failure to Comply with Notice of Violation - Added. lt shall be unlawful and a

misdemeanor ofl-ense tbr any o\,ener. operator. occupant. or other person responsible fbr the
condition or violation to tail to compll nith anv notice of violation. Anv person. trrm.
corporation.orlimitedliabilitl compan]-convictedofaviolationofthisSection ll0.3.l.lof
this code shall be guilt;- of a misdemeanor of'tense and shall be punished by a fine of not
more than One Thousand Two Hundred Dollars (S1200.00). excluding costs. t-ees and

assessments. or by imprisonment tbr a period not exceeding six (6) months. or by' both such

6
?l-l-l

()+ | t,lr)ll
\il )S,.iam



flne and imprisonment. Each day'. or portion thereof. during which the t-ailure to compl,v-

with the notice of violation is allowed to continuc shall be deemed a separate oftbnse.

110.3.2.2 Nuisance Fire Alarm-Added. It shall be a misdemeanor ot'fense for any owner.
operator. occupant. or other person responsible tbr a fire alarm system to cause or allow a
Nuisance Alarm to be acti'u'ated on propert)' owned. managed. or occupied by him/her. more
than th'e (5) times in any'thirt;- (30) day period. or more than thirty-six (,36) times in any
twelve ( l2) month period. An1' person. owner. operator. or occupant c:onl'icted of a violation
of this Section 110.3.2.2 of this Code shall be guilty'of a misdemeanorot'fense and shall be

punished b1,a fine of not more than One Thousand'fwo Hundred Dollars ($1.200.00).
excluding costs. f'ees. and assessments. or b,"- imprisonment fbr a period not exceeding six
(6) months. or by both such fine and imprisonment. "Nuisance Alarm" is defined in Chapter
I of the currentl)' adopted version of the Intemational Fire Code.

I10.{ Violation of Fire Code Penaltv-Amendatory. It shall be unlawful and a
misdemeanor olfense tbr any person. firm. corporation. or limited liabilit,v- company to
violate any of the prol'isions of this code. lail to compl,,- u'ith any'of the requirements
thereol. orto erect. install. repair. alterordo an.v., work in r,iolation of approved construction
documents or the directir,e of the t-rre code offlcial. or of a permit or certificate issued under
provisions of this code. Any person. firm. corporation. or limited liability compan!'
convicted of a violation of this code shall be guilty of a misdemeanor ot'tense and shall be

punished by a fine of not more than One Thousand Two Hundred Dollars ($1.200.00).
excluding costs. fbes. and assessments. or by imprisonment fbr a period not exceeding six
(6) months. or b.v.. both such tine and imprisonment. Each day. or portion thereot. during
w'hich a l iolation is committed" continued. or permitted shall be deemed a separate ot-fense.

I12.{ Failure to Comply-Amendatory. [t shall be unla'*'tul and a misdemeanor oftense fbr
any person. firm. corporation. or limited liability' compan)'to continue any work afier havin-rr

been served with a stop work order. except such work as that person is directed to pertbrm
to remove a r,'iolation or unsat'e condition. An,v- person. flrm. corporation" or limite'd liabilit;*
compan)' convicted of a violation of this section shall be guilty of a misdemeanor olfense
and shall be punished by a fine of not more than One -lhousand 

Tr,vo Hundred Dollars
($ 1.200.00). excluding costs. tbes. and assessments. or b.v- imprisonment tbr a period not
exceeding six (6) months. or b.v- both such tine and imprisonment. Each day. or portion
thereot. during w'hich a violation is committed. continued. or permitted shall be deemed a
separate olfbnse.

202 General Definitions

IBGl Accessor_T Storage Spaces-Added. A room or space used tbr storage purposes
that is accessory to another occupancy shall be classitied as part ofthat occupanc).

AuthoriQ Having .Iurisdiction-Added. Means an organization. ofhce. or indir,'idual
responsible tbr entbrcing the requirements of the State Adopted Building Codes" including
the prior authorization or approval of an1 equipment. materials. installations" or procedures
used in all or in part of the construction of a new or alteration or renor,'ation of an existing
building or structure. including intesral tlnishes. flrtures and building slstem therein.

7
4 t-+- |

o-li I I/lt)ll
l\ll)Si.iam



Battery System, Stationary Storage-Amendatory. A rechargeable energ)' storage system
consisting ol'electro-chemical storage batteries. battery chargers. controls and associated
electrical equipment designed to provide electrical power to a building. 1'he s,n-stem is

t1'pically' used to provide standby' or emergenc) pow'er. an uninterruptable power suppll.
load shedding. load sharing or similar capabilities.

BATTERY TYPES.
(A) Flow battery. A ty'pe of storage battery that includes chemical components dissolved

in two ditferent liquids. Ion exchange. which provides the flow of electrical current"
occurs through the membrane w'hile both liquids circulate in their respecti!e spaces.
(B) Lead-acid battery'. A storage battery that is comprised of lead electrodes

immersed in sulphuric acid electrol-vte.
(C) Lithium metal polymer battery'. A storage battery that is similar to the lithium-ion

battery except that it has a lithium metal anode in the place of the traditional carbon
or graphite anode.

(D)Lithium-ion battery. A storage battery with lithium ions serv'ing as the charge
carriers of the battery. The electroly'te is a poll'mer mixture of carbonates with an

inorganic salt and can be in a liquid or a gelled poll'mer tbrm. l-ithiated metal oxide is
r-v"picalll' a cathode and tbrms of carbon or graphite ty'pically tbrm the anode.

(E) Nickel-cadmium (Ni-Cd) battery. An alkaline storage battery in which the positire
acti!'e material is nickel oxide. the negative contains cadmium. and the electrolyte is
potassium hydroxide.

(F) Nickle metal hydride (Ni-MH) batterl. An alkaline storage battery in which the
positive acti'u'e material is nickel oxide. the negatil'e electrodes is an intermetallic
compound and the electrolyte is usually potassium hydroxide.

(G)Stationary- storage battery. A group of electrochemical cells interconnected to
supply' a nominal voltage of DC po!\'er to a suitably connectcd electrical load.
designed fbr service in a permanent location.

Capacitor Enerry Storage System-Amendatory. A stationary. rechargeable energy
storage system consisting of capacitors. chargers" controls and associated electrical
equipment designed to prol'ide electrical power to a building or facility'. The system is

typically' used to provide standby or emergenc)' power. an uninterruptable power supply.
load shedding. load sharing or similar capabilities.

(A) The deflnition ola "Preengineered stationary storage battery s1r'stem" has been

stricken fiom the code.
(B) The definition of a "Prepackaged stationary storage battery system" has been stricken
tiom the code.

Capacitor Arra.v--Amendatory Has been stricken tiom the code

Dispensing Area-Amendatory. 'fhe appropriate hazardous (classilled) locations for the f uel
beingdispensedinaccordarrcewiththeNational l:lectrical Codc,tr'-NFI'}At 70

Energy' Storage Management S_v"stem-Amendatory. An electronic s) stem that protects

energ) storage s)'stems fiom opc'rating outside their sat'e operating parameters and

a

#t+-t
0.+/l lil0ll

Nll)Sr.jrurr



disconnects electrical power to the energ,v- storage system or places it in a saf-e condition if
potentially hazardous temperatures or other conditions are detected.

Energv Storage Sy'stem (ESS)-Added. One or more de'uices. assembled together. capable

of storing energ)' in order to suppl.v- electrical energ)' at a future time.

Energr' Storage System Cabinet-Added. A cabinet containing components of the energ)'
storage s)'stem that is included in the LIL 9540 listing tbr the s)'stem. Personnel are not able
to enter the enclosure. other than reaching in to access components tbr maintenance
purposes.

Energr'Storage System Commissioning-Added. A s1'stematic process that provides
documented cont'irmation that an energv storage s!'stem functions according to the intended

design criteria trnd complies r,r'ith applicable code requirements.

Energ_v Storage System, Electrochemical-Added. An energ)' storage sy'stem that stores

energ)' and produces electricitl' using chemical reactions. It includes. among others. battery'

energ]- storage s)'stems and capacitor energ)' storage svstems.

Energy Storage System, Mobile-Added. An energ)'storage s)-stem capable of being
moved and utilized tbr temporar)' encrg,v storage applications. and not installed as fired or
stationary'electrical equipment. The slstem can include integral wheels fortransportation or
be loaded on a trailer arrd unloaded tor charging. storage. and deployment.

Energr'storage Systemo Stationary--Added. An energy system installed as fixed or
stationary electrical equipment in a permanent location.

Energy' Storage System, Walk-in tlnit-Added. A pretabricated building that contains
energ)' storage systems. It includes doors that prol'ide walk-in access fbr personnel to
maintain. test and service the equipment. and is t1'pically used in outdoor and mobile energy'

storage system appl ications.

Main Railroad Track-Added. That part of the railway. exclusive of sw'itch tracks.

branches. y'ards. and terminals upon which trains are operated b,v timetable or train order or
both.

IBGl Residential Group R-3.-Amendatory. Residential Group R-3 occupancies w'here the

occupants are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1. R-2. R-4 or I.
including:

Boarding houses (nontransient) with l6 or t'ewer occupants

Boarding houses (transient) u'ith l0 or f'ew'er occupants

Buildings that do not contain more than two dwelling units

Care tacilities that provide accommodations fbr t'i"'e or f'ewer persons receiving care

9
4t-l-l

04/ I I 12022
NII)S,'tam



Congregate living tacilities (nontransient) w'ith l6 or t-ewer occupants

Congregate living facilities (transient) with l0 or f'ewer occupants

Lodging houses with four or t-ewer guest rooms and no more than 2 persons per room.

tal [BG] Care facilities w'ithin a dwelling. Care facilities fbr tlve or fbwer persons
receil'ing care that are within a single-tamily' dr,lelling are permitted to comply'
with the Intemational Residential Code nt provided an automatic sprinkler system
is installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.i or Section P2904 of the
Intemational Residential Codeitt,.

(B) [BGl Lodging houses. Owner-occupied lodging houses w'ith fbur or tbrver
guest rooms and no more than 2 persons per room. shall be permitted to be

constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code,El.

lBGl Miscellaneous Group fl-Amendatora. Buildings and structures of an accessory
character and miscellaneous structures not classit-red in any specific occupancy shall be

constructed, equipped and maintained to contbrm to the requirements of this code
commensurate with the fire and lif'e hazard incidental to their occupancy. Group U shall
include. but not be limited to. the tbllowing:

( A) Agricultural buildings

(B) Aircrafi hangar. accessory to a one- or tw'o-fbmily residence (see Section 412.4 of the
International Building CodetD)

(C) Barns

(D) Carports

(E) Communication equipment structures w'ith a gross floor area of less than 1.500 square
f'eet ( 139 square meters)

(F) Fences more than 6 f'eet ( 1829 mm) high

(G) Grain silos. accessory to a residential occupancy

(H) Livestock shelters

(l) Private garages

(J) Retaining w'alls

(K) Sheds

(L) Stables

(M) Tanks

(N) Towers

#t-l-l
()4/lli202l

\ll)S, liun

10



(O) [BC] GREENHOUSES. Greenhouses not classif-ied as another occupancy shall be

classified as Use Group LI.

SELF-SERVICE STORAGE FACILITY-Added. Real propertl designed and used tbr the
purpose oirenting or leasing indir,'idual storage spaces to customers lor the purpose of
storing and removing personal property on a selt--service basis.

301.1 Scope-Amendatory. The provisions of this chapter shall govem the occupancy and
maintenance of all structures and premises fbr precautions against flre and the spread of tire
and general requirements of flre and lif-e sat'et1'.

305.6 Attempted Burning-Added. It shall be unlawtul to attempt to set fire to or attempt to
cause the burning of combustible material in such a manner as to endanger the sat'ety'of
persons or property. Any person. tirm. corporation. or limited liabilit"r compan) convicted of
a violation of this code shall be guilty'of a misdemeanor offensc and shall be punished by'a
fine of not more than One Thousand Two Hundred Dollars (S1"100.00). excluding costs.
f-ees. and assessments. or by imprisonment tbr a period not exceeding six (6)months. or b1'

both such flne and imprisonment.

308.1.-l Outdoor Cooking and Open Flame Devices-Amendatory. It shall be unlarvful
and a misdemeanor otl'ense fbr any' person to operate any charcoal" electric or gas grill. or
any other electric or open tlame device. on combustible balconies. or within l0 f-eet of
comhustible construction.

Exceptions:

l. One- and two-family dwellings.

2. Where buildings. balconies and decks are protected by an automatic sprinkler system.

3. LP-gas cooking devices having LP-gas container w'ith a water capacity not greater
than2t/z pounds [nominal I pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacit."-].

308.1.6.3 Sky Lanterns -Amendatory. A person shall not release or cause to be released a
sky lantern in the State of Oklahoma per Title 68 O.S. S 1624. I .

Table 315.7.6(l ) Ref-er to OUBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-8(5)

SECTION 320 STORM SHELTERS-Added Ret'er to OLIBCC Rules Title 7-18:20-4-8
(6.7.8.9.1 0. I l. I l. andl 3 )

507.{ Water Supply Test-Amendatory". 1-he City' of Tulsa Water and Sewer Department.
Distribution S.v-stems Section shall be notitied prior to the water suppll" test. Water supply
tests shall be witnessed by a representatir,e of the City of Tulsa Water and Sewer
Department: Distribution Sr stems Section or approved documentation of the test shall be

pror,'ided to the flre code ofllcial prior to final approval of the water suppll's1'stem.

507.5.1.2 Fire Hydrant Installation-Added. Fire hldrants shall be installed according to
specitications required b1 C'ity of Tulsa Water and Sewer Department.

4t-l-I
04r'l I '1022

\ll)S,1ant
11



507.5.1.3 Fire Hydrant Color-Added. All tire hydrants on the public \,\ater distribution
system shall be t-ederal yellou in color. All other fire hydrants shall be rc'd in color.
Exception: Ilvdrants on the public water distribution s_y"stem with an approved Decorative
H,,-drant Permit per Title l4 Section 105.6.-19 and Title li Section 102. I .

507.5.1.{-Decorating or Painting of Fire Hydrants Without a Permit. It shall constitute a

l'iolation of this code tbr an,v- person" firm. corporation- or limited liability" compan)'to alter
the color. decorate" or otherwise modity'the appearance or r,'ic-w'of a fire hydrant without an

approv'ed Decorative Hydrant Permit in accordance with 105.6.49 and Title l3 Section
202.1.

508.1.3 Size-Amendatory. -fhe tire command center shall be not less than 0.015 percent of
the total building area olthe tacilit;* serv'ed or 200 square t-eet (19 square meters) in area.
whichever is greater. with a minimum dimension of 0.7 times the square root of the room
area or l0 tbet (3048 mm). whichever is greater.

Exception: When approved by the tire code ofhcial the f-rre command center can be

reduced in size to not less than 96 square f-eet (9 mr) in area w'ith a minimum dimension
of 8 t'eet (2-138 mm).

606.7.1Fire-Fighter Service Keys-Added. Fire-tighter service ke1's shall be kept in a lock
box at an approved location in the elel'ator lobby'. not more than l0 teet tiom an1' elevator
and shall be arailable fbr immediate use b1 tiretighting and rescue personnel. Kels shall be

clearly, marked as elevator ke1's and shall be identitled tirr the specific eler,ator fbr w'hich
they work. Instructions tbr the operation of the elevator(s) shall be type-set on a plastic
encased card and kept with the elevator keys.

Exception: Fire-tighter service ke1's shall be kept in a lock box at an approved location
on the exterior and not more than l0 t'eet fiom the main entrance to a building provided
that prominently marked keys or access codes to the building are also provided.

606.9 Elevator Maintenance-Added. In buildings equipped with passenger elevators. at
least one elevator shall be maintained in operation at all times the building is occupied.

Exception: Buildings equipped w'ith only one (l ) elevator shall be permitted to have the
elevator temporarill' c'rut of serr, ice tbr testing or sen'icing.

[Ml 607.2 Where Required-Modified Refbr to OLIBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-ll(l )

608.1 General-Modified Ret'er to OUBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-l l(2)

901.6.{ Backflow Prevention Assemblies-Added. All backflow'preventers installed in flre
protection s)'stems piping shall be tested in accordance with Section li.6 of NFPA 25. The
fbrward tlow and backflow shall be tested annualll'. A certified backflow prerention
assembll tester must pertbrm the specitic testing procedures required to veritl' the proper
tunction of reduced pressure principle assemblies and double check r,alr,'e assemblies.
Certitlcation is obtained by successfully' passing both a comprehensi,ue written and a hands-
on pertbrmance examination provided by either the American Backtlow Prevention
Association (ABPA)or the American Society ol'Sanitary Engineering (ASSE). The

4 t.l- I

0{/ I I il()ll
\ll)\,-jun

\2



certitication must be kept current b1' completing the requirements clf the certify'ing
organizations.

903.2.1.2 Group A-2-Amendatory. An automatic sprinkler s)'stem shall be provided
throughout stories containing Group A-2 occupancies and throughout all stories tiom the
Group A-? occupancy to and including the levels of exit discharge serv'ing that occupancy
where one of the fbllowing conditions exists:

l. The fire area exceeds 5.000 square f-eet (465.5 m I ).

2. 'fhe 
t-rre area has an occupant load of 100 or more.

3. The tire area is located on a tloor other than the level of exit discharge serving such
occupancies.

.1. A fire area with nightclub occupanc)'regardless of occupant load. where the totaloverall
occupant load densitf is denser than l0 square feet (.93 m r ; per occupant.

5. Existing nightclubs not undergoing a change in tlre area in alteration work shall be

provided with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance w'ith Section 1103.5.4 of the
Internutionul Firc ('otle,20l5 Edition. as adopted by the City of Tulsa.

Table 903.2.11.6 Additional Required Fire Suppression Systems-Amendatory. Ret'er to
OLiBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-14(l)

903.{.2 Alarms-Amendatory. Approred audible and visual del'ices shall be connected to
every automatic sprinkler s)-'stem. Such sprinkler water-llow alamn de'u'ices shall be activated
by water-f1ow equir,'alent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orif-rce size

installed in the svstem. Alarm devices shall be provided on the address side of the exterior of
the building above the fire department connection (FDC)or in an approved location. Where
a tlre alarm system is installed. actuation of the automatic sprinkler svstem shall actuate the
building flre alarm system.

905.3 Required Installations-Amendatory. Standpipe s1'stems shall be installed where
required by Sections 905.3.1 through 905.3.8 and in locations indicated in Sections 905.4
through 905.1 l. Standpipe s)'stems are allowed to be combined with automatic sprinkler
svstems.

Exceptions:

l. Standpipe systems are not required in Group R-3 occupancies.

2. Hose nozzles and hose storage devices may be removed with the approval of the fire
code oftlcial.

907.2.10.8 Responsibility for Installation, Maintenance and Repair of Smoke Alarms-
Added. Single and multi-station smoke alarms shall be installed. maintained. and repaired
b1' the designated responsible part)' as tbllows:

l. Property ow'ners shall provide and install replacement batteries as shall be necessarv
to keep smoke alarms fully tunctional.

4l+-l
0-lr | | l(lll

l\ll.)sij.m
13



907.2.22 Energv storage systems-Amendatory. Ref-er to OUBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-
I .t(.1 )

907.2.23 Capacitor energy storage systems. This section has been stricken tiom the code.
Retbr to OUBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-14(5)

Table 911.1 Explosion Control Requirements-Amendatory. Ref'er to OLIBCC Rules Title
7-18:20-4-l4(6)

912.1 Installation-Amendatory. Fire department connections shall be installed in
accordance with the NFPA standard applicable to the s)'stem design and shall comply' with
Sections 9l 2. I . I through 912.7 .

9l2.l.l Fire Department Connection Inlet Size-Added. The fire department connection
shall be a 5" 1130 mm) Quick-Connect Connection with a 30o angle elbow'fbr risers lar-{er

l4
# ll_l

04/l ti2()12
\ll)\ lrul

2. Property owners shall pror,'ide tenants with instructions regarding testing and
maintenance of smoke alarms.

i. Tenants shall be responsible tbr testing smoke alarms w'ithin their living unit at least
once a month.

4. A tenant shall notifl the owner in w'riting of any deticiencies or repairs necessary to
keep smoke alarms tully functional.

5. Property owners shall replace or repair inoperatil'e smoke alarms within 24 hours of
receipt of a written notiflcation by a tenant.

Exception: Occupancy' use Group R-2 shallconfbrm to the tbllow'ing requirements:

l. Property owners shall prol'ide and install replacement batteries as shall be necessary
to keep smoke alarms fully tunctional.

2. Propert.v owners shall pertbrrn necessary maintenance on all smoke alarm def-ects

fbund during inspections or upon w'ritten notification by the tenant.

3. Property' owners shall replace or repair an inoperative smoke alarm within 24 hours
of receipt of written notit'ication by a tenant.

4. Property owners shall prol'ide tenants u'ith instructions regarding testing and
maintenance of smoke alarms.

5. Tenants shall be responsible fbr testing battery'-pow'ered smoke alarms 'uvithin their
living unit weekly and. if the smoke alarm is other than battery-powered smoke alarm.
monthly.

6. Tenants shall notif,v the ow'ner in writing of an,v- deficiencies or repairs necessar)'to
keep smoke alarms fully functional.

7. Owners shall provide a signed lease or rental agreement addendum specifying the
responsibilities of the owner and the tenant regarding smoke alarm maintenance and
testing. Upon request by the fire code offlcial" an owner shall make this lease or rental
addendum available fbr inspection.



than 3" (78 mm) in size. A single 2t/2" (65 mm) NH Standard Thread inlet is permitted tbr
risers 3" and smaller. Fire department connections on NFPA l3R systems shall be a
minimum of a single 2 r7r" 165 mm) NH Standard Thread inlet.

1003.4 Floor Surface-Modified. Ref-er to OtIBCC Rules Title 748:20-"+-15(l )

1008.2.3 Exit Discharge-Modified. Refbr to OUBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-15(2)

1010.1.9.3 Locks and Latches-Amendatora. Locks and latches shall be permitted to
prevent the operation of doors where any of the fbllowing conditions erist:

l. Places of detention or restraint.

2. In buildings in occupancy Group A having an occupant load of 49 or less. Groups B. F.

M and S. and in places of religious worship. the main door or doors are permitted to be

equipped with key-operated locking devices tiom the egress side. provided:

2.1 The locking device is readily distinguishable as locked.

2.2 A readill'visible durable sign is posted on the egress side" on or adjacent to the door"
stating: THIS DOOR TO REMAIN UNLOCKED WHEN THIS SPACE IS

OCCUPIED. The sign shall be in letters I inch (15 mm) high on a contrasting
background.

2.3 The use of the key-operated locking device shall be rev'ocable by the flre code oflicial
fbr due cause.

3. Where egress doors are used in pairs. approved automatic tlush bolts shall be permitted
to be used. provided that the door leaf having the automatic tlush bolts does not have a
doorknob or surf ace-mounted hard'*'are.

4. Doors trom individual dwelling or sleepin-u units of Group R occupancies having an

occupant load of l0 or less are permitted to be equipped with a night latch. dead bolt or
security chain. provided such del'ices ma)' be opened tiom the inside without the use of
a key or tool.

5. Fire doors after the minimum elevated temperature has disabled the unlatching
mechanism in accordance with listed tlre door test procedures.

6. Doors serving roof-s not intended to be occupied shall be permitted to be locked.
preventing entry to the building fiom the root.

1010.1.9.8.1 Electrical Locking System-Added. Buildings permitted prior to 1999 that are

not in compliance with Section 1010.1.9.7 ol'this code shall be permitted to utilizc'an
electrical locking system with the tbllo',ving conditions. provided. the building is equipped
throughout w'ith an automatic sprinkler s)'stem in accordance with Section 903 of this code.
and an approved automatic smoke or heat detection slstem installed in accordance w'ith
Section 907 of this code:

! l+-l
0;1,'l I,'2()ll

Itll)S,jam
15



l. The electrical locking system shall be interconnected w'ith the automatic sprinkler s,v-stem

and automatic fire detection svstem such that it unlocks upon actuation of the automatic
sprinkler s)'stem or automatic tlre detection sJ-stem.

2. The electrical locking system shall unlock upon loss of power controlling the lock or
locking mechanism. The door locks shall not be connected to an emergency power
system.

3. A constantly and intemally'lit button r,l'ith %" (19.1 mm) minimum surt'ace dimension
shall be provided 48" above the floor and within 12" (305 mm)of the door on the latch
side. together w'ith an immediately adjacent sign reading "PRESS BUTTON IF
EMERGENCY DOOR OPERATION IS NEEDED" of 2" (50 mm) high letters in
contrasting color to the sign surface. Equivalent Braille signage shall be provided on the
sign surf'ace. mounted 48" (1219 mm)minimum fiom the f'loor to the bottom of Braille
text. Activation of the button by' pressing under a tbrce not exceedingt/z pound (1.23 N)
will immediately operate a voice communication s.v.-stem connected to a central control
point that is constantly' attended that is not required to be within the building" with the
ability' fbr the central control point to immediately contact another person to respond to
the emergency.

4. Emergency lighting and exit light fixture shall be provided.

5. Electrical Locking S1'stem locks provided under this section shall be required to be tested
annually by an Electronic Access Control Hardr.l'are compan)- during the annual tlre
alarm inspection to assure they tunction as required in items I and 2 of this scction.

6. An occupant within the building shall be provided with at least one direct access to an

exit without being required to pass through a door equipped w'ith such electrical locking
system.

7. An occupant w'ithin the building shall not be required to pass through more than one door
equipped with such electrical locking system befbre entering an exit.

1010.1.9.12 Stairway Doors-Amendatory. Interior stairway means of egress doors shall be

openable fiom both sides w'ithout the use of a key' or special knowledge or efTort.

Exceptions:

Stairway discharge doors shall be openable tiom the egress side and shall only be locked
tiom the opposite side.

This section shall not apply to doors arranged according to Section 403.5.3 of the
Internut ionul Bui lding ('ode.

In stairw'ays serving not more than fbur stories. doors are permitted to be locked fiom
the side opposite the egress side. provided they are openable fiom the egress side and are

capable of being unlocked simultaneously w'ithout unlatching upon a signal tiom the fire
command center. if present. or a signal fiom emergency personnel fiom a single location
inside the main entrance to the building.

Stairw'a,v-s exit doors shall be openable lrom the egress side and shall only'be locked tiom
the opposite side in Group B. F. M and S occupancies where only interior access to the
tenant space is tiom a single exit stairwav where permitted in Section 1006.3.2

16

2

J

.+

4 t-l-I
().li il ' l0ll

\ll )S4am



5. Stairway's exit doors shall be openable trom the egress side and shall only be locked from
the opposite side in Group R-2 occupancies where only interior access to the dwelling
unit is from a single exit stairway where permitted in Section 1006.3.2

6. Doors on stair enclosures shall be permitted to be equipped with hardware that prevents
re-entry into the interior of the building. provided that:

6.1 There are at least 2levels where it is possible to lea'u'e the stairenclosure. and

6.2 There shall be not more than 4 t'loors interv'ening betw'een tloors w'here it is possible
to leave the stair enclosure. and

6.3 Re-entry is possible on the top or next to the top floor permitting access to another
exit: and

6.4 Doors permitting re-entry are identitied as such on the stair side of the door.

1010.1.9.13 Fail-safe Electronic Locks-Added. Except tbr Group A. E and H occupancies.
approved fail-saf'e electronic locks shall be permitted to be installed on doors serving any'

occupancy in buildings that are equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and an approved automatic smoke or heat detection
system installed in elel'ator lobbies and machine rooms as required tbr elevators w'ith recall
capabilities. pror,,ided that the fail-sat-e electronic locks comply with all the conditions in
paragraphs I through 6 below. to access a required exit other than the tirst required exit.

l. The fail-saf'e electronic lock shall unlock upon actuation of the automatic fire sprinkler
system. or automatic smoke or heat detection system.

2. The tail-saf'e electronic lock shall unlock upon loss of pow'er to the electronic locking
system.

3. The tail-saf-e electronic lock shall unlock upon loss of powerto the building.

4. The fail-sat-e electronic lock shall not be supplied with emergency and/or back-up power.

5. The fail-saf-e electronic lock when unlocked shall not be reset until after the emergency
no longer exists.

6. Fail-saf-e electronic locks provided under this section shall be required to be tested
annually by an Electronic Access Control Hardware company during the annual flre
alarm inspection to assure they tunction as required in items I thru 5 of this section.

Exceptions:

In addition to the above requirements. where fail-satb electronic locks in accordance
with this section are used to secure elevator or stair lobbies that are not provided with
direct access to an exit. the lobbies shall bc provided with a f-wal' communication
s)'stem with a central station that can be located anlwhere inside or outside of the
building. prol ided it is manned 24 hours. 7 dal s a w'eek. The communication systcm
shall be tested monthl)' to ensure operational condition. fhe lobby shall also be

provided with a location sign that indicates its location in the building. Direction to
exits shall be provided with exit lights as required by- this code.

4t"l-l
().1/ I l,/2022

\11)Si.;am

17



2. ln addition to the above requirements, where fail-safb electronic locks in accordance
with this section are used to secure eler,'ator or stair lobbies that are not provided with
direct access to an exit in buildings that are not equipped'*ith a sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.3.1 .l of the Internutirmul Builcling ('otle. the lobbies
shall ha,u'e a manual fire alarm pull station tied into the building tire alarm system. in
addition to a 2-Way' communication system with a central station that can be located
anywhere inside or outside of the building. l'he central station shall also be manned
24 hours. 7 days a week. and shall be tested monthly' to ensure operational condition.
The lobby shallalso be provided with a location sign that indicates its location in the
building. Direction to exits shall be pror,'ided w'ith exit lights as required by this code.
An infbrmational sign is not required tbr the manual tire alarm pull station.

3. [n addition to the above requirements. where tail-saf'e electronic locks in accordance
with this section are installed on stairw'ay doors and its operation requires a primary
release tiom the egress side to release the locking mechanism which is not integral
to the latch. a secondary push-button release shall be required to be installed on the
egress side. as a back-up unlocking operation" in the event of tailure of the primary
release mechanism.

1010.1.10 Panic and fire exit hardware-Amendatory. Ref'er to OUBCC Rules Title
7-t8:20-4-l 5(3.4. and 5 )

l0l l.l General-Amendatory'. Stairual's serving occupied portions of a building. and
exterior stairuay's trar,ersed b1 human traffic. shall comply rvith the requirements of
Sections l0ll.lthrough l0ll.l3.notwithstandingthegeneral scopingpror,'isionsof Section
l00l.l. Alternating tread devices shall comply with Section l0ll.l4. Ships ladders shall
comply with Section l0l I . I 5. Ladders shall comply' with Section l0l I . 16. These
requirements shall not be applicable to stairs or steps in swimming and wading pools: pla,v-

structures: building s)'stems equipment: and similar structures.

Exception: Within rooms or spaces used fbr assembly purposes. stepped aisles shall
comply with Section 1019.

1015.{ Opening Limitations -Modified. Ref-er to OUBCC Rules Title 748:20-,1-15(6)

1015.6 Mechanical equipment, systems and devices-Modified. Refbr to OLIBCC Rules
Title 748:20-4-15(7)

1015.6.1 Roof Edge-Added. Ref'er to OL.IBCC Rules Title 7'18:20-4-15(8)

1015.6.2 Sk"v-lights-Added. Ret-er to OTJBCC Rules Title 7-18:10-4- t51cl1

1015.6.3 Roof Hatch-Added. Reter to OLIBCC Rules Title 7.18:20-.1-l-s( l0)

1015.7 Roof Access-Modified. Refbr to OUBCC Rules Title 7,18:20-.+- I 5( I I )

1016.2.1 Multiple Tenants-Amendator-v*. Where more than one tenant occupies an\' one
floor of a building or structure. each tenant space. dwelling unit and sleeping unit shall be

provided r,'ith access to the required exits uithout passing through adjacent tenant spaces.

duelling units. and sleeping units.

rt l+- I

0.1' I l ,20ll
\lt)S., jarrr

18



Exceptions:

l. The means of egress fiom a smaller tenant space shall not be prohibited fiom passing
through a larger adjoining tenant space where such rooms or spaces occupy less than l0
percent of the area of the larger tenant space through which thel' pass. are the same or
similar occupanc)'group. a discernible path of egress travel to an exit is provided. and the
means of egress into the adjoining space is not subject to locking tiom the egress side. A
required means of egress serving the larger tenant space shall not pass through the smaller
tenant space or spaces.

?. Means of egress to the required second exit through another tenant space shall not be

prohibited in buildings permitted prior to October 27.1972.

3. Existing means of egress through another tenant space. approved on or afier October
27 . 1972 and prior to January I . 2008. shall be permitted to remain. New'ly' created means

of egress through another tenant space shall not be permitted in buildings permitted on or
after October 27 - 1972.

I101.1 Scope-Amendatory. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to existing buildings
constructed prior to the adoption of this code.

Exception: Buildings or portions of a building that comply' with the latest edition of the
Internutionul Exi.sting BuilLling ('ocle.l0l8 Edition. or the edition that was adopted at the
time a remodel occurred.

I103.5.6 Existing College Dormitories-Added. An appror,'ed automatic sprinkler s.y-stem

shall be provided in existing college dormitories that are not incompliance w'ith the /('('
Inl crneil ittnul Builtli ng ('otle.

I103.5.7 Existing College Fraternities and Sororities-Added. An appror,'ed automatic
sprinkler s)-stem shall be provided in existing college tiatemities and sororities that are not
in compliance with the 1('(' Internutionul Builcling ('ode.

1103.5.8 Existing High-rise Buildings-Amended. An,,- ner.r'or existing high-rise sprinkler
agreement shall be extended until such time as these conditions are met: A change of use of
an)'part of a t'loor is made or any remodel of a floor or tloors that require a building permit.
When any of the above conditions are met the ow'ner will be required to install an approved
automatic fire sprinkler system for the entire floor or lloors atfected by' those conditions.

Exceptions:

All apartment and condominium high-rise buildings or structures hal'ing a
Residential Group R-3 occupancy' classification existing prior to January' l.
2006. with no more than ten percent (lO%) of the useable tloor area utilized tbr
other occupancy' classifications. shall be exempt in their entirety'. until such time
as more than ten percent (10%) of the useable tloor area is utilized tbr other
occupanc! classitlcations. For purposes of this Exception. apartment and
condominium high-rise buildings and structures shall include buildings and
structures. or portions thereof w'hich are accessory to such apartment and
condominium high-rise buildings. including parking structures.

:Jl-l-I
0.1' I I lol2

\lt)S larn

19



On efhctive date of this ordinance" any building that falls under Exception I

above. ma1' continue to erist as specitied in Exception I tbr ten vears or until
such time as the tlre alarm sy'stem or panel needs replaced or upgraded.
whichever is shorter. At that time. the entire building r,vill required be retrotitted
u'ith automatic t'ire sprinklers installed to the currentl)' adopted code.

I103.7.6 Group R-2- Modified. Ref-er to OLJBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-16(2)

I104.1 General-Amendatory. Means of egress in existing buildings shall comph with the
minimum egress requirements when specitied in Table ll0i.l as turtherenumerated in
Section I I 04.2 through I I 04.25. or the building code that applied at the time of
construction. it. in thc'opinions of the building oftcial and the flre code offlcial. they do not
constitute a distinct hazard to lif'e. Existing buildings that were not required to compll'with a

huilding code at the time olconstruction shall comply- w'ith the minimum egress

requirements when specitied in -fable ll03.l as furtherenumerated in Sections 1104.2

through I 104.25.

I l0rl.5 Illumination Emergency' Power-Amendatorl'. Where means of egress illumination
is provided. the power supply fbr means of egress illumination shall normally be provided
b,v- the premises'electrical supply'. In the event of power supply' tailure. illumination shall be

automaticalll' provided tiom an emergenc)' s!stem tbr the tbllowing occupancies where
such occupancies require t\,\'o or more means olegress:

l. Group A having 50 or more occupants.

2. Group B buildings three or more stories in height. buildings with 100 or more occupants
above or below the level of exit discharge serv'ing the occupants or buildings with 1.000

or more total occupants.

3. Group E in interior exit access and exit stairs and ramps. corridors. windowless areas
with student occupancy'. shops and laboratories.

4. Group F having more than 100 occupants.

Exception: Buildings used onl.v- during daylight hours which are provided with
windows fbr natural light according to lhe lnterruttionul Building ('ode.

5. Group I.

6. Group M.

Exception: Buildings less than 3.000 square t-eet (279 m r ) in gross sales area on one
( I ) story only, excluding mezzanines.

7. Group R-1.

Exception: Where each sleeping unit has direct access to the outside of the building at
grade.

8. Group R-2

4l-l_t
l)l/ I I .'l(|ll

1\ll)Srlun
20



Exception: Where each dwelling unit or sleeping unit has direct access to the outside of
the building at grade.

9. Group R-4.

Exception: Where each sleeping unit has direct access to the outside of the building at
ground level.

I104.18 Dead Ends-Amendatory. Where more than one exit or exit access dooruay' is

required. the exit access shall be arranged such that dead ends do not exceed the limits
specified in Table I104.18. In group I-2. in smoke compartments containing patient sleeping
rooms and treatment rooms" dead-end corridors shall be in accordance with section
l 105.6.5.

llrccptions:

l. A dead-end passagewal' or corridor shall not be limited in length where the length of
the dead-end passagew'ay' or corridor is less than 1.5 times the least w'idth of the dead-end
passageway' or corridor.

). In existing buildings. existing dead-end corridors shall be permitted to compll' w'ith
lengths established in Section 80-5.6 of the International Existing Building Code. An1
newlv constructed dead-end corridors within an existing building shall be limited to the
lengths allowed by'the International Building Code.

I10.t.25 Egress path markings-Deleted. Ret-er to OLJBCC Rules Title 7-18:20-4-16(3)

IFC 2018 Chapter 12 Energy S.v-stems. Retbr to OLIBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-17( I thru
223l'

2301.7 Liquid Natural Gas (LNG) Motor Fuel-l)ispensing Facilities-Added. Re't'er to
Ot lt]('C' Rulcs'l'itte 748:10-4-lll( l )

2302 Definitions-Modified. Ret-:r to OL IBC'(' Rr,rles 
'l'itlc 7-ltl:10--+-18(l)

2303.1 Location of Dispensing Devices-Modified. Ret-er to OLIBCC Rules Title 748:10-.1-
t8(3)

2303.2.2 Local Emergency Disconnect Sw'itches-Added. Retbr to OLIBCC Rules Title
748:10-4-28(-l)

2303.2.3 Emergency Disconnect Switch Lighting-Added. Reter to OLIBCC Rules Title
748:20-4-28(5 )

230{.3.7 Quantity Limits-Modified. Retbr to OLIBCC' Rules Title 748:10-4-28(6)

2307.3 Attendants-Modified. Refbr to OLIBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-28(7)

rH-l
o.li I I ,l()lf

N'll)Sijam

21.



2307.{.1 Low Emission Transfer-Added. Refer to OLiBC'C' Rules'fitle 7-18:10--+-28(8)

2307.7 Public Fueling of Motor Vehicles-Modified. Ref'er to OLIBCC Rules Title 7-18:20-
-l-28(e)

2308.3.2 Warning Signs-Added. Ret'er to Ot tBCC Rules 'f itle 7.{8:10--l-18( l0)

2308.{ Private Fueling of Motor Vehicles-Modified. Ret'er to OLIBCC Rules Title 748:20-
4-28( I I )

2308.7 Emergencv Shutdown Control-Modified. Ret'er to OLIBCC Rules Title 74tl:10-4-
t8(l])

2308.7.1 Remote Emergency Shutdown Device-Added. Ref-er to OUBC'C Rules Title
7.18:20-"1-28( li )

2308.7.2 Local Emergency Shutdown Device-Added. Refbr to OLIBCC Rules Title
748:20-4-28( l-l)

2ll l.{.3 Ventilation-Modified. Rct-er to (X IBCC Rules f itle 7-18:10-"1-2tt(l-i)

23t 1.8.1 Preparation of Vehicle for Repair-Modified. Ret-er to O[-iBCC Rules'['itle
7-18:10-.1-28( l6)

231l.8.l.l Liquefied Natural Gas (LNG)-Added. Ref'er to OLIBCC Rules -l-itle 748:10-4-
28( r 7)

3903.2 Prohibited Occupancies-Modified. Ref'er to OLJBCC Rules l'itle 7-18:20--+-.+-t(l )

3903.3 Location-Modified. Ref'er to OtIBC'C Rules l-itle 7-18:20-4-"1-ttll

3903.d Post-process Purification and Winterization-Modified. Ret-er to OLIBCC Rules
l-itle 748:20-4-44(i )

3903.-1.2 Refrigerators, Freezers, and Other Cooling Equipment-Added. Ref'er to
OLiBCC Rules'l'itle 7-18:20--l--l.t(-t)

3903.-1.3 Post-Processing-Added. Ref'er to OtIBCC Rules'fitle 7-l{l:10--l--141-;;

3903.5 Use of Flammable and Combustible Liquids-Modified. Refbr to OLJBCC' Rules
'l'itle 

7'18 :20-4--l-1( 6 )

3903.6 Liquified Petroleum Gas-Modified. Refer to Ot IBCC Rules fitlc 7-18:20--+--+-+(7)

3903.6.1 Release of Gas-Added. Refbr to OtIBCC Rules I'itle 748:10--1-44(8)

dt+-l
().1/ I I,'l{)ll

l\ l[ )Sr yanr

22



3903.6.2 Exhaust-Added. Ref-er to OtiBCC Rules Title 7-i8:10--l-4"t(9)

3903.6.3 Electrical-Added. Ret'er to OLIBCC' Rules T'itle 7-18:20--+-.+4( l0)

3903.6.4 Automatic Fire-Extinguishing System-Added. Ref'er to OtIBCC Rules 
-fitle

7-18:20-4-44( I I )

3903.7 Carbon Dioxide Extraction-Added. Ret'er to Ol.lBCC' Rules I'itle 7-lt3:10--+--+4( I I )

3903.7.1 Storage and Handling-Added. Ref-er to OLIBCC Rr-rles Title 7-18:20--t-.+-t(li)

3903.7.2 Gas Detection Svstem-Added. Refer to OL.IBCC Rules I'itle 7-18:10-4--+-+(l-+)

3903.7.3 Carbon Dioxide Discharge-Added. Ret'er to OI.JBCC Rules 'I"itle 748:20-4-
44(r5)'

3905.3 Emergency Power System-Added. Ret'er to OLIBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-44( l6)

5301.1 Scope-Modified. Retbr to OUBCC Rules Title 748:20--t-58(l-6)

5302. 1 Definitions-Modified. Retbr to OU BCC Rules'l'itle 748 :20-4-58( 7 )

5306.2.2 One-hour Interior Room-Modified. Retl'r to OL IBCC' Rules T'itle 7-ltt:10--+--58(8)

5501.1 Scope-Modified. Re'lcr to OLIBT'C Rirles Titlc 7.18:20--+-60

5601.1.3 Fireworks-Amendatory'. It shall be unlawtul and a misdemeanor oltense fbr any'

person to possess. manufacture. store. sell. handle or use an1' tirer,l'orks within the corporate
limits of the Citl of 'I'ulsa. r,rithout first having procured an operational permit tiom the flre
code otficial. as required b-v" Section 5601.2 of this code. The operational permit t-ee shall be

as pro'u'ided in Title 49. 'I'ulsa Revised Ordinances. Chapter 14.

5601.2.;l Financial Responsibili(v-Amendatory. Befbre an operational permit is issued- as

required by Section 5601.2 of this code. the applicant shall file with the City Clerk of the
City of Tulsaacorporate surety bond in the principal sum of $3.000.000 orcertificate of
insurance evidencing a public liability insurance policy fbr the same amount. fbr the purpose

of the pa]-ment of all damages to persons or propert!'which arise trom. or are caused by'. the
conduct of an1'act authorized by the permit upon rvhich any judicialjudgment results. The
tire code otllcial is authorized to speciti' a greater or lesser amount when. in the fire code
otflcial's opinion. conditions at the location oluse indicate a greater or lesser amount is

required. Govemment entities shall be exempt ticlm this bond requirement.

5705.5 Alcohol-based hand rubs classified as Class I or II liquids-Modified. Ref'er to
Ot-IBCC Rules Title 7.18:20-4-62

6106.1 Attendants-Modified. Ref'er to OUBCC Rules 'title 748:20-4-66( I )

6106.2 Overfilling-Modified. Ref-er to OLIBCC Rules T'itle 7-18:20-.+-66(l)

23
1l+-l

0-1,'l l ,l0l:
\11)S .iun



6201.1 Scope-Amendatory-. The storage and use of organic peroxides shallbe in
accordance with this chapter" Chapter ,i0 and N'utiorutl Fire Protec'tion.lssocitttion (NFPA)
Standard Retbrence Number 432 listed in Chapter 80 of this code. Unclassitled detonable
organic peroxides that are capable of detonation in their normal shipping containers under
conditions of fire exposure shall be stored in accordance with Chapter 56 of this code.

Chapter 80 Referenced Standards-Modified. Retbr to OUBCC Rules Title 748:20-4-85( l-
ll)

Appendix A-Deleted. Appendix A of the Internutionul F-ire (i)c/e entitled "Board ol
Appeals" is intentionallv deleted fiom this code.

Appendices B through l-Added. The fbllow'ing appendices of the Internutionul Fira ('ode
are specifically'ref-erred to. adopted and made a part of this code" as if tully set out in this
chapter. with the amendments theretcl:

APPENDIX B FIRE-FLOW REQLIIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS

APPENDIX C I.IRE IIYDRAN'| LOI'ATIONS AND DISTRIBLITION

APPENDIX D ITIRE APPARAI LIS ACC.IISS ROADS

APPENDIX E HAZARD CATEGORIES

APPENDIX F HAZARD RANKING

APPENDIX CJ CRYOC]ENIC FL,L-IIDS-WEIGHT AND VOI,LIMII IIQLIIVAI-ENTS

HAZARD MATERIALS MANAGEMENT PLAN (T{MMP) AND
APPENDIX H HAZARDOI.JS MATERIALS INVENTORY STATEMENT (HMIS)

INSTRUCTIONS

APPENDIX I FIRE PROTECTION SYS'fEMS-NONCOMPLIANT CONDITIONS

Appendix D-Amendatory. Appendix D of the Internutionul Fire ('orle entitled Firc
..lppurutus,lc'c'e.r.s Rouds. Section D I 02 Requirecl ,4.cce.ss' is amended in this code as

fbllou's:

Dl02.l Access and Loading-Amendator-v-. Facilities. buildings. or poftions of buildings
hereafter constructed shall be accessible to fire department apparatus by way of an approved
fire apparatus access road with an asphalt- concrete. or other approved driving surtbce
capable of supporting the imposed load oltire apparatus weighing at least 88.000 pounds
(3e 916 kg) "

#ll-l
t)ii I I i20ll

N{t)Sr'iam

24



Section 2. SEI'ER.IBILITy'('L.1USE. ll unt' .sec'lion. sentence. c'luu.se or phruse d'this
orclinunc'a or unv purt lhereo.f' is ./ir unv reu.\()n .fitund to he invulid bv u court of L'ompelenl

.jurisdit'tion. such dec'i.sion .shull rutt ul.fect the vulidity' of'the rentuinder of'this ordirumc'e or unv
purt thereo.f.

Sec'tion 3. REPEAL OF ('OliFLl('TIivG ORDIllAli('ES. T'hut ull ordirutnL'es or purts
of.ordinunc'e.s in conflic't herev'ith hc und lhesume urc now expre.s.slt'repeuled.

Sec'tion 1. EIIERGE,\t'('I' ('L.1L'SE. Thut the umenclment.s hereh.y' enuc'lecl ure
essentiul to lhe proper. orderlv urulethic'ul c'ontluc'l d the husine:;.s o.l'the ('it1,olTulsu by,its ('itt'
O.f/ic'ials: lhere-lbre, un emergenc'v is herehy clecluretl lLt exist.fbr lhe prcservulion of'the puhlic'
peuL'e, heulth ancl .sulet. hv' reuxtn whererl this orclinunce shull luke e.llbct immediutell, upon ils
pussuge, upproval. uncl puhl ic'ation.

ADOPTED by the Council
[ )atc

Chair of the Council

ADOPTED as an emergency measure:
I )itlc

Chair of the Council

OFFICE OF THE MAYOR

Received by' the Ma1'or at
I)ate I rntc

G.T. Bynum. Ma,"-or

B"'-

Secretary

APPROVED by' the Mayor of the Citl of Tulsa. Oklahoma:
I )i(c

hmc

Mayor

at

( Seal )

ATTES'f

#ll-t
().+i I l/2012

N{ I )S/1 arn

Citl Clerk

25

APPROVED:

City Attorney'

uv

L

,Y$'


