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Donation
Version 2.4 released on 7/24D.3

Updated RFA for donations including travel donations (use employee
reimbursement process for travel approvals)
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CITY COUNCIL USE ONLY
Data Received:

Committee Date:'

lstAgenda Date:'

Primary Details
Board Approval

Tracking #: CITY CLERK USE ONLY
Committee: Oscanned Date: ,29.2c)

Hearing Date:
2nd Agenda Date: O Posted ltem

All depaftment ltems requirlng Council approval must be submltted through the Mayor's Ofiice.

Other Board Name

Emall

dquarles-

City Council Approval

OYes O No

Phone

91 8-596-9501
Departmont

Water and Sewer

Bid/Project Number

Enter a Bid or Project Number (not a
Title or Desciption)

Travel Event Tltle
A\ffWAAce Conference

Contact Name

Desiree Quarles-Dobey

Projoct Titlo Donator w-
P.Wwr+

a
Typo of Donation

Travel

Travele/s Name

Eric Lee
Event Date

1013123

Donatlon AmounUValue

$600.00
City Council requires a dollar value

Budget
Fundlng Source(s)

TOTAL:
Enterthe funding source(s) using the appropriate Munisfunding format: Org (Allocation Code)-Object-Amount (1001211-531401-$10.00) or Project String-Amount
(1 il41 04.AbstrTi$es4l 31 02.6001 40431 22-541 1 02-$30,000.01 )

Approvals
Department:

Legal:
Board:
Mayor:
Other:

Date:
Date:
Date:
Date:
Date:

8'Zl'V/-+

W
Policy Statement
Background lnformation
Donation from American Water Works Association to attend the AWWA Mid-Year Board Meeting in Denvel Colorado. A\ AIVA pays for all
travel cost.

.!t I

Provide background information on the requested action.

Summation of tho Requested Action
Accept donation from AWWAfor Eric Lee to attend Mid-Year Board Meeting in Denver, Colorado.

Summaize the peiinent details of the requested action

Other Perlinent Details

Provide any additional information that should be considered when considering approval of this contract document

Processing lnformation for Gity Clerk's Office
Post Execution Processlng Addltional Routlng and Processlng Detalls

O Mail vendor copy (addt'l signature copies attached)
O Must be filed with other governmental entity
O Addfl governmental entity approval(s) required

apps.cityoftulsa.org/RFA/Forms/#/form/prinUa4255099-786d 410e-a414+868978a2tr8 1t1



Quarles-Pobey, Dsqllee

From:
Sent:
To:

Hillman, Alynna
Wednesday, August 21,2024 9:10 AM

Quarles-Dobey, Desiree

RE: Booking No.6028819761 is complete. Here's your ticketSubject:

Yes, just waiting on the emaited confirmation form the hotet. lf I don't get it by noon, l'm going to cat[
back.

From: Qua rles-Dobey, Desiree <dqua rles-dobey@cityoft ulsa.org>
Sent: Wednesday, August 21,2024 9:09 AM
To: H il lma n, Alynna <ahil lman @cityoft ulsa.org>
Subject: RE: Booking No. 6028819761.is complete. Here's your ticket

No, that is att he has received. Did you book his hotet?

From: Hi ll ma n, Alynna <ahil lman @citvoft ulsa.org>
Sent: Wednesday, August 2L,2024 8:52 AM
To: Quarles-Dobey, Desiree <dqua rles-dobev@citvoftulsa.org>
Subject: RE: Booking No. 6028819761 is complete. Here's your ticket

Do you know if he atso got a receipt? lt shows the amount paid but it doesn't have anything with my p-

card number on it.

From: Quarles-Dobey, Desiree <dquarles-dobev@citvoftulsa.ors> On Behalf Of Lee, Eric

Sent: Tuesday, August 20,2024 9:56 AM
To: H il lma n, Alynna <ahi ll ma n @citvoftulsa.org>
Subject: FW: Booking No. 60288L9751 is complete. Here's your ticket

Eric's ftight

From: emailtoolkit@eskv.pl <emailtoolkit@eskv.pl> On Behalf Of eSky.com
Sent: Tuesday, August 20,2024 7:58 AM
To: Lee, Eric <ELEE@citvoftulsa.org>

Subject: Booking No. 6028819751 is complete. Here's your ticket

eSky booking number

6028819761

View cletails
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This message was generated automatically, please do not respond to it

Ready to roll! Here's your booking
Great to have you with usl This email is your e-ticket.

And that's it, now you can count down to your trip!

eSky booking number

6028819761

What happens to your booking?

1 Processing the booking 6028819761

1

Sending the electronic ticket

What does your booking include?

Flight

Flight booking number

Tulsa (TUL) - Denver (DEN)

2.

2

2N7DUO

2

ee detail
See details



00,2 Ocl2024
06:59, 2 Ocl2024

Airline: United Airlines Flight number: 5667

Flight booking number

Denver (DEN) - Tulsa (TUL)

B:00,3 Oct2024
20:40,3 Oct2024

Airline: United Airlines Flight number:2444

Travel time: t h

59min

2N7DUO

Travel time: t h
40min

Mr Lee

Eric
D.o.B

31.07.1972

More details can be found on the your booking page.

Travelers
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Lot Tulsa

Personal item 43 x 25 x 22 cm

Seat 238 Tulsa - Denver

Seat 22C Denver - Tulsa

Price

Paid 291.39 USD

Total price 291.39 USD

eSky.com

lf you have any questions or concerns, please check out the most frequently asked questions. You

can also check the details on the page of your booking. lf you need to contact us, please use the

contact form.

Helpline: +1 20275 49 021 - open 24h17 .
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ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

The Flight Ticket Reservation System Administrator is esky.pl S.A., Murckowska '14a, 40-265 Katowice, Poland,

Terms and conditions, information on personal data processing and other legal information, available at esky.com
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CAUTION:This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not reply, forward, click links, or open attachments unless you

recognize the sender and know the content is safe. Please report using the Phish Alert button in the Outlook Desktop Client if this
message contains potentially unsafe content.




